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11/05/07 B J Faulkner !/f Participate in conference calls with K. Mead “NN%N
fff and T. Montoya to plan ASARCO response and %,
§
i

strategy following media reports of Government %
Accountability Office report on past ASARCO /ﬁ
civil enforcement (1.8); factual research to 4
prepare for response to El Paso County ™
attorney's request for criminal enfeﬁgemeﬂ€w
- cmarasinisen
%me&hwﬁﬂw&;)’wwr e

11/05/07 L A Fleischmann 1.20 Updating exhibit list to serve on all parties.

11/05/07 R M Fontenla 1.10 Emails with J. Prince, M. Gregory and R. Mulloy
regarding motion and order approving the sale
of the Hardshell mine to Augusta
post-bankruptcy, obtain same and forward (0.5);
emails with T. Jackson regarding post-hearing
brief, file same via Electronic Case Filing
System with the Southern District of Texas
Bankruptcy Court, email with Trumbull regarding
sexvice of same (0.6).

11/05/07 J G Foster .50 Attention to hard drive imaging issues, and
conferred with vendor regarding same.

oy

11/05/07 P M Giblin 1.50 Work with F. Hope on TCEQ advocacy issues;

review communications from team members f
regarding same. P
\*——-——v——-—'*——‘-——vm,,\h . e -ra A
11/05/07 M M Gregory 1.50 Review email from F. Sardjono regarding

timeline (.1); email to T. Davis regarding same
{.1); review email from T. Davis regarding
Butte settlement (.1); office conference with
T. Davis regarding Taylor Springs motion and
getting signatures on env1ronmenta1 settlement
agreements (.1); rev1ew ‘email from D. Prince
regardlng Quapaw trlbe member's call (.1};
organize’ env1ronmenta1 settlement agreements
that need to be 51gned (1 0).

11/05/07 J T Gross . 6.80 Update’ééée files and indices (3.0); organize
'Expert Report Materlals to send to relevant
parties’ (2.5); organlze and index expert
reports for various parties (ASARCO LLC,
ASARCO, Inc., and others) (1.3).

11/05/07 C J Haynes 1.50 Conference with experts and I. Kundawala
regarding property damage claims (.8); revising
memo to board regarding property damage claims

(.7).
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11/05/07 A L MacIver 1.20 Updating the Encycle Settlement Agreement per
the November 2, 2007 telephone conference.

11/05/07 M P McGovern 11.80 Review mediation position papers, expert
reports and internal evaluative memorandum in
preparation for East Helena mediation (8.0)};
work on preparations for Selby mediation (3.8).

11/05/07 S McMillen 1.50 Attention to various issues regarding the
project to value environmental liabilities and
remediation costs at the owned, non-operating

. sites, including updating the data room index

' conference with B. Litle regarding

y the Federated Metals site in Houston,

Texas and attention to notice letter to

potentially responsible parties (.5)}.

Compose memo to GAO; review media clips and
teleconference with Teresa and B. Faulkner.

11/05/07 K M Mead

Developed environmental portion of audit
response (0.30); attention to Encycle and
gggggwggxmgettlement agreements (0.60);
attention to El Paso permitting issues (OﬁggL;)

S,

11/05/07 M G Paulson

11/05/07 D L Prince 5.40 Assist S. Janoe in preparation of materials for
East Helena mediation (.2); call with D.
Robbins regarding trust fund proposals (.1};
coordinate development of exhibit list with
experts {(0.8); coordinate distribution of Selby
and USIBWC supplemental expert reports (1.2};
review expert documents coordinate distribution
to experts {.4); call with T. Davis regarding
materials needed and drafting of stipulation
and order (.2); draft stipulation and order
regarding hearing schedule {2.5).

11/05/07 J L Ross 1.50 conference with G. Tsiolis regarding status of
litigation and how to proceed’ {.9); conference
with D. McAllister regarding Mission (.4);
réspoﬁd to D. McAllister email regarding same

(.2).

11/05/07 J B Seitz 7.40 Prepare substantive revisions to CDA brief per
recent discussions and prepare same for filing
{4.5); telephone conferences with consultants
regarding response cost estimates (0.6); work
on CDA Box materials (1.3); work on responses
to audit inquiry regarding environmental claims
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11/06/07 B J Faulkner

11/06/07 R M Fontenla

11/06/07 J G Foster

11/06/07 P M Giblin

11/06/07 M M Gregory

articipate in strategy call with P. Giblin, M.
Paulson, and T. Davis (0.8); conference call
with K. Mead and D. McAllister to discuss
release of GAO report (0.8); conference with
Hunter Burkhalter of Kemp Sgith LLP, regardi
E]l_Paso air '

¥ needs associated with El Paso county
attorney's request for criminal enforcement
review (0.4); drafted initial outline of
response to El Paso county attorney's request
for criminal enforcement review (1.5).

'th M. Gregory regarding stipulation
conce ~ing SEMO and Butte/Silver Bow Sites and
Upper Blackfoot and Iron Mountain Sites, file
same via Electronic Case Filing System with the
Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy Court,
email with Trumbull regarding service of same
(0.5).

.50

2.00 Attention to hard drive image issues and
conferred with vendor regarding statement of
work and pricing (1.80); reviewed vendor
pricing sheet with XK. Linville {(.20).

1.20 Prepare for and participate in team conference
call to discuss status and strategy for TCEQ
initiatives.

1.60 Review emails from T. Davis and S. Janoe
regarding injunctive orders (.1); review email
from K. Collins regarding Everett settlement
(.1); review stipulation regarding estimation
hearings (.2); telephone conferences with D.
‘Prince regarding same (.1); email to D. Prince,
T. Davis. and M. McGovern regarding same (.2);
‘telephone conferenceé with T. Davis regarding
same (.1); exchange emails with F. Sardjono
regdarding ‘timeline (.1§; Yeview emails from C.
Taylor and K. Collins regarding BNSF settlement
(.1); review emails from T. Davis, B. Kirley
and S. ‘Jance regarding stipulation (.2);
telephdne conference with T. Davis regarding
same (.1); email stipulation to R. Fontenla for
filing and service (.1); review notice of
filing (.1); email to 'T. Davis regarding same

(.1).
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P ) A,

3.80 Review issues associated with City of El Paso
contract claim, El1 Paso smelter permit
proceeding, Encycle settlement, and related
issues (2.50); telephone conference with permit
team. regarding same (0.30)7 continue to drartt
Encyéle and Nueces Bay settlement agreements
(1.00}.

11/06/07 M G Paulson

11/06/07 D L. Prince 4.30 Assist K. Collins with section of Tri-State
9019 hearing materials (.9); review expert
materials and route to S. McKithan for filing
(.5); speak with M. Gregory regarding draft
stipulation language (.2),; revise non-scheduled
chart for production 3 "Hovernment (2.5);
correspond with M. McGovern regarding E. Helena
hearing deadlines (.1); speak with S. Janoe
regarding upcoming hearing deadlines (.1).

11/06/07 J L Ross 2.70 Review St. Paul agreement (.2); call to J.
Stemplewicz regarding status of settlement with
Indians (.2); conference with D. McAllister
regarding Mission (.2); review of term sheet
from the Indians (.7); email to D. McAllister
regarding same (.2); conference with D.
McAllister and J. Lowe regarding status of
Mission discussions (.4); call to D. McAllister
and J. Ferrell regarding settlement (.8).

11/06/07 J B Seitz 4.30 Review post-trial brief from the US and prepare
comments/critique regarding same (1.7); analyze
response cost materials from the US (0.5); work
on issues relating to prior mediation and
settlement (1.5); telephone conferences with
consultants (0.6).

11/06/07 D M Steinway .40 Review various emails.

11/06/07 J C Stewart. ;. 2.10 Analyze cases addressing recovery for private
and public nuisance in Oklahoma (.5}; draft
memorandum regarding recovery for a claim of
temporary private nuisafice in Oklahoma (1.6).

11/06/07 J A'Williamson .40 Reséarched,and provided samples of language for

.preparation of environmental. response to audit
request.

11/07/07 M H Berge 1.00 Composition of Deposition Notice.
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11/07/07 K D Collins 3.10 Prepared for settlement approval hearing for
Band 2 site.

11/07/07 C D Danley .20 Draft Deposition Notice for USIBWC.

11/07/07 T M Davis 2.10 Telephone conference with L. Garza, M. Gregory
regarding hearing schedule (.4); telephone
conference with A. Tenenbaum regarding site
lists (.2); prepare for Board of Director call
(.4); Board of Director call (.5); read and
respond to J. Gross email re discount rate
(.3); exchange emails with T. Jackson regarding
UBMC issues (.3).

11/07/07 S B Dorman 6.60 Employee interviews (3.5); continue reviewing
and revising transcribed East Helena documents
(3.1).

11/07/07 M C Droz 5.70 Review and analyze government's post-trial

brief regarding estimation hearing for Coeur

d'Alene site (1.1); organize and file

documents relating to Coeur d'Alene site

(0.7); review and edit proffer for Mr. Pfahl

(2.1); begin legal research and analysis for

Motion approving settlement agreement for SEMO
- site (1.3).

11/07/07 M L Farley .20 Attend to questions from M. Spearing regarding
meeting with AUSA (0.2).

/11/07/07 B J Faulkner 2.10 Meet with B. Litle of ASARCO to discuss issues
" related to El Paso air permitting effort (1.3);
prepare for and participate in El1 Paso weekly
work group conference call (0.8).

11/07/07 R M Fontenla .20 :Forward Hardshell Mine documentation to J.
Stewart (0.2). : L .

11/07/07 J G Foster Attention to-hard drive imaging. project issues:

s L
S

///’I1/07/07 A N Garrison = ~#.+50 . - Research regarding El Pas o

11/07/07 P M Giblin ¢ 2.90 Work on issue to be considered by TCEQ for'
issuance of renewal permit; prepare for and
participate in team conference call to discuss

pending El Pasg issues.
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11/08/07 K D Collins 6.70 Prepared for settlement approval hearing for
Band 3 site.

11/08/07 C D Danley .20 Conference with Department of Justice re:
' USIBWC scheduling.

11/08/07 T M Davis 9.00 Read draft Tri-State proffer (1.1); discuss
same with K. Collins (.7); study Board book
(.8); telephone conferences with T. Aldrich, S.
Bacco regarding A. Hooks memo (.6)}; exchange
telephone conferences with T. Aldrich and Selby
Team regarding Selby mediation (1.1); telephone
conference with A. Tenenbaum regarding
Tri-States and other settlements (.7); sent
emails to coordinate for Tri-States 9019
hearing (.8); telephone conferences with S. Orr
regarding Harbinger questions (.8); exchange
emalls with J. Kinzie re same (.7); exchange
emails with J. Kinzie and D. Prince regarding
claim totals and review charts regarding the
same (.9); read and comment on Toxic Tort 9019
Motion (.6); read A. Tenenbaum comments on
Silver Bow Motion (.2).

11/08/07 S B Dorman 4.70 East Helena employee interviews (1.7); site
' visit at East Helema and conduct inventory
(.7); continue reviewing and revising East
Helena transcribed documents (2.3).

11/08/07 M C Droz 2.90 Began drafting Motion for Approving Settlement
for SEMO (1.0); reviewed and organized
documents for 9019 hearing on Tri-States (1.9).

" Conference call with K. Mead to prepare to
issuance of Government Accountability Office
report (0.9); research, outline, and draft _
public statement from ASARCO on Government &
Bccountability Office report (4.3). -

11/08/07 B J Faulkner

Attention to"data collection issues.

11/08/07

11/08/07 A N Garrison " Research regarding El Paso.

Review teani communications and work on permit

11/08/07 P-M Giblin :
: " " renewal ‘strategy.
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11/09/07 A N Garrison 7.00 Research regarding El Paso.

11/09/07 P M Giblin .80 Worked on TCEQ permit renewal issues.

O i

11/09/07 M M Gregory 2.50 Exchange emails with T. Davis and A. Maclver
regarding Butte (.2); telephone conference with
A. Maclver regarding same (.1); revise Butte
9019 motion (.2); email clean and blacklined
copies of new draft to A. Tenenbaum, T. Davis
and A. MacIver (.1); review inquiry from S.
Jordan regarding upcoming hearing (.1); check
court calendar regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with S. Krusleski regarding same
(.1); review Doe Run's objection to Tri-States
9019 motion (.1); exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same (.1); exchange emails with K.
Collins regarding Cal Gulch settlement (.1);
determine dates of court approval of same (.2);
telephone conference with T. Aldrich regarding
settlement agreements (.1); review Tacoma
Partial settlement agreement's signature block
for ASARCO (.2); email same toc T. Aldrich (.1);
review emails from M. McGovern, T. Davis and S.
Jordan regarding section 502{e) (1) (B) of the
Bankruptcy Code (.1); locate and email
materials regarding same to them (.2); review
email from S. Jordan regarding same (.1);
review objection of Blue Tee and Gold Fields to
Tri-States' 9019 motion (.1); email same to T.
Davis (.1); review NL objection to Tri-States
9019 wmotion (.1).

11/09/07 J T Gross 7.80 Update case files and indices (3.8); review and
index relevant site documents (2.3); update
expert materials tracking charts (0.5);
.organize Expert Report Materials to send to
relevant parties (1.3).

11/09/07 C J Haynes 1.10 Conference with K. Ledford regarding settlement
documents (.3); conference with T. Cox
regarding FFIC issues (.2); reviewing
settlement agreement and proposed changes (.4);
e-mail. correspondence: regarding FFIC situation
(.2).
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11/09/07 J B Seitz 3.20

11/10/07 M M Gregory .10

11/10/07 M B Heister - 3.80

11/10/07 M P McGovern 7.50

11/11/07 X D Collins 7.20

11/11/07 T M Davis 5.50

11/11/07 M M Gregory .60

11/12/07 O J Alaniz 2.20

11/12/07 S M Burgin Tolzo

Prepare draft settlement materials for CDA Box
involving Hecla (1.4); telephone conferences
with opposing counsel (0.8); review questions
regarding El Paso and prepare responses to same
(1.0). '

Review email from T. Davis regarding Block P
settlement agreement.

Review draft CMO regarding hearing schedule and
brOpose comments (.2); prepare response to
DOJ's document request for IBWC documents

(.3); prepare for LECG depositions for IBWC
site (.6); prepare for B. Hansen deposition for
IBWC site (2.7).

Work on pre-hearing preparations for East
Helena site, including research and drafting of
factual information for pre-trial brief and
research of 502 and CERCLA contribution
protection defenses.

Prepared for settlement approval hearing for
Band 3 site.

Prepare for Tri-States 9019 Hearing.

Review emails from T. Davis regarding hearing
on Tri-States 9019 motion (.2); exchange emails
with him reqgarding hearing notebock (.1};
review T. Creekmore's comments regarding Block
P settlement agreement (.2); email to T. Davis
regarding same (.1).

Review and: revise all toxic tort settlement
agreements and incorporate changes from various

’VTeléphbne'call_to B iitle regarding

'11/12/07 T A Castaneda’ Jr.  2.00

' TraceAnalysis's information.

Preparation and’ participation in a meeting with
TCEQ- Commission staff concerning end of the
year calendar and possible dates for permit
hearing and to assess current thinking among
staff and Commission; reported to Giblin.

I
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11/12/07 K D Collins

11/12/07 T M Davis

11/12/07 8 B Dorman

11/12/07 M C Droz

11/12/07 M L Farley

11/12/07 B J Faulkner

11/12/07 3 G Foster

12.00

1.70

.50

.80

Discussed settlement issues and facts with U.S.
Department of Justice (0.5); prepared charts,
documents, and other evidence for settlement
hearing (11.5).

Telephone conference with C. Haynes and K.
Ledford regarding toxic tort settlement (.6);
exchange emails regarding CDA (.6); prepare for
9019 Hearing {(3.8); read and respond to emails
regarding Houston site (. %Lﬁfrespond to emall‘:)
“regarding El Paso Order (. 3) f respond to emalls

Wﬂmﬂwm
Tegarding Barker Hearing (.3); Board call (.3);

further preparation for hearing (.6).

Revise talking points (.2); begin contacting
individuals with information relating to East
Helena (1.1); continue drafting employee
interview memoranda (3.8); revise contractor
chart to incorporate additional and updated
addresses for East Helena (.3); draft letter to
K. McLean regarding supplemental production for
East Helena (1.2).

Review mediation statements regarding SEMO site
(2.6); drafted Motion and Oxder for Settlement
Agreement at SEMO site (2.9); edit same (1.5).

Spoke with K. Evans regarding RCRA inspection
(0.4); began preparing for additional
interviews of former employees (1.1); confer
with K. Linville regarding same (0.2);
participate in e-discovery conference call
(0.6); review contractor talking points and
confer with S. Dorman regarding same (0.3);
work on issues related to next grand jury
production (0.3).

Lors” for poss1b1e effect on
0-permittingeffort (0. 2¥. :

Attention.to‘revisions to vendor contract for
drive: imaging (.50}; conferred with vendor
regarding scheduling and imaging issues (.30).
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11/12/07 P M Giblin 1.90 Prepare for and participated in conference with
C. Johnson and C. Pope to develop strategy for

dealing with TCEQ issues; review EPA proposal
on fugitive particulate emissions.

e

11/12/07 M M Gregory 2.70 Collect materials regarding Tri-States 9019
: motion hearing notebook (.2); review signed

environmental settlements (.2); office
conference with T. Davis regarding same {(.1);
review toxic tort settlement agreement (.2);
office conference with T. Davis regarding same
(.1); revise same and prepare blackline (.4);
email same to C. Haynes and T. Davis (.1);
review email from C. Haynes (.1); email signed
environmental settlement agreements to DOJ
(.3); review Selby settlement agreement from M.
McGovern (.3); mark -comments thereon and email
to M. McGovern (.3); review new draft of Quapaw
settlement agreement (.3); exchange emails with
M. McGovern regarding same (.1).

11/12/07 3 T Gross 4.80 - Update case files and indices (1.5); review and -
index relevant site documents (2.8); assemble
East Helena Combined Exhibit List (0.S).

11/12/07 C J Haynes 1.70 Attending weekly telephone status meeting (.5);
conference with T. Davis regarding toxic tort
settlements (.2); reviewing proposed changes to
settlement documents (.2); conference with XK.
Ledford regarding same {.1); conference with
expert witness regarding property damage
valuation (.5); e-mail correspondence with
Robert Horkovich regarding FFIC issues (.2).

11/12/07 M B Heister 6.40 ~‘Prépare for and participate in B. Hansen
" “deposition for IBWC site (3.3); prepare for
Medire and Koch expeft depositions for IBWC
' -gite (1.8); preéparé for White and Zelickson
depositions for IBWC Site (1.3).
11/12/07 A M Holzer: .20 © Diséuss scheduling issues with attorney at Reed
Smith. T

11/12/07 A M Hooks .50 - Communications: regarding and attention to
logistics, timing and scoping of environmental
valuation project for owned, non-operating
sites.
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11/12/07 D M Steinway 2.10 Review emails (0.3); telephone conference with
consultant and then Group (0.5); work on email
reply (0.2); telephone call from consultant
(0.2); work on settlement issues (0.3); work on
reply to T. Davis's request; work on invoice
issues (0.2); telephone conference with
consultant (0.4).

11/13/07 O J Alaniz -10  Update I. Kundawala on toxic tort issues.

11/13/07 S M Burgin 1.80 = Research regarding settlement strategy on
non-owned sites.

11/13/07 S M Burgin 1.50 Telephone conference to discuss storm water
sampling; began preparation of memorandum
regarding path forward for same.

11/13/07 K D Collins 5.40 Prepared for and attended settlement hearing
for Band 3 site (4.9); reviewed sites not
scheduled for estimation {0.6).

11/13/07 T M Davis 4.30 Preparation for Tri-States 9019 Hearing (.9);
Tri-States 9019 Hearing (.5); conference call
with A. Tenenbaum and D. Dain regarding site
list (2.2); review Quapaw agreement (.3);
review IBWC CMO Supplement (.4).

11/13/07 S B Dorman 8.20 Continue working on East Helena contractor
matters (3.5); continue drafting interview
memorandum (4.7) . g
SR J——
5.00 Review Government Accountability Office ("GAO")
report following public issuance (0.7);
participate in conference call with El Paso
advocacy team to develop ASARCO response to
Government Accountability Office report and
vaccompanylng statement from Congressman
_Sr;ves;er Reyes,(4.3).
11/13/07 P M Giblin . ¥3.40 ~Rev1ew 1nformatlon from team members on GAO
) . Report and work on strategy regarding same;
fprepare for and part1c1pate in conference call
with D. McAllster, T. Aldrich and T. Montoya to
develop response to comments by Congressman
,Reyes- conference with TCEQ attorney regarding
GAO,Report.

11/13/07 B J Faulkner

oo
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11/13/07 D M Steinway 4.60 Review caselaw issues from brief, work on
review of brief and make comments (4.4); review

email (0.2).

11/14/07 O J Alaniz .70 conferences with C. Haynes and I. Kundawala
regarding status of settlement agreements (.3);
review and revise same (.4).

11/14/07 S M Burgin 1.50 Research background documents related to
settlement for non-owned sites.

11/14/07 S M Burgin .50 Continue preparation of memorandum to A. Burgos
regarding storm water sampling.

11/14/07 G J Byrd 2.40 Assist with preparation of expert report binder
for East Helena hearing.

11/14/07 T M Davis 5.70 Exchange emails with J. Kinzie re DOJ (.4);
exchange emails regarding E. Helena estimation
hearing (1.5); telephone conferences with M.
McGovern and S§. Janoe regarding same (1.3);
telephone conference with M. Paulson regarding
Richardson Flatts site {.3); conference with M.
Gregory regarding Taylor Springs (.3); read E.
Helena brief (.3); read and comment on B&L
settlement (.4); read Hecla draft agreement and
discuss with B. Seitz (.5); additiomal
telephone conferences with M. McGovern and S.
Janoce (.4); telephone conference with G. Evans
regarding hearing (.3}.

11/14/07 S B Dorman 14.70 Research and draft response to emergency motion

' for continuance of hearing in East Helena
éstimation matter (12.9); research and draft
primer on Bestfoods case and progeny per S.
Jance (1.2); assist in finalizing letter and

.-supplemental production of documents in East
Helena matter (.6).

11/14/07 M L Farley .k:.BQfAvW6rk on production of additional documents to
. AUSA {0.5); revised letter to K. McLean (0.3).

~

11/14/07 B J Faulkner .._; 3.60 Conference call with K. Mead to plan for a
: possible meeting between El Paso Congressman
_Reyes and ASARCO management {0.7); drafted an
outline of discussion points to be used at such
a meeting (2.9).
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11/14/07 R M Fontenla 1.00 Email with T. Davis and D. Prince regarding
Harbinger Capital (0.2); email with D. Prince
regarding environmental service list, file same
via Electronic Case Filing System with the
Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy Court
{(0.5); email with J. Prince regarding
estimation/claims objection hearing order,
review same (0.3).

——

11/14/07 P M Giblin 1.00 Continue work on advocacy issues related to El ;
Paso permit renewal. ‘

11/14/07 M M Gregory 3.30 Office conference with T. Davis regarding order
on AOC motion regarding Taylor Springs (.2);
review his email to B. Meginnes regarding same
(.1); revise proposed order regarding same :
{.1); email to B. Meginnes and T. Davis i
regarding same (.1); office conference with T. :
Davis regarding environmental estimation
hearings (.1); telephone conference with T.
Davis and L. Garza regarding same (.1); prepare
stipulation canceling Selby estimation hearing
(.4); office conference with T. Davis regarding
same (.1); exchange emails with M. McGovern
regarding same (.1); email same to M. Padilla,
B. Reck, P. Southworth, T. Davis and M.
McGovern {.2); review email from M. Padilla
regarding same (.1); telephone conference with
S. Dorman regarding East Helena (.1); locate
form of response and East Helena stipulation !
for her (.3); email same to S. Dorman (.1); 5
review file-stamped mortgage and cover letter
from W. O'Leary (.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same (.1); email mortgage to T.

~Aldrich, R. Kern, B. Litle, K. White and T.
“Davis (.1); prepare letter regarding mortgage
to R. Kern (.3); exchange emails with S. Janoce
. regarding E. Helena pretrial (.1); check
calendar regarding same (.1); locate
file-stamped East Helena stipulation (.2);
"ex¢hange_emaiis with 8. Dorman regarding same
(.1);‘reviéw email from P. Southworth regarding
" Selby stipulation (.1).

11/14/07 C J Haynes 4.20 Reviewing and revising expert disclosures
(1.0}); reviewing Quapaw settlement document
(.1); conference with 0. Alaniz regarding
settlement with toxic tort claimants (.1);
conference with experts regarding settlement
valuation (.6); conferences with I. Kundawala
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11/14/07 D M Steinway

11/15/07 S M Burgin

1.50

Prepare email, work on comments on brief and
review of legal arguments (1.4); review emails
{(0.1).

Continue review of background documents
regarding non-owned sites for settlement; began
review of documents received from Colorado
School of Mines.

11/15/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

'2.00

Legislative research, review of GAO report and
gathering of relevant advocacy information to
complement ‘current grassroots effort.

11/15/07 K D Collins

11/15/07 T M Davis

11/15/07 M L Farley

.30

.20

conference with E. Furst of state of Washington
and T. Davis on status of settlement
agreements.

Read memo prepared by C. Haynes regarding
property damage claims {.6); exchange emails
regarding due date for discount rate motion
(.4); call with C. Mott and call with M.
Paulson, T. Aldrich and others regarding
Arizona claims (.8); conference with M. Paulson
regarding nonscheduled sites (.7); email
regarding term sheet (.4); read order prepared
by B. Meginnes and discuss the same with B.
Meginnes (.4); read and exchange emails
regarding Illinois Taylor Springs issues (.7};
telephone conferences with B. Meginnes
regarding same {.5).

Draft email to D. McAllister (0.2).

11/15/07 B J Faulkner

Conduct research on an. EPA proposal to lower
the national ambient air.standard for lead and
its potential:effect. on the El Paso permitting
effort (1.8); assist with development of ASARCO
public stateinent on the same issue (1.0);

participate:in’ El Paso team conference call
(0.4); participate.in;conference call with T.
Montoyauahde:LMead;{Q 6) . o

11/15/07 R M Fontenla

.70

. Emailks with R
‘consent decree, ‘search master case index (0.3);

.. Mulloy: regarding Blackhawk

email with M. Gregory.regarding stipulation
canceling 'estimation hearing, file same via
Electronic Case Filing System with the Southern
District of Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with
Trumbull regarding service of same (0.4).
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11/15/07 A N Garrison 5.50 Research regarding issues for El Paso Smelter.

11/15/07 P M Giblin .30 Review possible impact of proposed EPA lead
standard. : f

11/15/07 M M Gregory 5.90 Review email from A. Tenenbaum regarding SEMO
settlement {(.1}; exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same {.1); review email from B. Seitz

regarding same (.1); email to A. Tenenbaum
regarding same (.1}; exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding Taylor Springs motion (.2);
telephone conferences with B. Meginnes
regarding same (.2); exchange emails with him
regarding same {.2); review new draft order
from him regarding same (.2); review email from
B. Seitz and draft CDA settlement agreement
(.3); email to B. Seitz regarding same (.1};
review email from Scott and draft response to
motion for continuance (.3); email to him
regarding same {(.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding discount rate motion (.2);
review email from S. Jordan regarding same
(.1); leave phone mail message for B. Reck
regarding Selby stipulation (.1); email to B.
Meginnes, L. Johnson and D. Dain regarding new
draft order (.1); telephone conferences with K.
Franta regarding same (.2); review new draft of
response to motion for continuance (.3);
exchange emails with S. Janoe regarding same
(.1); review email from T. Davis regarding same
{.1); telephone conference with S. Janoe
regarding same and regarding upcoming hearings
(.1); exchange emails with T. Davis regarding
Selby stipulation (.2); revise same {.2); email
to R. Fontenla for Filing and service (.1l);
teview notice of filing (.1); email to T. Davis
regarding same (.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding subordination issue (.3);
telephone conference with D. Prince regarding
response (.1); review email from K. Franta and
draft notice (.2); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same {(.2); telephone conference
with D. Dain regarding Taylor Springs order
(.2); telephone conference with D. Dain and B.
Meginnes regarding same (.2}; review emails
from D. Dain regarding same {.2); exchange
‘emails with K. Franta regarding draft notice
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11/16/07 S

11/16/07 S

11/16/07 T

11/16/07 T

11/16/07 S

11/16/07 M

M Burgin

M Burgin

A Castaneda Jr.

M Davis

B Dorman

C Droz

-80

Continued review of Colorado School of Mines
discovery documents.

Continue review of pollution prevention plan
requirements and transmit comments to S. Janoe.

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
Giblin and Faulkner to discuss hearing timeline
and key components of an advocacy information
to complement current grassroots effort.

Telephone conference with J. Gross regarding -
various sites (.4); exchange numerous emails
regarding E. Helena (.8); read El Paso public
comments (.3); attend BNSF hearing by phone
(.8); telephone conference with S. Janoe
regarding same, left message for M. McGovern
regarding same (.3).

Finalized first draft of interview memorandum.

Reviewed documents related to Settlement
Agreement between ASARCO LLC and governments.

11/16/07 B

J Faulkner

Meet with P. Giblin and T. Castaneda to_plag
for state-level advocacy related to El Paso
permitting effort (2.2); reviewed and revised
ASARCO public statement on proposed lead
standard revisions {(0.9).

11/16/07 J

G Foster

Attention to hard drive imaging project.

11/16/07 P

M Giblin

11/16/07 M

M Gregory

-telephone conference with TCEQ attormney
.regarding schedule  for TCEQ consideration of
. ,‘. Pe]._m]'t ': -

Work on outline and timeline for sections
leading to TCEQ issuance of permit renewal;

Exchange emails with T. Davis regarding court
calendar. (.1); ‘review materials regarding same

:{.2) ; ~exchange emails with T. Davis and M.

Heister regarding settlement agreements (.2);
review stipulation canceling Selby hearing
(.1); emdil same to group (.1); review email

from B. Meginnes with.new draft of Taylor

Springs order (.2); review emails from T. Davis
and L. Garza regarding court calendar (.1).
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o

11/19/07

T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
TCEQ Commissioner and Legislative Assistant;
discussed setting of permit hearing, air
quality monitoring and reaction to plant
re-opening; repgrted to Giblin.

11/19/07

11/19/07

11/19/07

11/19/07

K D Collins 1.10

T M Davis 4.20

M C Droz 5.20

M L Farley .80

Conferenced with team to discuss documents,
progress, and strategy for unowned sites.

Review and comment on Selby draft (.6); review
and comment on E. Helena draft (.5); read and
comment on various 9019 drafts (1.3); organize
meeting with DOJ (.9); attend call re veto
hearing (.9).

Obtain and review expert report of Mr. Hansen
(1.9); obtain and review LECG reports relating
to IBWC site (2.3); obtain and review

‘additional documents relating to IBWC site

(1.0).

Began preparing for interview of R. Marcus.

11/19/07

11/19/07
11/19/07

11/19/07

B J Faulkner .60

A N Garrison 2.60
A N Garrison 5.50

P M Giblin " 2.10

Review media reports-of Government
Accountability Office report and discuss with
El Paso advocacy team members.

Researched regarding issues for El Paso
Smelter.

Researched regarding issues for El Paso
Smelter.

Work on TCEQ strategy for obtaining El Paso
permit renewal.

11/19/07

11/19/07

M M Grégofy" o >;Sd

J T Gross o 7.00

“Réview email from T. Davis regarding East

Helena (.1); exchange emails with M. Heister
regarding"sample 9019 motion (.2); attention to
phone mail message from B. Reck regarding Selby
stipulation (.1); exchange email messages with
B. Reck regarding same (.2). : ‘

Update case .files and indices (2.3); update
expert materials tracking charts (0.5);
organize and index expert reports for various
parties (ASARCO LLC, ASARCO, Inc., and others)
{1.8); gather materials from the file relating
to ASARCO non-scheduled sites (0.5); assemble
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11/19/07 M G Paulson 3.60 Conference call with non-owned/not scheduled
site team to discuss strategy for various
non-owned sites (0.80); reviewed materials
prepared by client on Arizona claims (0.40);
continue to prepare for settlement negotiations
on Arizona response costs and NRD claims
(2.00); telephone conferences related to same
(0.40).

11/19/07 D L Prince 8.80 Work on East Helena RCRA consent decree issues
(.5); procure expert documents for ASARCO Inc.
(.2} ; coordinate preparation of East Helena
trial materials with J. Gross (.2); update East
Helena combined exhibit list with ASARCO Inc.
revisions (.4}); assist M. Paulson in
preparation for meeting with agencies in
Arizona {(1.2); revise charts to include recent
BNSF proof of claim filing (2.8); review claims
for placement on non-estimation chart and draft
emails to T. Davis regarding same (2.3);
prepare background information regarding
Houston Federated site for S. McMillen (.5);
review draft stipulation to the Case Management
Order regarding the East Helena hearing (.3):
correspond with M. McGovern regarding suggested
edits (.4).

11/19/07 J L Ross : 3.30 Review complaint regarding and formulate
strategy in MRI litigation related to
estimation (2.0); email to J. Beck regarding
MRI meeting (.2); respond to email from G.
Tsiolis regarding documents to Indians (.3);
prepare email regarding mediation of MRI claim

~+{.2); review and respond to emails regarding
Mission documents to be provided to Indians
(.2); prepare email to D. McAllister regarding
Mission and discussion with J. Kinzie (.2);
review correspondence from G. Tsiolis regarding
documents to be produced (.2).

11/19/07 J B Seitz : .4.60 .- Prepare draft responses to questions regardiﬂg
v o historical site:liabilities (2.5); telephone

e e : ronﬁerenceswwithropposingmcqupseiuxega;ding --------- -
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11/19/07

11/20/07

11/20/07

11/20/07

11/20/07

11/20/07

11/20/07
11/20/07

11/20/07

D M Steinway

O J Alaniz

K D Collins

T M Davis

S B Dorman

M C Droz

B J Faulkner

L A Fleischmann

J G Foster

.80

.60

.60

.30

._2_0.

Review briefing issues, caselaw issues for
brief, telephone conference with T. Davis.

Analyze proposed changes to toxic tort
settlement agreement, revise same and circulate
drafts to I. Kundawala and C. Haynes.

Discussed issues related to Band 2 evidence
with client (0.1); reviewed source documents
and drafted memo summarizing issues related to
Band 2 sites (3.4).

Read Hayden letter (.2); study term sheet
materials sent to DOJ (.S); read financial
assurance memo (.3); telephone conference with
T. Jackson re same (.3); call with DOJ, EPA xe
estimates (.5); telephone conference with S.
Janoe re same (.3); telephone conferences with
.T. Aldrich, C. Pfahl regarding owned sites and
re CDA properties (.7); review D. Prince
charts, discuss with D. Prince (.7); telephone
conference with S. McMillen regarding data room

{.3); work with D. Prince on chart (1.2)};

telephone conference with T. Aldrich regarding
various (.2); read emails regarding Arizona
settlement (.7).

Continue working on contractor issues for East
Helena.

Draft, revise and edit 9019 motion for Coeur
d'Alene Box between ASARCO and government
(2.4); draft, revise and edit 9019 motion for

. Coeur d!Alene Box between ASARCO and Hecla

(3.3)..

Conference call with K. Mead to update

- Congressional advocacy. strategy.

Genéraiqreview\ofaoutétanding
invoices/documentation for CDA.

gonféfréd;wifh vehdor regarding hard drive
image project.

o

A N Garrison

" 6.10

-Researched regérdihé issues for El Paso
Smelter.
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11/20/07 P M Giblin

.90

Work on information to be provided to TCEQ

“setting out possible plant improvements.

11/20/07 M M Gregory

11/20/07 J T Gross

11/20/07 C J Haynes

11/20/07 M B Heister

11/20/07 A M Hooks

11/20/07 R B Hudson

11/20/07 T C Jackson

11/20/07 J S Janoe

.50

Exchange emails with M. Heister regarding IBWC
stipulation (.2); review email from L. Putman
regarding same (.1); review email from D. Dain
regarding Taylor Springs order (.1); review
email from A. MacIver regarding Butte
settlement agreement (.1).

Update case files and indices (2.0); gather
materials from the file relating to ASARCO
non-scheduled sites (0.5).

Conference with J. Fabry regarding settlement
language {.2); conference with C. Pfahl
regarding property damage issues (.4});
conference with I. Kundawala regarding same
(.2); preparing for telephone meeting with
experts (.7); telephone meeting with experts
(1.1); conference re: same and mediation
strategy with I. Kundawala (.8).

Resolve coordination issues with Parent
regarding IBWC hearing (.5); correspondence
regarding expert testimony for IBWC hearing
(.4); analyze settlement posture for IBWC case

(.3).

Reviewed information from ERM regarding
valuation project status; analysis of issues
and considerations regarding possible use of
custodial trust.

"Review documents and chronicle significant

documents (1.2); make' copies of flagged

documents (0.8).

fTélebhdhé“ConférenCe with ' T. Davis regarding

memorandum concerning ASARCO financial
&ssuréﬁéefobligatioﬁsj(o-l);‘revise memorandum
based on comments réceived and forward to T.
Davis (1.6); send email to D. Robbins regarding
samé (0.3); prepare  information requested
concerning ASARCO liability at various sites as-

‘of March 2003 (1.4).

Prepared for and participated in mediation of
AZ NRD claims.
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11/20/07 K M Mead 1.00 Teleconference with B. Faulkner regarding
response to Reyes press release; review T.
Montoya correspondence.

11/20/07 M G Paulson 12.50 Continue to prepare for meeting on Arizona NRD
claims; attend meeting; continue to prepare for
meeting on Arizona response cost claims.

11/20/07 D L Prince 7.80 Call with R. Rhoades regarding valuation of
Arizona properties (.2); draft email to M.
Paulson summarizing valuation information from
R. Rhoades (.1); update court version of
settlement status chart (2.4); update board
version of settlement status chart and send to
board (.6); answer calls from G. Nino regarding
the Quapaw settlement (.1); draft emails to T.
Davis and M. McGovern regarding G. Nino calls
(.1); calls with T. Davis regarding materials
for Alix Partners meeting (.2); prepare set of
materials for meeting (2.1); revise materials
for meeting per T. Davis's suggestions (.6);
update response log (.5); correspond with
expert regarding needed materials (.1); locate
and send Tri-state materials to I. Kundawala

(.8). .-
11/20/07 E D Reeder 1.10 Update unowned sites files.
11/20/07 J L Ross .50 Emails to J. Prince and K. Sawers regarding

meeting with MRI (.3); call to J. Gross
regarding same (.2).

11/20/07 J B Seitz 3.20 Analyze potential claims estimation questions
relating to certain sites (1.9); telephone

conferences regarding CDA Box settlement and
potential revisions to draft pa
“”oﬁAmaterlals fdf El Paso 51te proceedlngs

11/20/07 D M'Steinway i‘ .40 Review email and reply.

11/20/07 P K Strebeck .80 Searched Westlaw for adrticles on trust accounts
’ and bankruptcy for A. Garrison. ’

11/21/07 B W Carey v .60 Compiled documents félated to Ray Mine (Mineral
i Creek) site to supplement M. Paulson's
materials.
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11/21/07 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Preparation and participation in a follow up
meeting with TCEQ Executive Assistant;
discussed dates for permit hearing and to
assess current thinking among staff and
Commission; reported to P. Giblin.

y;

11/21/07 X D Collins 2.50 Reviewed claim issues and expert conclusions at
Band 2 sites.

11/21/07 T M Davis .80 Read and exchange email with M. Heister re IBWC
(.5); telephone conference with T. Aldrich
regarding various items (.3).

11/21/07 S B Dorman - 2.50 Continue reviewing and revising transcribed
documents for East Helena (2.1); revise
contractor list and information relating to
East Helena (.4).

11/21/07 M C Droz 6.30 Finish draft of B. Hansen's proffer (2.6);
review deposition of B. Hansen and edit proffer
accordingly (3.7}. B

11/21/07 B J Faulkner 6.30 Draft proposed advocacy plan to prepare for
TCEQ consideration of El Paso permit at Agenda
(4.3); meet with T. Casteneda to discuss state
advocacy strategy (0.4); participate in 2
conference calls
(0.7); with

P. Giblii, review and comment on—

(0.9).

N

11/21/07 P M Giblin 1.80 Work on issues related to —)

11/21/07 M M Gregory .20 Exchange emdils with A! Schlesinger regarding
T ' supplement’ to CMO. ~

11/21/07 A N Garrison 1.50 Researched custodial frusts

11/21/07 J T Gross ' 2.30 Update case files and indices.

11/21/07 € J Haynes 1:90 Preparing for and présénting report to Board
regarding mediation authority (.3); reviewing
Simons report on Quapaw and e-mail
correspondence regarding same (.4); conference
with I. Kundawala and D. Cabe, expert,
regarding analysis of Brown's report {.9);
additional conversation with D. Cabe regarding
expert issues (.3).
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11/26/07 B J Faulkner

.80

Review anti-ASARCO brochure published by
Senator Eliot Shapleigh's office (0.4); revise
state advocacy plan according to suggestions

11/26/07 R M Fontenla

11/26/07 A N Garrison

.90

11.50

from T. Caseneda (0.4).
M

Emails with M. Gregory regarding Taylor Springs
proposed order, file same via Electronic Case
Filing System with the Southern District of
Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with Trumbull
regarding sexrvice of same (0.5); conferences
with V. Chapman regarding CRA statement, emalls
with M. Scott regarding same {0.4).

Research custodial trusts and bankruptcy
issues.

Cl/ze/m P M Giblin

Worked on TCEQ strategy; conferences with TCEQ ?
staff.

11/26/07 M M Gregory

Telephone conference with B. Meginnes regardlng
Taylor Springs order (.1); review email from T.
Davis regarding same (.1); email new proposed
order regarding Taylor Springs to R. Fontenla

for filing and service (.1); review notice of
filing (.1); email same to B. Meginnes and T.
pDavis (.1); review email from M. Heister with

drafts of Barker 9019 motions (.3); telephone
conference with T. Davis regarding
environmental issues (.1); exchange emails with
A. Schlesinger regarding CMO supplement (.1):
determine what supplement number is next (.2);
revise chart regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with $. Janoe regarding
environmental claims chart (.1); locate same
(.2); email same to S. Janoe (.1); review
emails from.T. Davis, J. Ross and S. Janoe
regarding settlements with U.S. (.1); email
Tri-States settlement agreement to them (.1);
telephone conference with I. Kundawala
regarding late claims research (.1); locate
same and email to him (.1); locate pleadings
regarding environmental. issues in plans (1.5);
email same to T. Davis and A. Hooks (.2);
review signed' supplement regarding USIBWC
hearing (.1); email same to group (.1} ;
telephone conference with T. Aldrich regarding
discount rate motion (.1); email same to him
{(.1); review email from M. Heister regarding
USIBWC supplement to CMO (.1); review draft
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11/26/07 P K Strebeck .50 Researched Bogert on Trusts to find index or
table of contents for A. Garrison to assist her
in selecting appropriate volume.

11/27/07 O J Alaniz 6.40 Review and analyze case law

(1.3); draft motion to
expunge proofs of claim filed by toxic tort
claimants (3.3); draft order regarding same
(.4); draft motion for expedited hearing
regarding motion to expunge (1.2); draft order
regarding same (.2).

11/27/067 T A Castaneda Jr. 1.00 Review and comment of advocacy plan; forwarded
edits to B. Faulkner and P. Giblin.

11/27/07 T M Davis 5.80 Review IBWC materials and forward comments reé _
same (2.7); ‘exchange emails with M. Paulson re ;
New Orleans meeting with DOJ (.6); read and :
comment on Federated letter {.3); read Nueces
Bay settlement changes and telephone conference
with A. MacIver re same (.3); read S. Jordan
‘memos (.8); read other emails re toxic tort
mediation (1.1).

11/27/07 S B Dorman .80 Continue review and revision of transcribed ;
East Helena documents. :

11/27/07 B J Faulkner 5.20 Drafted ASARCO response to anti-ASARCO press
release following issuance of GAO report (3.8);
conference call with B. Litle of ASARCO (0.4);
review of historical ASARCO documents provided
by former ASARCO counsel (1.0).

" 00N
11/27/07 L A Fleischmann © .80 Conference call with ASARCO, Inc. and M.
' ‘Heister. RS
11/27/07 A N Garrison 9.00 Research custodial trusts and bankruptcy
R issues. : :
11/27/07 A N Garrison 8.00 Draft memo regarding custodial trusts.

Work on TCEQ befmit renewal issues and prépare
for agenda meeting at which permit will be
considered.

11/27/07 P M Giblin ' 2. 99"
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11/27/07 J B Seitz 5..00 Continue work on proposed settlement documents
regarding the CDA Box (0.9); prepare revised
materials relating to draft motion for CDA Box
(1.2); telephone conferences regarding
additional estimation issues involving owned
properties (0.4); prepare summary of key issues
relating to prior CDA consent decree (1.0);
review and prepare emails regarding estimation
matters for additional sites (0.5); work on
brief analysis regarding owned properties

. (0.6} ; telephone conferences regarding El Paso
~site (0.4).

11/27/07 D M Steinway 2.50 Review settlement issues and documents pending
’ claims (1.9); telephone call from Creditors'
Committee and reply (0.6).

11/27/07 J C Stewart N .30 Research issues related to environmental
' ‘ estimation hearing.

11/27/07 J C Stewart .30 Research on Westlaw issues related to
environmental estimation hearing (.3).

11/28/07 O J Alaniz ' 7.90 Prepare for and participate in telephone
conference with T. Davis, C. Haynes, S. Janoe,
S. Jordan and I. Kundawala (1.2); review and
analyze case law discussing creditors' ability
to amend claims post-bar date (1.7)}; review and
revise motion to expunge claims (4.3); prepare
same for filing (.3); conference with I.
Kundawala regarding same and hearing strategy

(.4).

11/28/07 T A Castaneda Jr 3.00, Preparatlon and part1c1patlon in a legislative
' strategy meetlng w1th C. Johnson, J. Pope, B.
'Faulkner P Glblln, participated on a

teleconference w1th ASARCO smelter project

11/28/07 X D Colling  °  2.40 ' owned ‘sites.

11/28/07'T M Davis - t“ _ 9,36‘2 Read memos re tOXlC tort issues (.6); call with
Co R o Haynes'et al. régarding toxic torts (1.1);
meet with S. Janoce and M. Paulson to prepare
for DOJ meetlng (2.1); meet with DOJ (4.5);
report on meeting to J. Kinzie (.3); read and
respond to IBWC emails (.7).
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11/28/07 S B Dorman 2.40 Continued reviewing and revising transcribed
documents for East Helena (2.0); continued
working on contractor matters relating to East
Helena (.4).

11/28/07 B J Faulkner 5.30 Wwith P. Giblin and T. Castaneda, meet with
ASARCO outside lobbyists C. Johnson and C. Pope

to review advocacy plan (1.6); participate in
El Paso team conference call (0.6); revise
draft advocacy plan according to suggestions
from lobbyists (1.6); conduct legal research on
Texas Administrative Procedure Act

(0.8); draft written

summary of research (0.7).

11/28/07 R M Fontenla .80 Email with M. Gregory regarding Motion for
Order Approving Compromise and Settlement
Between ASARCO LLC and the Quapaw Tribe of
Oklahoma Regarding the Tri-State Mining
District Sites, file same via Electronic Case
Filing System with the Southern District of
Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with Trumbull
regarding service of same (0.5); conference and
email with A. MacIver regarding Golinsky,
forward motion and exhibits to A. MacIver

(0.3).

11/28/07 A N Garrison 7.00 Review and review memo regarding custodial
trusts.

11/28/07 P M Giblin 3.60 Continued work on TCEQ permit strategy issues;

telephone conferences with ASARCO team members
regarding same. ’

11/28/07 M M Gregory 2.70 Exchange emails with A. MacIver regarding
environmental settlement agreements (.1);
locate same for her (.5); email
Tri-States/Quapaw Tribe 9019 motion to R.
Fontenla for filing and service (.1); review
notice of filing (.1); email same to T.
Aldrich, T. Davis, S. Janoce and A. Maclver
(.1); email same to D. Mills, R. Smith and T.
Davis (.1); review emails from M. McGovern
regarding East Helena estimation (.1); revise
chart regarding environmental settlement
agreements (.3); exchange emails with M.
McGovern regarding Tri-States/Quapaw settlement
agreement (.2); email to T. Aldrich regarding
same {.1); exchange emails with S. Jance, T.



Case 05-21207 Document 7420-10  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 14 of 79

BAKER BOTTS vor.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession

Page

85

Exchange emails with J. Ross regarding
groundwater relief language (.5); exchange
email with S. Jordan regarding discount rate
motion (.3); review Farmland documents (.8);
mediation in Judge Magner's courtroom (5.0);
exchange emails with M. Gregory regarding
expert (.3); exchange emails regarding moving
E. Helena hearing (.4); revise emails regarding
motion to expunge (.6); exchange numerous
emails re IBWC issues (1.8).

11/29/07 T M Davis 9.70
V .
11/29/07 B J Faulkner .30

Meet with P. Giblin and D. McDonald to plan for
TCEQ agenda advocacy (1.3); draft written
summary of agenda advocacy plan (1.2); conduct
legal research on Texas Administrative
Procedure Act (1.4); revise draft advocacy plan
and draft cover note introducing the plan to T.
Aldrich (1.6); participate in conference call
with K. Mead to discuss revisions to federal
talking points (0.4); work on preparations for
agenda argument (1.4).

.90,

Numerous emails with M. Heister and S. McKithan
regarding debtor's prehearing brief, file same
via Electronic Case Filing System with the
Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy Court
(0.9}).

Work with ASARCO team members on key issues for
issuance of TCEQ permit renewal.

11/29/07 R M Fontenla

- e,
11/29/07 P M Giblin 2.80
11/29/07 M M Gregory 3.20

Review email from A. MacIver regarding
environmental settlement agreements (.1);
review email from B. Kirley regarding Barker
settlement {:1); review:email from W. Fletcher
regarding-East-Helena supplement to CMO (.1);
review and mark:comments-.on Barker settlement
agreements with Doe Run-and with government
entities (.5); email same to M. Heister (.1);:
review email frotha;Jande regarding ol
environmental. service list (.1); exchange
emails with D. Prince regarding same (.1);
email to-R. Fontenla, .S. Janoe and D. Prince:
regarding same (.1); exchange emails with T.

- Davis regarding East ‘Helena brief (.2); review

emails from M. Heister and T. Jackson regarding
same (.1); locate insert from earlier brief and
email to M. Heister, T. Jackson and T. Davis
{(.4); review email from M. McGovern to C.
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11/29/07 A L MaclIver 5.30 Finishing the update to the memorandum on
liabilities (3.3).
11/29/07 D R McDonald .90 Worked on strategy for agenda presentation for
renewal of El Paso air permit renewal.
o et
11/28/07 M P McGovern 8.70 Work on research of historical background and

drafting of pre-trial brief for State of
Montana NRD hearing and related activities for
East Helena site (6.8); telephone call with R.
Collins and M. Capedeville of the State of
Montana regarding the pre-trial CMO Supplement
(0.4); work on preparations for BNSF hearing
for East Helena site (1.5).

11/29/07 S A McKithan 6.10 Work on preparation of exhibits and exhibit
list for IBWC hearing (2.3); assist with
preparation and filing of IBWC pre-trial brief
(1.8); work on developing IBWC witness files

(2.0).
11/29/07 S McMillen . 3-50 Calls with M. Zimmerman and T. Klempel
3 regarding various owned, non-operating site

issues, including Mike Horse and Idaho
properties (1.3); attention to issue of the
manner in which the settlement of claims
impacts the valuation of environmental
liabilities at the owned, non-operating sites,
including review and analysis of the Bunker
Hill Consent Decree {2.0); revisions to the
memorandum regarding custodial trusts for the
Board of Directoxrs (.2).

11/29/07 M G Paulson . 9.00 Continue to prepare for meeting with New Mexico
‘ AG - regarding settlement of state NRD claims
(2.00) ; attend meéeting {5.00); draft Board
authority mémoranda (2.60).

11/29/07 D L Prince 6.90 Locate' supplemental POC for Selby settlement
agreement (.2); review environmental service
list for-revisions (.2); draft email to East
Helena NRD pdrtiés detailing preparation and
exchange of exhibits (.5); calls with S.
MéKithan' regarding USTBWC filings (.2) revise
settlement status chart to include
non-scheduled, non-owned sites ({5.8).
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11/30/07 S B Dorman 5.20

Board of Director materials (.8).

Worked on East Helena interview memoranda.

11/30/07 B J Faulkner

Revise federal advocacy talking points to
reflect suggestions from K. Mead (1.9};
proofread, correct, and send cover note to T.
Aldrich introducing advocacy plan (0.4); draft
email to B. Litle describing upcoming advocacy
work (0.6); participate in conference call with
consultant D. Cabe to discuss necessary
technical work in prior to permit renewal
(0.7); drafted a written summary of D. Cabe
meeting (1.1); conducted legal research on
EPA's recommendation to lower lead air<§uality
standard- (0.4} .

11/30/07 L A Fleischmann 5.30

11/30/07 R M Fontenla

11/30/07 J G Foster J20

Researching and drafting section of IBWC reply
brief for M. Heister {5.30).

Email with M. Gregory regarding Stipulation and
Supplement No. 22 To The Case Management Order
As To The East Helena Yards, Montana Site, file
same via Electronic Case Filing System with the
Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy Court,
email with Trumbull regarding service of same
(0.5); email with M. Gregory regarding
Stipulation and Supplement No. 23 to the Case
Management Order, file same via Electronic Case
Filing System with the Southern District of
Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with Trumbull
regarding service of same (0.5}; numerous
emails with M. Heiser and S. McKithan regarding
filing (0.3).

Attention to hard drive imaging issues.

11/30/07 M M Gregory

. ek
11/30/07 P M Giblin 2.10

~affecting El Paso permit; worked on same;

Telephdne conferences with ASARCO team members
fegarding public relations and other issues

teléphoné conference with TCEQ attorney
régarding status of criminal enforcement
review. '

Review emails from M. McGovern regarding East
Helena NRD hearing (.1); telephone conference
with M. McGovern regarding same (.1); leave
phone mail message for L. Garza regarding same
(.1); review email from M. McGovern regarding
East Helena/BNSF supplement to CMO (.1);
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Seitz regarding settlement issues relating to
the owned, non-operating properties (.8); calls
with T. Klempel to coordinate teleconferences
and discuss issues regarding the El1 Paso and
Mike Horse owned, non-operating sites (.4).

11/30/07 K M Mead 1.20 Check on status of Pee Wee meeting with Reyes;
revise talking points.

, oo
f Review Texas administrative enforcement actions
\involving ASARCO sites (1.00) review materials
regarding Richardson Flats site (0.70); review
materials regarding Hylebos site (0.60); update
non-owned site settlement status chart (2.50);
telephone conference with R. Lotz, Colorado AG,
regarding settlement of remaining Colorado
sites (0.40); evaluate options for settlement
of same (0.80); attention to Blue Ledge site in
California (0.30); attention to Silverton site
in Colorado (0.50); continue to draft Board
authority request regarding Arizona NRD claims

(1.70); telephone conference with B. Litle
regarding Colorado sites (0.20); conference
call with client regarding Sacaton, Arizona
site {(0.40); continue to review materials
regarding non-owned sites (1.40); continue to
explore settlement/estimation options for same
(1.50).

.

11/30/07 M G Paulson 12.00

11/30/07 D L Prince 1.9¢0 Revise settlement status chart and forward to
S. Bacco (1.4); coordinate procurement of
additional expert documents for A. Schlesinger
{.3); respond to settlement information request
by S. McMillen (.1); correspond with M. Heister
regarding exhibits (.1).

11/30/07-J R Prince 2.00 Work on toxic tort property damage claims and
' " hearing to expunge claims (1.4); attend
conference with committees and FCR regarding
hearing strategy with regard to toxic tort
claim (.6).

11/30/07 J L Ross 3.00 Prepare email to clients regarding
correspondence from the Indians (.8); email to
G. Tsiolis regarding Indian letter (.2}; email
to D. Baker regarding same (.2); call from R.
Kern regarding meeting with the Indians (.6);
talk through Mission issues with team (.4);
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ATTN: Ruth Kern
2575 East Camelback Road

Invoice Date January 15, 2008

Suite 500 Attorney J L Kinzie
Phoenix AZ 85016-9251
076735.0113 Environmental Issues
Hours Description
m i : -

11/30/07 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Preparation and participation in a meeting with
P. Giblin and B. Faulkner to discuss hearing
timeline and key components of an advocacy
information to complement current grassroots

""““w\mhhm effort.

12/01/07 T M Davis 3.20 Read status chart and note comments (.7); read
IBWC matexrials (1.7); read Arizona information
{(.2); read and respond to Financial Assurance
emails (.6).

12/01/07 M L Farley .40 Work on issues related to review and collection
of electronic recoxds {(0.4).

12/01/07 C J Haynes 1.20 Further review of valuation experts draft
report (.4); conference with valuation experts
and I. Kundawala regarding draft report (.8).

12/01/07 M B Heister 4.60 Draft reply to IBWC's prehearing brief (4.6).

12/01/07 A M Holzer 1.60 Work on the combined exhibit list for Debtor
and Parent.

12/01/07 A M Hooks 1.20 Worked on revisions to memorandum analyzing
environmental liability transfer options and
issues; reviewed information regarding possible
candidates for consideration in custodial trust "
or other liability transfer process.

12/01/07 I Kundawala 1.40 Prepare for and participate in call with

valuation experts and C. Haynes and follow up
regarding same.
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12/03/07 O J Alaniz

12/03/07 S M Burgin

Gather exhibits and prepare same for filing and
preparation of hearing notebooks, analyze which
exhibits are necessary for hearing on motion to
expunge claims (2.8); attention to publication
of bar date notice issues (.7); multiple
conferences with J. Prince, C. Haynes and I.
Kundawala regarding hearing on motion to
expunge claims (1.2); review and analyze
comments regarding settlement agreements for J.
Fabry's and T. Jack's clients and revise same
(.7); create execution copy of settlement
agreement with Ledford's clients (.4).

Continued development of settlement strategy’
for PRP only sites; continued review of
background material regarding same.

12/03/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

2.00

12/03/07 K D Collins

12/03/07 T M Davis

g
©12/03/07 B J Faulkner

_ Preparation and participation in an event for

the Senate Hispanic Caucus; discussed TCEQ

.agenda for ASARCO permit with Chairman Garcia

and EA Womack; reported to P. Giblin.

11.00

Prepared for and participated in meeting to

‘discuss non-owned sites update and strategy.

Read El1 Paso order (.1); read and exchange
emails regarding settlements (.7); read B & L
comments {.7); review latest Taylor Springs
draft (.8); complete and circulate agenda for
call with States (1.3); exchange email and
telephone conference with G. Mack re same (.6);
review IBWC materials and discuss with T.
Aldrich and S. Janoe (1.3); review Arizona
Board authority memo and emails re same (.7);

‘telephone conference with A. Tenenbaum and M.
‘Gregory ‘regarding medlatlon (.4); review

revised memo re llablllty transfers (.5)};
review precedents re same (1. 3); telephone

) conference with D. Stelnway regarding Houston

(.3); call with T. Aldrlch S. Jance re IBWC
(.4); read proffers “for IBWC (1.2); telephone

;Vconfe nees. with.J. McCarroll and A. Tenenbaum
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12/03/07 R M Fontenla .60 Email with M. Gregory regarding Motion for
Order Approving Compromise and Settlement
Between ASARCO LLC and Various Governmental and
Private Party Entities Regarding the Silver Bow
Creek / Butte Superfund Site and Butte Mine,
file same via Electronic Case Filing System:
with the Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy
Court, email with Trumbull regarding service of
same (0.6).

12/03/07 P M Giblin .50 Continue work on TCEQ advocacy issues. )

12/03/07 M M Gregory 3.60 Review emails from A. Hooks and T. Davis
regarding environmental liability transfers
(.1); review new draft of memo (.3); email
comment regarding same to A. Hooks (.1);
exchange emails with A. Maclver.regarding=RutLe,
. W QL wdwsdiate Pasewqrde ) review ]
TQraft order (.3); exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same (.1); exchange emails with B.
Seitz regarding same {.1); telephone conference
with A. Tenenbaum regarding same (.1); email
current draft of Butte 9019 motion to him {.1});
compile signature pages for Butte settlement
agreement and email same to A. Tenenbaum and T.
Davis (.2); review email from T. Davis
regarding accounting for settlements (.1);
exchange emails with A. MacIver regarding Butte
settlement (.1); review signed supplement no.
23 to CMO (.1); email same to group (.1);
review email from S. McMillen regarding
environmental liability transfers (.1};
telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
SEMO settlement and CDM motion (.1); finalize
- Butte 9019 motion‘.(:3); ‘telephone conference
with T. Davis and A: Tenenbaum regarding same
(.1); telephone conference with A. MacIver and
exchange emails with her regarding same (:2)4" .
‘email ‘Butte 9019 motion. to R. Fontenla for
filing and service {.1); review notice of
filing (:1); ‘émail same to group (.1); email
sdame to D. Mills, R. Smith.and T. Davis (.1);
review-email from A. Tenenbaum with Butte
signature pages (.1); email to A. MacIver
regarding ‘same (.1); review notice of
procedures’regarding telephonic appearances at
12/6 hearing {.1); exchange emails regarding
same with M. Heister (.1}.
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direct testimony outlines (1.3).

12/03/07 S A McKithan 8.20 Work on revisions to IBWC exhibit list (1.5);
work on preparation of IBWC exhibits (3.3);
assist with distribution of IBWC exhibits to
other parties (0.5); work on preparation of
IBWC witness files (1.3); woxrk on logistics for
IBWC and East Helena hearings (0.5); assist
with preparation and filing of ASARCO LILC's
Reply Brief for IBWC (1.1).

12/03/07 S McMillen 4.00 Meet with ERM at ERM's Austin offices to
discuss valuation project and numerous issues
with respect to several sites (3); attention to

othexr valuation project issues sminiyhaniih

12/03/07 K M Mead . 2.50 Review Media preparation materials for CNN
interview on D. McAllister; teleconference with
client and B. Faulkner; prepare for call.

12/03/07 M G Paulson ) 9.70 Continue to draft Board authority memo for
’ ‘ ‘Arizona NRD settlement (1.00); communications

with client and consultant regarding same
(0.30); continue to draft Board authority memo
for New Mexico response cost and NRD settlement
(1.20); communications with client and
consultant regarding same (0.40); review Board
meeting minutes regarding environmental
discussions {(0.40); meeting with non-owned site
team to discuss action plan for remaining sites
{(1.00); continue to evaluate non-owned sites
{2.50); continue to negotiate Encycle and
Nueces Bay settlement agreements (0.50); review
materials.related to Colorado sites (2.40}.

12/03/07 D L Prince . . '5.40 Revise settlement status chart according to
‘ ) " comments by T. Davis {3.5); meet with S. Janoe
and M. Heister to plan for upcoming USIBWC
'‘hearing {.8); meé€t with'S: McKithan to
" coérdinate hearingilogi&tics (.3); correspond
- with M. McGovern:regarding new East Helena
. .exhibits and-update exhibit list (.4); continue :
assisting A. Schlesinger with East Helena
expert documents {.2); correspond with M.
McGovern and experts regarding proffers and
démonstratives (.2).
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12/03/07 J R Prince 1.60 Work on toxic tort claim resolution and
strategy {1.6).

12/03/07 J L Ross 4.40 Meeting with I. Kundawala regarding Mission
Mine reseaxch project (.2); review and respond
to email from J. Stemplewicz regaxrding site
visit to Mission (.2); email to R. Kern
regarding meeting on Wednesday with Indians
{.3); conference with D. McAllister, R. Kern
and J. Low regarding Mission meeting and
strategy regarding same (.5); prepare email to :
Mission Mine team transmitting Mission .
settlement agreement (.2); conference with J. .
Stemplewicz regarding issues related to
groundwater contamination release {.6); locate
and review CalGulch agreement for J.
Stemplewicz (.6); conference with G. Tsiolis
regarding strategy for meeting with Indians
(.5); prepare email to J. Stemplewicz (.4);
forward CalGulch settlement to him; email to M.
Neal regarding committee presence at meeting
(.4); prepare email to clients regarding status
of end of day Mission Mine discussions (.3);
prepare email to D. Baker regarding meeting on
Wednesday (.2} .

12/03/07 J B Seitz 3.50 Review and prepare comments for proposed ordé}
for E1 Paso settlement (0.4)f work on CDA
"documentation for 9019 motion (0.8); prepare
analysis involving estimation of owned sites
{1.7); telephone conferences with counsel for
the US (0.6).

12/03/07 D M Steinway ] 1.80 Review motion papers (0.3)}; telephone :
conference with consultant (0.4); telephone
conference with consultant again {0.4);
telephone conference with T. Davis (0. 2), work
on summary report ‘o 2); work on reply‘to
questlonwfrom T. Davis (0 .

"12/03/07 J A Williamson 3.80,

for review by B "Faulkner.
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12/04/07 O J Alaniz 3.70 Analyze toxic tort claimants' arguments
regarding publication notice, determine
publication notice of bar date, inspect various
newspapers containing publication notice (1.2);
review and coordinate with Trumbull regarding
filing of amended affidavit of publication of
bar date notice (.9); analyze arguments
regarding constructive notice and duty to
ascertain "known creditors" and follow-up with
C. Haynes, J. Prince, T. Davis and P. Holzer
regarding same (.9); review, revise and prepare
execution copies of settlement agreements with
J. Fabry's and T. Jacks' clients (.7).

12/04/07 J F Brown .20 Review documents for purpose of creating
chronologies.
12/04/07 S M Burgin 5.80 Continued to review background information on

PRP only sites; continued work on Colorado
School of Mines information; prepared draft
letter to attorney.

12/04/07 G J Byrd 4.00 Assisted with preparation of witness files for
USIBWC hearing.

12/04/07 B W Carey .30 Discussed creating a working file with K.
Collins.

12/04/07 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Preparation and participation in a strategic
teleconference concerning ASARCO permit

renewal; assisted in drafting of advocacy
' “w\\mm“hgpmponent of the call.

12/04/07 X D Collins 2.30 Reviewed and ahelyzed‘nonQéwned sites.

12/04/07 T M Davis '5.90 Numerous dlscus31ons with A. Tenenbaum, J.
Kinzie, M. Heister and S.. Janoe re continuing
IBWC (3.5); study and comment on plan terxmsheet
draft (1 33 exchange emails with M. Paulson re

12/04/07 S B Dorman 1.60 Contlnue worklng on contractor matters for East
Helena (.7); begin preparing privilege log for
East Helena (.4); revise and finalize interview
memoranda (.5).
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12/04/07 B J Faulkner 5.20

\}2/04/07 P M Giblin .70

A

Analyze and summarize ASARCO bankruptcy
proceeding as it relates to air permit renewal
(1.4); review of E1 Paso press related to
ASARCO permit renewal (0.5); conference calls
with P. Giblin and T. Casteneda to discuss
permit renewal efforts (0.9); review of
anti-ASARCO literature published by State
Senator E. Shapleigh to prepare for agenda
argument (1.7); begin review of Executive
Director's response to comments to prepare for
agenda argument (0.7).

Continue work on TCEQ permit issuance strategy.

12/04/07 M M Gregory 3.80

12/04/07 C J Haynes 6.00

Prepare CDM motion (1.0); telephone conference
with T. Klempel regarding same (.1); exchange
emails with T. Davis regarding Taylor Springs
stipulation (.1); prepare motion for approval
of same (2.0); exchange emails with S. Janoe
regarding environmental settlements (.2);
exchange emails with M. Paulsen regarding Globe
purchase and sale agreement (.1); locate same
(.1); review signed El1 Paso order (.1); email
same to group (.1).

Reviewing claimants' response to motion to
expunge (.6); email correspondence regarding
same and scheduling (.6); reviewing expert's
report attachments (.2); conference with J.
Prince and I. Kundawala regarding strategy
(.5); conference call with court and others
regarding scheduling (.2); conference call with
D. Reich regarding wmotion to expunge (.2);
reviewing issues regarding actual and

.constructive notice to purported class members

(.9);: reviewing proposed orders forwarded by

‘opponents - (.5) conference with D. Reich and

~other 'regarding proposed draft (.4); conference
rwith J. Prince and I. Kundawala regarding

istrategy on motion.to expunge and proposed

order +(.5); revising proposed order and email

.correspondence regarding same (1.0); conference
‘with J. Prince regarding same (.4).

12/04/07 M B Heister 8.30

Analyze the IBWC's reply brief and note key
arguments and potential responses (1.1};
analyze evidentiary issues regarding Arcadis
repoxt (.4); draft opening statement (1.9};
develop IBWC hearing strategy and brief S.
Janoe regarding key expert issues (2.5);
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Review and suggest edits to draft ASARCO motion
to retain environmental consultants (0.4), : i
phone call and email with T. Montoya related to
CNN visit to El Paso (0.6}; complete review of
TCEQ Executive Director's report to prepare i
for agenda arxguments (1.0); provide follow-up
materials on El Paso lead emissions to T.
Montoya for CNN (0.6).

12/05/07 B J Faulkner

-
12/05/07 R M Fontenla .20 Conference with 3. McKithan regarding
Electronic Filing System gquestions (0.2).

2.10 Telephone conference with S. Bergeron Perdue

r

12/05/07 P M Giblin

‘work on TCEQ permit issues.

12/05/07 M M Gregory 2.80 Telephone conference with T. Davis regarding f
CDM motion (.1); email same to T. Aldrich, T. H
Klempel, B. Faulkner and T. Davis (.1);
exchange emails regarding same with B. Faulkner
(.1); exchange emails with M. Heister regaxrding
postponement of hearing (.1); review email from
T. Davis with draft motion regarding IBWC
hearing (.1); mark comments thereon (.3); email
same to T. Davis and M. Heister {(.1); exchange
emails with S. McKithan and D. Prince regarding
certificate of service and review same (.2);
review email from T. Davis regarding custodial
trust issues (.1}; exchange emails with X.
Colling regarding BNSF settlement regarding
Everett and Tacoma sites (.1); review materials '
regarding status (.2); office conference with
T. Davis regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with T. Davis and K. Collins
regarding Everett settlement (.1); office
conference with T. Davis regarding Taylor
Springs stipulation (.1); telephone conference
with K: ‘Collins and S. Burgin: regarding motion S
ko disallow "(.1);:locate sample motion to

.disallow {.3); email same to K. Collins and S.
Burgin (.1); reyview email .from. S. Burgin
regarding signed El Paso settlement agreement
{-1}; locate same and email to her (.2);
teleplione eonferences with S. McKithan
régarding filing proffers’ (.2).

[
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12/05/07 S McMillen L 2.10 Participate in weekly standing teleconference
oo with T. Aldrich and ASARCO team and ERM team to
discuss valuation issues and deliverables with
respect to owned, non-operating properties
(1.2); address Lamping property issues and
other owned, non-operating properties valuation
. issues with D. Robbins and ERM team (0.9).

i .
<j§;;05/07 K M Mead .70 Analysis of CNN Interview with ASARCO and
preparation for same.

12/05/07 M G Paulson 4.20 Conference call with National Association of
Attorneys General regarding global settlement
(1.50) ; Tortime.lodraftEl=-Raso-tern-sheet:
«*0=70) ; continue to draft New Mexico term sheet
{(0.30); continue to address Colorado
non-scheduled site claims (2.00).

12/05/07 D L Prince 7.40 Call with S. Janoe and experts regarding
environmental claims (.5); review claim figures
and meet with S. Janoe to review same (3.3);
call with $§. Burgin and S. Janoe regarding
non-estimation claims (.3}; call with K.
Collins regarding East Helena hearing (.1);
coordinate service and filing of proffers and
exhibits for Bast Helena (1.4); prepare for
East Helena hearing (1.8).

12/05/07 E D Reeder 1.70 Draft and finalize letter to Berg Hill
: enclosing payment for copies for Colorado
School of Mines; update working files.

12/05/07 J L Ross 9.20 Attend meeting with J. Lapinsky regarding
strategy with the Indians (.4); attend meeting
with-Indians to discuss groundwater
contamination issue: (4.6); attend mine tour of
Mission with .Justice:Department attorney (3.9);
conference .with J. Gross regarding MRI claim
(.33 - . G

12/05/07 J C Stewart . - ;20;~:Receive’research‘instructions:from I. Kundawala
: (.2).%-
12/06/07 O J Alaniz .30 - Review comments fro@ T._Jacks and J. Fabry,
' make changes to agreements and email same to C.
Haynes.
12/06/07 S M Burgin 2.80 Continued background research on non-owned PRP

only sites.
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12/06/07 M E Burnett .30 Researched and obtained copy of orders issued
by the EPA for A. Maclver.

12/06/07 K D Collins 2.80 Prepared for and participated in pre-trial
conference for Band 3 site (2.0); reviewed and
analyzed non-owned sites (0.8).

- 12/06/07 S B Dorman .30 Continue working on contractor issues for East
Helena.

©12/06/07 B J Faulkner 8.30 Participate in El Paso team conference call
(0.8); conduct research on El Paso plant's
permitted lead emissions to prepare for

Protestant arguments (2.8}; collect background
information on International Boundary and Water
Commission (IBWC) claims against ASARCO (2.4);
draft a summary for ASARCO lobbyists (3.1). v

i R

12/06/07 M M Gregory 2.40 Review'pfbﬁgég;féffgaféélon regarding discount
rate motion (.1); telephone conference with M.
Blank of PBGC regarding discount rate motion
(.1); exchange emails with him and with T.
‘Davis regarding same (.4); review signed order
canceling IBWC hearing (.1); email to group
{(.1); review email from T. Davis regarding same
(.1); exchange emails with A. Tenenbaum
regarding same (.1); review email from M.
Heister regarding Barker settlements (.1);
telephone conference with $. Burgin regarding
Columbus site (.2); office conference with S.
Janoe regarding status of environmental
settlements (.1); work regarding environmental
settlement agreements and organize materials
regarding same (1.0).

12/06/07 J T Gross ’ 5.00 Update case files and indices (3.0); update
- expert materials tracking charts (1.0); '
. organize USIBWC Hearing Materials .to send to

relevant parties (1.0). ' '

12/06/07 C J Haymes ) .70: - Bddressing requests from company valuation
experts; (.2) email correspondence regarding
same(.2); revising settlement agreements (.3).

fanalyze IBWC 1

12/06/07 M B Heister 1.80 Update regarding IBWC issues (.4);f
1te in regarding to El Paso. permitting and
draft summary for use with discussions with 4
TCEQ (.6) ; R o e BT
RUgnesville settlement agreements and motions
and revise accordingly and forward for comments
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12/07/07 S M Burgin

12/07/07 B W Carey

Continued development of settlement strategy
for non-owned PRPs; continued review of
background documents; prepared summaries of
settlement information; worked on additional
PRP proof of claim information.

created a working file for all of K. Collins'
materials.

12/07/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

2.00

12/07/07 X D Collins

"12/07/07 T M Davis

12/07/07 S B Dorman

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
P. Giblin and B. Faulkner to discuss hearing
timeline and key components of an advocacy
information to complement current grassroots
effort.

4.50

3.10

Prepared for and participated in conference
with opposing counsel to discuss terms

settlement agreement for Band 2 site (0.7);
reviewed and analyzed non-owned sites (3.8).

Review custodial trust issues (.8); read emails
regarding same (.7); telephone conferences
regarding same with S. Janoe and T. Aldrich
(.7); draft emails to J. Lapinsky regarding

same (.8); review Everett settlement draft

{.7); telephone conferences regarding same with
S. Janoce and K. Collins (.3); conference call
with Port of Everett {(.5); discuss the same

with S. Janoe and M. Gregory (.3); study M.
Gregory's email {.3).

Continue work on contractor issues for East
Helena (.4); began drafting interview memoranda

. for East. Helena (2.2); worked with B. Hudson on
. shipment issues and chronologies for East

Helena (.5).

12/07/07 B J Faulkner

12/07/07 P M Giblin

. comments; on- permit renewal (1.4); conduct
. research .on -ASARCO's permlt history to prepare

Collect information on revisions to EPA lead,
standard (0.6); conference call with J. Hittexr
of ASARCO (0.8); review of state of New Mexico .-

for. permlt renewal effort (2. 1); wmeeting with
P. Giblin to discuss permlt renewal effort
(0.7); conference call with T. Aldrich, B.
Litle-and P. Giblin (0.9). :

Work with team members on commitments to TCEQ
in connection with draft permit.

7
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12/09/07 J S Janoe .50

12/09/07 J A Lowe 6.50
12/09/07 M P McGovern 16.20
12/09/07 D L Prince 7.30
12/10/07 S M Burgin 8.80
12/10/07 T M Davis 6.50

|

- precedents (.6}

Worked with T. Davis and A. Hooks regarding
preparation for Board meeting.

Assist in preparation for East Helena hearing.

Conduct meeting with expert and factual witness
and trial team to strategize and prepare for
BNSF hearing (6.0); meeting with Parent's
expert witness, Parents' counsel and C. Pfahl
to discuss factual and expert issues (0.8);
research 502 and related CERCLA issues (2.1);
revise C. Pfahl direct (1.3); work with experts
on revisions to direct (1.7); revise J. Norris
cross-examination and related research of
reports, technical data and deposition
transcript (4.4).

Assist with preparation for East Helena
hearing.

Continued development of settlement strategy
for non-owned PRPs; revised document setting
out proposed settlement information; telephone
conferences regarding same to Don Robbins;
prepared basis for estimated settlement
figures.

Email regarding Blue Tee/Tri-States (.3); email

regarding Basin questions with S. McMillen i
(.3); email to Board regarding custodial trust
issues (.3); read chart sent by A. Hooks and
send emails re same (.7); additional emails re
same (.8); exchange emails re Everett ({.4);
review Alix report and exchange emails re same

(.8) ;: review ERM report (.2); ERM call (1.3);
‘telephone conference with A. Hooks re same

(.2); email to J. Kinzie re same (.3); discuss
DOJ issugs.with S. Janoe (.3); study trust

12/10/07 B J Faulkner . «» -4.40

reementrel 0...{0.4) ;
updated El Paso permit renewal’aGVOcacy plan
(0.5); meet with K. Mead and T. Montoya to
develop strategy for advocacy to Congressman
Reyes -(3.1); prepared for upcoming El Paso trip
(0.4).
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ST T —— s G T T

12/10/07 P M Giblin .90 Work on document to be provided to TCEQ setting
out ASARCO commitments.

12/10/07 M M Gregory 2.80 Revise memo regarding Port of Everett
settlement and research regarding same {(1.0)};
exchange emails with S. Janoe and T. Davis
regarding same (.2); review emails from T.
Davis and S. Janoe regarding Tri-States
settlement (.1); review email from T. Davis
regarding Taylor Springs AOC order (.1); locate
order and email same to T. Aldrich, T. Davis
and B. Meginnes (.2); exchange emails with T.
Klempel regarding CDM motion (.1); exchange
emails with T. Aldrich regarding same (.1);
revigse chart regarding environmental
settlements (.3); revise CDM motion (.2); email
same to D. Baker and T. Davis (.1); exchange
emails with T. Davis and J. Prince regarding
Butte 9019 motion (.2); review emails from T.
Davis, T. Aldrich and S. Jano€é regarding
environmental settlements (.2).

12/10/07 J T Gross = 1.80 Update case files and indices.

12/10/07 C J Haynes 1.50 Attending weekly telephone status meeting (.7);
) email correspondence with I. Kundawala
regarding written discovery (.4); reviewing
documents from K. Ledford (.2}; email
correspondence with K. Ledford regarding
settlement prove up (.2).

12/10/07 M B Heister .10 Correspondence with consultants regarding
rescheduling of IBWC hearing (.1).

12/10/07 A M Hooks 4.20 Participated in conference call to discuss
assets and liabilities of subsidiaries; worked
on revision of chart of recommendations for
disposition of owned, non-operating sites;
reviewed )

: . ldrich and D.

Robbins regarding recommendations on owned,

" non‘operating sites; dontii “agsessment of
preliminary information Exom ERM and
participated in .conference call with T.
Aldrich, D. Robbins and ERM representatives to
discuss ERM report, terminology and
methodology; attention to strategy and factors
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Prepare opening statement for BNSF hearing and
related research (3.5); work on final pre-trial
review of examination outlines and other :
preparations for BNSF hearing (4.5); work as
lead counsel on behalf of Debtor at BNSF
hearing (5.0); work on follow-up review of

memorandum @RS

E_ (5.4).

Organize and index site materials and update i
case files (1.1); update expert materials
tracking charts {(0.6).

‘Teleconference with ERM and ASARCO team related
to owned, non-operating properties valuation i
project (1.0); begin to prepare data set for -
trust properties {.6); begin to develop chart
showing Bunker Hill Superfund site owned,
non-operating properties locations (.4).

12/10/07 M P McGovern 18.40
12/10/07 8 A McKithan 1.70
12/10/07 S McMillen 2.00
s
12/10/07 K M Mead 2.50

Compose on Reyes' staff request; letter to
Reyes' meeting with Congressman;
teleconference with T. Aldrich and B. Faulkner
on same.

12/10/07 M G Paulson 4.30
12/10/07 D L Prince 5.50
12/10/07 J R Prince .20
12/10/07 J L Ross 1.40 .

Continue to review non-owned site documentation
{(1.00); continue to draft Encycle and Nueces
Bay settlement agreements (0.50); continue to
evaluate PRP-only claims (1.00); conference
call with Colorado officials regarding
settlement of remaining claims (1.30);
attention to various owned sites in response to
DOJ's request for information under global
settlement process {0.50).

3P£ftiéigate in the East Hélena yards estimation
hearing.

Review of 'emails régarding environmental claims

‘Review.D. McAllister email regarding Mission
settlement agreement (.3);.respond to D.
McAllister regarding same (.5); respond to J.
"'Kinzie email regarding Mission (.2); prepare
email to J. Kinzie regarding Mission next steps
(.4}. -
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12/10/07 J B Seitz

12/11/07 S M Burgin

12/11/07 B W Carey

.60

Review materials from Hecla counsel (0.3); .
telephone conference with D. Dain regarding
settlement issues involving the CDA Box (0.4);
review and respond to emails regarding
settlement matters for various sites (0.5);
telephone conference on SEMO issues with S.
Woods (0.7); prepare draft discussion regarding
owned property estimation questions (0.5).

. Continued preparation. of table of information

for settlement of non-owned PRPs; continued
preparation of additional PRP sites.

Compiled documents related to the Buchan Mine

~at thg_request of E. Reeder.

T R

12/11/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

12/11/07 T M Davis

12/11/07 M L Farley

4.00

Preparation and participation in a strategy

-meeting with B. Faulkner; discussed, commented

and updated an advocacy plan for ASARCO permit
renewal; also, preparation and participation in
a meeting with TCEQ Commission staff.

Draft email to M. Paulson and S. Janoe re sites
(.6); study AOC choices memo (.5); telephone
conference with A. Tenenbaum and D. Dain
regarding mediation (.7); exchange numerous
emails regarding'site estimation and mediation
(2.1); telephone conference with J. Lapinsky
and email to A. Tenenbaum regarding trust list
(.6); Board call (1.1); call with M. Paulson,
S. Janoe and S. McMillen re sites (.5); read M.
Gregory emails re settlement (.3); respond to
questions re Order on Tri-States (.2}.

Review and revise interview memoranda (1.5).

12/11/07 B J Faulkner

Prepare for visit to El Paso plant (0.8);
conference call with K. Mead to.discuss ASARCO - :.
contact with Congressman:Reyes (0.6); review
progress reports of ASARCO consultant AD Zunkel
{2.:3) ;- draft E1 Paso status report for T. i
Casteneda (2.9);° rev1se El Paso status report
(1 1)

12/11/07 P M Giblin

Review informétion from team members regarding
latest El1 Paso issues.

g SRR
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12/11/07

D L Prince 8.00

”?éomﬁiigd'doéuméﬁts related to the Buchan Mine

Correspond with D. McSwigan regarding
stipulations (.2); update claims charts with
additional claim information (1.0); call with
M. Gregory to discuss second omnibus objection
draft (.2); begin revising second omnibus
objection (2.2); meet with S. Janoe to review
claims information {1.0); call with S. Janoe
and experts to discuss claims data (.9); review
experts®' claims summaries (2.5).

Listen to voice mail from J. Stemplewicz
regarding status with Mission (.2); prepare
email to J. Kinzie regarding same (.2); review
email from H. Richins regarding settlement
agreement with the Indians (.2); correspondence
with J. Gross regarding meetings in Phoenix
{.2); conference with J. Stemplewicz regarding
status of discussions with Interior, Indians
and Mission (.4); prepare email to clients
regarding conversation with J. Stemplewicz on
Mission (.4); meeting with I. Kundawala
regarding discovery on Mission (.4)}; revise
Mission settlement agreement (.7).

Telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
settlement matters (0.3); work on revised
materials relating to SEMO settlement (0.9);
telephone conference with C. Christensen (0.5).

Review motion papers.
Continued work on non-owned PRP settlement
strategy; continued work on PRPs at federal and

state sites.

Proviaed'electronic copy of filing and

" ‘complaint for A. MacIver.

at’ the request of E. Reeder.

12/11/07 J L Ross 2.70
12/11/07 J B Seitz 1.70
12/11/07 D M Steinway .10
12/12/07 S M Burgin 5.20
12/12/07 M E Burnett =~ .30
12/12/07 B W Carey .30
' i .
12/12/07

T A Castaneda Jr.

Preparation and participation in a strategy
teleconference concerning perpit renewal.
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12/12/07 S McMillen 1.10 Participate in standing owned, non-operating
properties valuation project teleconference
(0.7); attend to various owned, non-operating
properties valuation project matters (.4).

12/12/07 X M Mead 1.00 Teleconference on PeeWee meeting with Reyes'
. ) COS; debrief on this meeting.

12/12/07 M G Paulson 2.40 Attention to Encycle and Nueces Bay settlement
agreements (0.50}; continue to evaluate
PRP-only claims (1.20); exaluate=El.
Pasasrelated-elaims—=(0#50%; continue to
evaluate McFarland site (0.20).

12/12/07 D L Prince ) 7.70 Continue reviewing experts' claim summaries
(4.0); revise settlement chart (1.1);
coordinate procurement of materials for experts
(.6); continue reviewing and revising second
omnibus objection (1.3); forward PRP chart to
K. Collins and $. Burgin (.l); correspond with
D. McSwigan regarding stipulations (.1); gather
information to update the environmental service
list (.5).

12/12/07 J L Ross 5.20 Review email from D. Baker and email to D.

- Baker regarding Mission (.4); call to G.
Tsiolis regarding Mission settlement agreement
{.2); conference with H. Richins regarding
Mission stormwater control issues {.3); meeting
with H. Richins regarding stormwater control
issues (.5); prepare email to J. Kinzie
regarding MRI meeting (.2); review and respond
to emails regarding MRI meeting (.5); review
MRI proofs of claim and State of Montana proof
of claim (.3); conference with F. Rodriguez
regarding Mission expert reports (.3); prepare
‘email to T. Aldrichiregarding MRI meeting (.3);
conference with 6.’ Tsiolis regarding stormwater
contxol issues (.6); revise Mission settlement
agreement (.2); call with K. King, et al.
‘Yegarding: Gault Group report (1.4).

12/12/07 J B Seitz = - 3,50 Continue work on settlement issues relating to
o ‘environmental claims at several sites (1.1);
teléphone conferences with Doe Run counsel and
technical personnel regarding SEMO claims
(0.9); analyze respornse cost estimates for
specific sites (0.8); review and respond to
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12/12/07 D

12/13/07 S

M

M

Steinway

Burgin

1.70

emails regarding estimation of PRP claims
(0.7).

Review emails, review additional settlement
issues and then participate in telephone
conference (0.6); review email and send report
out to T. Aldrich and T. Davis (0.2); review
email (0.2); review email from S. Jordan (0.7).

Researched and develop straﬁegy summaries for
certain PRP only sites; research and summarize
settlement strategy for PRP claims at state and

_federal claim sites.

i

12/13/07 T

Nt

A

Castaneda Jr. 3.00

12/13/07 X
12/13/07 T

12/13/07 M

Collins

Davis

Farley

A wah‘*@r )

Preparation and participation in a permit
renewal strategy meeting with P. Giblin and B.
Faulkner; also, teleconference with TCEQ

Commission staff. .

6.50

ﬁ%ﬁv"“
J 12/13/07 B

12/13/07 P

\__

Faulkner

Giblin

- {5.8) .

Reviewed and analyzed non-owned sites (4.0);
revised summary memo (2.0); met with team to
discuss limits and strategy (0.5).

Read 9019 Motioms for Barker, Selby and Hecla
(2.3); call with H. Trice and J. McCarroll re

mediation (.4); review all site lists (1.8).

Attend to emails regarding discovery work plan.

Attend strategy meeting with P. Giblin & T.
Castaneda (0.7); conference calls with T.
Klempel and D. Zunkel to discuss ongoing work
at El Paso (1.2); draft, revise, and correct
whitepaper summarizing El Paso renewal effort

Prepared. for and participated in team meeting
to develop additional advocacy strategy for
permit.. :

12/13/07 M

Gregory

AR

2.30

RN, y s
Review email from M. Moedritzer regarding
Taylor Springs 9019 motion (.1); exchange
emails with D. Baker regarding CDM motion (.1};

-finalize same  (.1); review emails from D.

Prince, T. Davis and B. Seitz regarding El Paso
PRPs (.2); review email from D. Prince

regarding environmental service list and update

same (.2); exchange emails with D. Prince
regarding environmental stipulation relating to
conference call with Trumbull and review
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memoranda and distributed same for Board review
(.4); drafted response to ADEQ inquiries on
Hayden site (1.6).

12/13/07 I Kundawala 4.10 Continue research and analysis of notice and
hearing requirements for settlement of certain
toxic tort related claims and research into
related procedural issues (3.7); confer with C.
Haynes regarding issues related to settlement
of claims, evidentiary requirements and
research results (.4).

12/13/07 X K Linville 2.30 Continue preparing for witness interview.

12/13/07 A L Maclver 9.70 Revising the release in the Encycle Settlement
Agreement (.6); correspondence regarding the
same (.2); continuing drafting the dispositive
motion (8.9).

( 12/13/07 D R McDonald 1.20 Worked on El Paso permitting strategy and key
C- issues briefing.

12/13/07 M P McGovern 3.40 Read CERCLA 107/113 brief provided by DOJ that
relates to BNSF CERCLA argument for East Helena
site (0.9); work on analysis of draft
post-trial brief for BNSF hearing and several
key cases cited in brief (1.9); review redlined
settlement agreement for Selby site (0.6).

12/13/07 S A McKithan 3.30 Assist D. Prince with collection of proffers
’ and brief to send to expert (0.6); assist M.
Gregory with filing and service of Motion to
‘Authorize Retention of Camp Dresser McKee
(0.7); organize East Helena hearing materials
and update case files (2.0).

12/13/07 S McMillen L 2.1000 Complétedyénalysis and' preparation of a chart
' showing the owned, non-opérating properties in

Idaho and their relationship to the Bunker Hill
Superfund sité "Basin" and "Box" areas (1.2)§"
teleconféreénce with C. Pfahl regarding the
owﬁéd, non-operating properties in Idaho (.4);
teleqonféience with M. Zimmerman regarding
owned, non-operating properties valuation -
project modeling assumptions for certain
properties (.3); teleconference with D. Robbins
regarding questions as to certain remedial
obligations at certain owned, non-operating
properties (.2).
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re repositories (.4); email to T. Jackson re
Montana (.2); call with Colorado and DOJ (1.7);
follow-up call with S. Janoce (.3).

12/14/07 S B Dorman 4.90 Review, analysis, and revision of privilege log
relating to East Helena criminal investigation
(.6); continue working on interview memoranda
for East Helena (3.1}; continue working on
outstanding issues relating to East Helena
document production (1.2).

12/14/07 M L Farley 3.40 Review and revise interview memoranda (2.3);
begin preparation for interview of additional
former employees and review documents regarding
same (1.1).

12/14/07 B J Faulkner . 6.00 Meet with T. Castaneda to discuss advocacy
strategy (0.8); draft written summary of ASARCO
bankruptcy as it ‘reélates to permit renewal
(0:8); review of TCEQ's response to El Paso
County Attorney and conduct legal research
implications of the response (3.1); draft
written summary of the response for the El Paso .
advocacy team (0.6); conference call with T.
Montoya and P. Giblin to discuss the TCEQ
response (0.7).

12/14/07 P M Giblin 3.60 Telephone conference with TCEQ attorney
regarding enforcement issues; review response
to E1 Paso County Attorney's request for
criminal enforcement review and analyze impact
of same; telephone conference with T. Montoya
regarding strategy. . R

12/14/07 M M Gregory 1.70 Review email from T. Davis regarding San
‘Franc1sco sale ( 1), locate sale order and

to T. Davis, S. Janoce, T. Aldrich
and D Robb'ns ( 2Y; exchange emails with T.
Davis regardlng same (.1); email sale order to
M. Padllla, T. Dav1s and S. Janoe (.1}; rev1ew

'"emalis regardlng same from M. Padllla and T.
Davis o 1),,rev1ew emails from T. Davis
regardlng Port of Everett settlement (.1);

. d language regarding same (.2);

'telephone c nference with T. Davis regarding
same (- 1),vtelephone conference with D. Prince

}regardlng omnlbus ‘claim objectlons {(.4); review
email from B. “Faulkner regardlng El1 Paso air
permit renewal (.1); review email from B. Seitz
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12/14/07 K K Linville

12/14/07 A L Maclver

12/14/07 M P McGovern

12/14/07 S McMillen

11.00

email correspondence with S. Jordan regarding
new deadlines related to estimation matter
(.1).

Review and comment on the draft privilege log;
coordinate witness interview.

_Continuing drafting the dispositive motion and

creating exhibits.

Telephone call with T. Davis on settlement
agreement language issues for Selby site (0.2);
draft email to the claimants regarding proposed
changes by them to settlement agreement for
Selby site (0.5); review other related issues
and cost documentation for recent costs for
Selby site {(1.8); review revised post-trial
brief and comment (0.9); telephone conference
with S. Jordan and T. Jackson regarding draft
post-trial brief (0.6); telephone call with T.
Davis regarding East Helena issues (0.3).

Attend to several issues regarding the

valuation project for the owned, non-operating
properties, including several communications
with M. Zimmerman and D. Robbins concerning
factual questions on several owned,
non-operating properties (2).

12/14/07 K M Mead

Observation in response to TCEQ Cominial
Enforcement Declination.

12/14/07 M G Paulson

12/14/07 D L Prince .

Continue to evaluate PRP claims at all sites
(4.50); continue to evaluate repository sites
(0.30); continue to prepare for call on
Colorado. sites {2.50); conference call with
Colorado AG, EPA and DOJ regarding Colorado

- sites (1.50).

Begin r@viewing»élaims{charts in order to

- update disclosure. of enyironmental liabilities

(ﬂs); locate information regarding proffers and
correspond with F. Rodriguez regarding same
(1.0); draft email to C. Watson regarding

omnibus claims objections (.4); call with M.

Gregory regarding omnibus objections (.5); call
with R. Mulloy regarding omnibus objections
(.2); review and draft omnibus objections to
various environmental claims (4.1).
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12/14/07 J L Ross 3.10 Forward agreement related to Mission to G.
Tsiolis (.2); conference with D. Baker
regarding Mission settlement (.2); email to
client regarding D. Baker concerns relating to
settlement (.4); forward agreement to D. Baker
{(.2); revise Mission settlement agreement in
response to his comments (.8); conference with
J. Beck regarding MRI réclamation claim (.5);
prepare email to J. Prince and J. Kinzie
regarding MRI reclamation claim (.8).

12/14/07 J B Seitz 1.30 Telephone conference with S. Woods (0.2); work
on revised SEMO settlement materials (0.7);
prepare emalil correspondence regarding revised
SEMO settlement drafts (0.2); prepare email to
T. Creekmore regarding SEMO and Glover matters
(0.2).

12/14/07 D M Steinway 1.10 Review brief and make comments (0.6); work on
review of trust agreement (0.5).

12/14/07 V R Walker - .10 Assembled and organized billing for inclusion

’ in file.

12/15/07 T M Davis 4.60 Telephone conference with S. Janoe (.7); study
ERM reports (1.5); review estimate lists (1.1);
telephone conference with A. Tenenbaum (.8} ;
telephone conference with B. Litle and M.

" Paulson (.5). ' '
PSS ) ;

12/15/07 P M Giblin .80 Telephone conference with T. Aldrich regarding
El ‘Paso strategy; work on same.

12/15/07 T C Jackson 2.80 Work on proposed administrative order on
consent for Hayden facility. .

12/15/07 M P McGovern ©4.50 Work on drafting of areas of inquiry and

" ‘potential questions for State of Montana NRD
-expert withesses for potential upcoming '
depositions for East Helena site.

12/15/07 M G Paulson 2.20 >*Télephoﬁe-coﬁference with client regarding

Colorado sites (0.40); evaluated Colorado site

‘settlement options (1.00}; communication with

Colorado AG regarding additional documentation
supporting positions on Colorado sites (0.50);
continued to evaluate repository sites (0.30).
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12/15/07 J R Prince

12/16/07 T M Davis

12/16/07 T C Jackson

12/16/07 3 S Janoe

12/16/07 M P McGovern

12/17/07 S M Burgin

.60

3.20

Review and comment on draft settlement
agreement.

Review liability transfer materials (1.4).

Work on Iron Mountain settlement agreement
{0.9); work on Upper Blackfoot settlement
agreement (0.5); review revised draft of East
Helena brief and prepare comments regarding
same {(1.3).

Evaluated environmental liabilities of unowned
sites and repositor sites in connection with
global settlement discussions (1.8).

Continue work on preparations for potential
depositions of three NRD experts for State of
Montana for East Helena site.

Continue research on various sites to collect
information for global settlement discussions.

e ity

12/17/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

12/17/07 K D Collins

12/17/07 T M Davis

12/17/07 S B Dorman-.

©12/17/07 M L Farley

.60

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
TCEQ Commission staff to discuss various issues
relating to the setting ASARCO permit renewal;
reported to P. Giblin. ' o

Reviewed and analyzed owned sites, non-owned
sites, and prp claims.

Telephone conference with J. Prince regarding
MRI settlement (.2); telephone conference with
S. Janoce re estimates (.2); study ERM reports

(.9); call with J. Lapinsky et al. re El Paso
. {.5); read. Colorado materials (.7); call with

DOJ and Colorado (1.1); telephone conference

‘- with A. Hooks and review her emails regar@ingﬁ

property lists (.5); review emails regarding

. .8EMO. ‘and telephone conference with B. Seitz
~regarding same (.4); call with T. Aldrich, et

al. regarding Perth Amboy (.6); call with
Glencore regarding due diligence (.8).

Work on East Helena document production follow
up. items.and employee interview memoranda.

Confer_with K. Linville regarding additional
interviews (0.3); start reviewing outline
(0.3); interview additional former employee.
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< 12/17/07 P M Giblin 4.40

Continue work on TCEQ advocacy strategy for
issuance of air permit renewal. ’

12/17/07 M M Gregory

12/17/07 C J Haynes

12/17/07 A M Hooks

12/17/07 R B Hudson

12/17/07 T C Jackson

.90

Telephone conference with B. Seitz regarding
SEMO 9019 motion (.1); review email from him
with new drafts of SEMO settlement agreement
and 9019 motion (.2); review email from S.
Woods regarding SEMO settlement agreement (.1};
exchange emails with T. Davis and B. Seitz
‘regarding obtaining approval of SEMO settlement
documents (.2); review emails from B. Seitz
regarding Doe Run (.1); telephone conference
with D. Prince and review email from him
regarding omnibus claim objections (.2).

Attending telephone status meeting (.3);
revising Hayden settlement agreement and email
correspondence regarding same (.3)}; email
correspondence regarding documents from K.
Ledford (.2); drafting agreement with D. Reich
(.4).

Telephone consultation with M. Zimmerman
regarding preliminary results and proposed
conference call to discuss same; analyzed and
worked on development of suggestions for
dispositioﬁ of non-operating sites; telephone
consultation

regarding environmental liability
transfer options; participated in cal ¥

“, communications with ERM regarding status
of project.

Perform edits on privilege log (2.3); review
files to adéquately capture privilege
information {1.5); wmeet with X. Linville
regarding edits (.2).

Prepare comm ts on draft of supplemental brief o

1on O BNSF claJ.m at East Helena site

Joxrdan (1. 3), send emails to C. Pfahl re'ardlng
Tron-Mountain-and Upper. Blackfoot settlement
agreemencs,(o.4) telephorne conference w1th C.
Pfahl regarding same (0.3).; work on Iron
Mquntain settlement -agreement (0.8).
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12/17/07 J A Williamson 1.20 Reviewed TCEQ Chief Clerk's .files to obtain

copies!

L c—

12/18/07 S M Burgin 5.50 Continue to research and summarize settlement
strateqy for PRP' claims; develop background
informationr on claims for global settlement
discussions.

12/18/07 B W Carey .30 Updated the Resexrve site folders at the request
of. E. Reeder.

12/18/07 T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00 Preparation and participation in a strategy
meeting with T. Aldridge, P. Giblin, B.
Faulkner and other company officials to discus,
comment and update a detailed advocacy plan for
ASARCO permit remewal; also, preparation and

i participation in various teleconferences with

TCEQ Commission staff.

12/18/07 K D Collins .9.70 Reviewed and analyzed owned sites, non-owned
sites, and prp claims.

12/18/07 T M Davis " 6.20 Telephone conference with S. Janoe and K.
Collins regarding estimates (.3); exchange
emails with A. Hooks regarding various property
lists (.9); telephone conference with C. Pfahl
regarding Basin and forward D. Dain emails
{.4); telephone conference with S. Goodwin
regarding settlements (.5); telephone
conference with S. Jordan regarding Perth
Amboy, 502{e) (.2)}; conference call with A.
Tenenbaum and D. Dain regarding estimates (.3);
conference call with ERM (.8); conference with
M. Gregory regaxrding status.(.4); conference

. call- regarding Colorado. sites (.7); review and
. organlze materlals 1n preparatlon for mediation
(1.7):

12/18/07 S B Dorman 'f”igoo‘E:Rev1ew and" r¢v1se ‘privilége log relating to
S v e R Bagt Hel'na 'ocument prod' tion.

12/18/07 M L Fafleynru Pt R ey 51 a*Flnishlng rev1ewing outllne (0 4); interview
: : -additional, former: employe. (2.0) ; confer with

e L  {K Lan 1evregard1ng electron1c discovery work
) plan (0 .3).
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et A AR AR L
12/18/07 B J Faulkner 5.50 Prepare for and attend meeting with C. Pope, D.
McDonald, and P. Giblin to discuss El Paso
permit strategy (2.1); prepare for and attend
meeting with T. Aldrich, D. Robbins, and P.
Giblin to discuss El Paso pexmit strategy
(3.4). i

12/18/07 J G Foster .50 Attention to client response to vendor contract
and vendor scheduling (.30); conferred with K.
Linville regaxding same {.20). o i

12/18/07 P M Giblin 6.40 Prepare for and participate in meeting with T.
Aldrich and advocacy team members to discuss
: numerous issues associated with TCEQ permit
effort; work on action items resulting from
—‘\5‘5‘ : meeting.

12/18/07 M M Gregory .60 Review emails from S. Woods and B. Seitz
regarding SEMO settlement agreement (.1);
review limited objection to Tri-States/Quapaw
Tribe settlemept filed by Doe Run, Blue Tee and
Gold Fields (.2); exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same (.1}; email same to M. McGovern,
8. Jance, K. Collins, A. Tenenbaum and T. Davis X
(.1); office conference with T. Davis regarding H
PBGC's concerns regarding discount rate motion
(.1).

12/18/07 J T Gross 4.50 Update case files and indices (2.8); review and
index relevant site documents (0.8); update
expert materials tracking charts (1.0}.

12/18/07 C J Haynes .70 Email correspondence regarding agreement to
extend deadlines in consideration of Oklahoma
weather conditions (.2); conference with D.
Reich' regarding same {.2); email correspondence
with K. Lédford and Hayden attorneys (.2);
email correspondence with  opposing counsel re:
9019 motion (.1). . é

12/18/07 A M Hooks '5.80

A y ‘ aation of
e t: for ‘same; communications with ERM
‘regarding and- attention to status of valuation
of environmental issues associated with
non-operating sites; begin review of




Case 05-21207 Document 7420-11  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 1 of 79

BAKER BOTTS v.1r.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession ' Page 53
P B R e S =TT —— .
12/19/07 B J Faulkner 4.20 Prepare first draft of white paper on the

procedural status of El Paso permit renewal
application (2.2); participate in weekly team
conference call (0.3);participate in conference
call with L. Castor to discuss technical issues
at El1 Paso (0.6); draft a sample of TCEQ notice
language to describe upcoming agenda item &

\ (1.277

12/19/07 R M Fontenla .50 Email with M. Gregory regarding service of
order, email with Trumbull regarding same
(0.3); email with M. Gregory and M. Orfitelli
regarding Tri-States sexvice (0.2).

12/19/07 J G Foster .70 Revised vendor contract for hard drive imaging
(.40); conferred with vendor regarding imaging
project (.30).

12/19/07 P M Giblin 1.90 Work on documents summarizing procedural
history and issues involved in TCEQ permit
renewal; work on advocacy issues.

Review:-emails from T. Davis and B. Faulkner
regarding El Paso air permit renewal (.1);
Teview emarls trom A. TenenBaum and M. Heister
regarding Barker settlement (.1); exchange
emails with T. Davis and K. Franta regarding
hearing on Tri-States/Quapaw Tribe 9019 motion
(.2); review order setting hearing on same
(.1); email same to T. Davis, M. McGovern, S.
Janoe and K. Collins (.1); email to R. Fontenla
for service (.1); telephone conference with B.
Seitz regarding SEMO settlement (.1); email Doe
Run's limited objection to Tri-States/Quapaw
Tribe settlement to him (.1); telephone
conference with M. Blank of PBGC regardlng
discount rate motion (.1); email to T. Davis
regarding.same“(.l).

12/19/07 M M Gregory 1.10

12/19/07 C J Haynes ©1.60 Draftlng and rev131ng template affidavits for
’ minox prove up in conjunctlon with I. Kundawala
{1.0); email correspondence regarding same
{.4); email correspondence regarding Hayden
settlement (.2).
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=
12/20/07 B J Faulkner

2.70

12/20/07 J G Foster

R e S e ST

Conduct research on procedural questions before
the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
related to the El Paso permit renewal
proceeding.

Reviewed revised draft agreement and worked
with vendor regarding project scheduling (.40).

12/20/07 P M Giblin

Continue work on advocacy documents for
presentation to TCEQ. i

12/20/07 M M Gregory

12/20/07 J T Gross

12/20/07 A M Hooks

12/20/07 T C Jackson

2.40

3.50

Exchange emails with D. Prince regarding Taylor
Springs settlement (.1); review materials
regarding same {.2); telephone conference with
D. Prince regarding same (.1); review materials
from S. Jance and M. Moedritzer regarding
Tri-States settlement with Blue Tee and Gold
Fields (.2); emails to T. Davis, S. Janoe and
M. McGovern regarding same {(.2); exchange
emails with T. Davis regarding same (.1);
exchange emails with M. McGovern regarding same
(.1); telephone conference with P. Ruh
regarding same (.1); leave phone mail message
for T. Aldrich regarding same (.1); review
emails from D. Prince and T. Davis regarding
Taylor Springs (.1); review emails from T.
Davis and M. Padilla regarding Selby settlement
(.1); revise chart regarding environmental
settlements (.4); review email from T. Aldrich
regarding Tri-States settlement with Blue Tee
and Gold Fields {(.1}; exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same {(.1l); review new drafts of
Selby settlement agreement and 9019 motion
(.3); email to M. McGovern regarding same (.1).

Update case files and indices (2.3); review and
index relevant site documents (0.5); update
expert materials tracking charts (0.8).

Analyzed issues regarding use of custodial
trust; communications with M. Zimmerman and T.
Aldrich regarding and reviewed updated draft of
ERM findings.

Review issues with respect to government
revisions to Upper Blackfoot settlement
agreement in preparation for conference call
regarding same (2.3); send email to T. Davis
regarding same {(0.3); work on Iron Mountain
settlement agreement (0.5).
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1]

12/20/07 3 S Janoe 4.80 Reviewed draft of Hayden air sampling protocol
developed by consultants and worked with client
group regarding same (.9); worked on
environmental due diligence preparation (1.3});
continued work on owned/mnot operating site
analysis (1.1); worked with T. Davis regarding
settlement issues (.7); worked on Tri-States
settlement (.4); continued work on Hayden
notice letter (.4).

12/20/07 I Kundawala .10 Confer with C. Haynes and K. Ledford regarding
an inquiry abo&:/a toxic tort claim.

12/20/07 X K Linville 5.60 Begin drafting memorandum summarizing employee
interview (1.90); work on the identification of
documents related to the East Helena
investigation (3.40); work on electronic
discovery plan {0.30).

12/20/07 J A Lowe .30 Communicate with M. McGovern, D. Prince, and R.
for East Helena

_wﬁw" R R A S Fas R o P TR s Tt

12/20/07 D R McDonald .60 Worked on agenda posting for El Paso permit
consideration.

12/20/07 M P McGovern 3.10 Telephone call with P. Southworth of State
i Lands Commission regarding settlement agreement
apprxoval for Selby site (0.1); work on final
review of settlement agreement for Selby site
{0.8); draft motion to approve settlement
agreement for Selby site (1.9); draft emails
regarding same (0.3).

12/20/07 S A McKithan 3.60 Organize all expert reports and save to USB
drive (1.2); organize prior hearing materials
and send to file (1.3); update file indices and
expert materials-charts (1.1).

12/20/07 s McMilleh_ 1.00 Create environmental liability and cost
estimation back-up document at request of S.
ange for owned, non-operating properties
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12/20/07 M G Paulson

12/20/07 D L Prince

12/20/07 J L Ross

12/21/07 S M Burgin

Attention to Triumph mine settlement (0.30);
continue to draft Arizona and New Mexico
settlements agreements {2.30); -centinue.to
drafe-El-Paso_settlement-agreement~{1+00) ;
evaluate Stephenson Bennett and Blackhawk sites
(0.20); continue to evaluate Globe site (0.50};
prepare for Board meeting (1.00}; continue to
evaluate PRP claims at all sites (2.70).

Continue drafting estimation sites chart.

Conference with J. Stemplewicz regarding
meeting with the Indians (.2); forward email to
clients regarding Indian modifications to
agreements (.2); review Indian changes to the
settlement agreement (.9); prepare email to D.
Baker regarding agreement with Indians (.3).

Research arguments regarding Colorado School of
Mines; revise letter to attorney for Colorado
School of Mines.

o

12/21/07 T A Castaneda Jr.

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
TCEQ Commissioner staff; discussed issues
related to permit renewal.

12/21/07 K D Collins

12/21/07 T M Davis

12/21/07 S B Dorman

.30

MBI

Prepared for and participated in conference
call with opposing counsel to discuss issues at
non-owned sites (1.0); drafted summary
memorandum (0.3); reviewed and analyzed
non-owned sites issues (3.5); followed up on
outstanding issues related to draft Band 2
settlement agreement (0.3).

Exchange emaiIS;with J. Kinzie regarding term
sheets (.5); read revised:term sheet prepared
by M. Gregory (.5); discuss with M. Gregory
(.4); discuss status of mediation with S. Janoe
(- 4);’exchange ‘emails with A. Tenenbaum and

'_telep ne conference with A. Tenenbaum

1ng¥ dditional requests for information
(1.1); read 1nformatlon regardlng New Mexico
mines (.3); review revised bid motion (.4);

read draft motions regarding Hylebos (.9); read
comments on SEMO settlements submitted by Doe
Run (.8).

Work on East Helena criminal investigation
document production issues.
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Draft and revise written xeport on El Paso
permit renewal and applicable law for external
advocacy.

Work with C. Pope and other advocacy team
members on documents to be submitted to TCEQ.

12/21/07 M M Gregory 2.00 Review email from S. Janoe regarding Tri-States
settlement with Blue Tee and Gold Fields (.1);
finalize same (.1); email to K. Wilkirson for
filing and service {.1); review notice of }

" £iling (.1); email same to T. Davis, S. Janoe
and M. McGovern (.1); email same to D. Mills,
R. Smith and T. Davis (.1); revise
environmental settlements chart (.4); telephone
conference with S. Janoe regarding motion to
disallow claims (.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis and with M. McGovern regarding Selby
settlement (.2); telephone conference with M.
McGovern regarding same (.1); exchange emails
with T. Davis and D. Prince regarding Taylor
Springs settlement (.1); telephone conference
with D. Prince regarding same (.1); review
email from C. Haynes regarding status of toxic
tort settlement (.1); review email from D.
Prince with new drafts of charts regarding
status of environmental claims (.3).

12/21/07 J T Gross 1.00 Update case files and indices (0.8); update
expert materials tracking charts (0.3).

12/21/07 Cc g Haynes 1.20 Email correspondence with T. Jacks (.2);
reviewing materials from K. Ledford (.2);
conference with J. Fabry regarding settlement
(.1); conferences with I. Kundawala regarding’
same (.5); review of case regarding same (.2).

12/21/07 M B Heister .30 Analyze comments from Doe Run regarding SEMO
-settlement and forwaxd comments to B. Seitz.

12/21/07 A M Hooks 4.30 ted in diligence conference call wgigminy

© e

1 9 with M. Zimmerman
-on_draft memorandum
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12/21/07 T C Jackson 2.00 Telephone conference with B. Duffy regarding
Upper Blackfoot settlement agreement (0.4);
telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
same {(0.2); exchange emails regarding call with
governments to discuss Upper Blackfoot
settlement agreement (0.2); work on East Helena
brief (1.2).

12/21/07 J S Janoe 5.20 Worked on response to PRP claims under Atlantic
Research holding (.6); continued work on global
settlement analysis (1.3); reviewed summary
materials on owned site analysis (1.2);
teleconference with EPA regional counsel
regarding Hayden site listing (1.1); drafted
summary of and worked with client group on
response to same (1.0).

12/21/07 I Kundawala 5.90 Multiple phone and email correspondence with C.
Haynes  regarding research issues (.4);
correspondence with O. Alaniz regarding
research issue (.2); research and analysis of
issues related to certain environmental claims
(3.7); confer with C. Haynes regarding
preliminary results of such research (.3);
review correspondence from H. Delgado regaralng
settlement agreements (.4); prepare for
negotiation conference related to Mission Mine
claims (.5); review email correspondence from
J. Ross and G. Tsiolis regarding Mission Mine
discovery (.1); review and consider U.S.
revisions to proposed settlement agreement

(.3).

12/21/07 XK K Linville 4.90 Draft. memorandum summarizing witness interview
{4.70); review client documents {0.20).

12/21/07 D R McDonald 1.60 Worked on El Paso procedural options for
e .renewal. Co

artici ate :in Board of Dlrectors meeting by
epl R( 30) ; continue to draft settlement
agreements (3:00) ; contlnue to address PRP
clalms (4. 00), contlnue td evaluate Colorado
School of Mines claims (1,00); draft letter to
“counsel for School: regardlng supporting
documentation and legal issues (0.40).

12/21/07 M G Paulson o B
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12/21/07

12/21/07

12/21/07

12/21/07

12/21/07

D L Prince

J L Ross

J B Seitz

P K Strebeck

KE Wilkirson

.50

.70

Finish drafting estimation sites chart (7.8);
finish drafting disclosure statement chaxt
(1.8).

Review material from government and email G.
Tsiolis regarding documents produced by
government (.3); prepare memorandum to T.
Aldrich and J. Lapinsky regarding MRI
reclamation c¢laim (.9}.

Telephone conferences with counsel regaxrding
Doe Run and SEMO matters (1.1); analyze new
materials rxelating to CDA Box and response
costs (0.6); work on draft motioms for CDA Box
(0.8).

scamned and emailed recent Supreme Court case
to S. Burgin in pdf format.

Conference with M. Gregory regarding filing of
Motion for Approval (.2); file Motion for
Approval with the Southern District of Texas
Bankruptcy Couxt (.3); email same to Trumbull
Group for service (.2).

12/22/07

12/22/07

B J Faulkner

P M Giblin

Revise permit renewal report according to
suggestions from ASARCO lobbyist C. Pope.

Work with advocacy team members on TCEQ permit
renewal strategy.

12/22/07

12/24/07

12/24/07

M M Gregory

A M Hooks

I Kundawala

.20

Review email from B. Seitz regarding SEMO
settlement agreement and Doe Run's comments
regarding same (.1); xeview email from S.
Jordan reghrding toxic tort settlement (.1).

Worked on draft wmemorandum to T. Aldrich .

Continue resedarch aiid analysis of issues
related to withdrawal of certain claims (4.8});
review materials and prepare for Mission Mine
settlement negotiations in Tucson {1.1).

regarding information form meetings N
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12/24/07 J L Ross .40 Review memorandum to J. Lapinsky regarding
environmental law financial assurance
obligations.
12/24/07 J B Seitz 2.50 Continue work on revised motion papers

regarding site settlements.

12/26/07 T M Davis 4.50 Call with S§. Janoce, D. Dain and A. Tenenbaum re
sites (.9); work on site lists and draft email
re same (1.2); study BNSF brief and discuss
with 8. Janoe and T. Jackson (1.3); review plan
materials sent by M. Gregory (1.1).

12/26/07 M L Farley .20 Confer with counsel for current employee
regarding status of East Helena investigation
(0.2).
12/26/07 B J Faulkner : 1.60 Complete final revisions to permits renewal
o : report.
12/26/07 P M Giblin 3.20 Continue work on information to be provided to -

TCEQ supporting issuance of permit renewal;
work with team members on advocacy strategy.

12/26/07 M M Gregory .40 Review emails from P. Ruh and T. Davis
regarding Selby settlement (.2); telephone
conference with T. Davis regarding same (.1);
email to M. McGovern and T. Davis regarding
same (.1).

12/26/07 T C Jackson 4.90 Telephone conferences with T. Davis, M.
McGovern regarding draft of post-hearing brief
with respect to BNSF's claims concerning East
Helena site (0.6); review transcript of hearing
(3.1); review and revise draft brief (1.2).

- for- and .conducted teleconference with

‘counsel regarding analysis of unresolved

‘envitonmental ‘e¢Yaims (2:6)F worked on Hayden
NPL listing response (.7).

12/26/07 3 S Janoe

12/26/07 I Kundawala . 71.20 - Continmue research and analysis of various
“issues related to withdrawal of certain claims
and ancillary issues raised thexeby (2.4);
draft withdrawal form for J. Fabry (.3);
circulate email to C. Haynes and others with
research summary and proposed withdrawal form
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12/27/07 B J Faulkner 1.90 Meet with P. Giblin to discuss preparations for
Texas Commission on Enviroanmental Quality

(“TCEQ") consideration of ASARCO permit renewal
(0.9); conference call with T. Montoya to

discuss same (0.5); review letter from El Paso
County Attorney's office to TCEQ regarding
request for criminal enforcement.

12/27/07 J G Foster .50 Reviewed revised contract executed by vendor
and forwarded to K. Linville for client
signature (.30); attention to vendor scheduling
(.20).

o

12/27/07 P M Giblin 3.30 (E1l Paso) Review changes to permit renewal road k ) E
map and work on changes to same; communications
with team members regarding strategy.

12/27/07 M M Gregoxry 1.00 Exchange emails with M. Moedritzer regarding
Tri-States expert report (.1); email regarding %
same to T. Davis and M. McGovern (.1); review !
signed order approving Butte settlement (.1);
email same to T. Davis, S§. Janoe, A. MaclIver,

M. McGovern and D. Prince (.1); review email
from T. Davis regarding same (.1); email Butte
order to T. Aldrich, P. Ruh, A. Tenenbaum & T. |
Davis (.1l); revise environmental settlements i
chart (.4).

12/27/07 A M Hooks 1.80 Attention to ERM report issues; continued
review and comment on draft report language.

12/27/07 T C Jackson 3.10 Telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
' East Helena brief (0.2); revise draft of ;

supplemental brief in opposition to BNSF claim %

(2.9).

i2/27/07 J S Janoe 1.20 Continued work on Hayden NPL listing issues
(1.2).

12/27/07 I Kundawala 7.10 Review and prepare for meeting related to
: Mission Mine claims (.4); continue to review

bond-related information and prepare
supplemental summary for J. Ross regarding same ;
{.5); prepare for and participate in meeting
{via telephone) with J. Ross, D. McAllister, R.
Kern, J. Low, H. Richins, G. Tsiolis and T.
Aldrich (.8); prepare for and participate in
meeting (via telephone) regarding Mission Mine
settlement with J. Ross, D. McAllister, R.
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Kern, D. Baker, G. Tsiolis, J. Stemplewicz, J.
Jameson, B. Quinn, L. Barassi, M. Neal (5.4).

12/27/07 S A McKithan 1.20 Organize exhibits and other materials prepared
for USIBWC estimation hearing that was
continued (1.2).

12/27/07 M G Paulson 6.80 Continue to evaluate private party PRP claims
(4.80); continue to draft settlement agreements
(2.00).

12/27/07 J L Ross 10.10 Conference with D. Baker regarding strategy for

meeting with Indians (.3); conference with G.
Tsiolis regarding same (.3); conference with
clients regarding open issues in preparation
for meetings with Indians (T. Aldrich, D.
McAllister, R. Kern, J. Low and H. Richins)
(1.0); attend meeting with representatives of
government and Nation to discuss Mission
settlement (6.5}; review post-meeting list of
open issues and prepare chart showing
responsibility of various parties to draft
language for insertion into Mission settlement
agreement (2.0).

12/27/07 J B Seitz 1.30 Analyze comments from opposing counsel
regarding settlement materials and prepare
preliminary response to same.

12/28/07 M L Farley 2.30 Begin working on updated work plan (0.5);
attend to emails regarding request by counsel
for employee regarding additional interviews
(0.3); continue reviewing and revising
interview meémoranda (1.1); attend to emails’

 regarding electronic discovery (0.4).

12/28/07 B J Faulkner .60 ' Review TCEQ letter scheduling public
' con51derat10n of ASARCO permit renewal and
c1rcu1ate wrltten summary to team members

12/28/07 J G Foster .30 ' Revised’ vendor contract per client's request
: © - and forwarded” rev1sed contract to vendor for

rev1ew'and 31gnature (.30).
g R AT
12/28/07 P M Giblin 3.30 Review information from. TCEQ regarding posting

of ASARCO permit renewal; work with team
alhh¥ members on response to same; review issues

raised by City of El Paso.




Case 05-21207 Document 7420-11  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 15 of 79

BAKER BOTTS 1.1p.
ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession Page 67

12/29/07 P M Giblin .70 Work on response to City of El Paso litigation;

’ telephone conferences with Teresa Montoya L
regarding same.

12/29/07 Gregory .10 Review email from S. Jordan regarding toxic
tort claims.

12/29/07 Jackson 3.10 Work on revisions to East Helena brief.

e R R S5 .

12/30/07 Giblin .40 Conference with TCEQ staff regarding permit
renewal issues.

T e

12/30/07 Jackson 2.20 Work on revisions to East Helena brief.

12/30/07 MacIver .60 Reviewing J. Atwood's comments regarding the
Encycle Settlement Agreement (.4);
correspondence regarding the same (.2).

12/31/07 Davis 2.30 Call with A. Hooks and S. McMillen (.8); read

- and respond to M. Paulsen email re PRPs (.4);
read ERM report (1.1).

12/31/07 Foster .30 Conferxred with vendor regarding changes to
agreement and execution of same, and regarding
work scheduling (.30).

12/31/07 Gross .50  Organize and index expert reports for various
parties {(ASARCO LLC, ASARCO, Inc., and others).

12/31/07 Haynes .60  Attending weekly telephone status conference
(.4); email correspondence regarding mediation
of Tar Creek property damage claims and J.
Fabry settlement issues (.2).

12/31/07 | Hooks 3.90 Prepared for meetings m

h analyzed ERM draft materials
and statistical methods used; continued review
and comment on draft report.

12/31/07 Jackson 7.60 Revise draft of supplemental memorandum in

opposition to BNSF claim with respect to East
Helena site (4.3); draft findings of fact for
proposed administrative order on consent for
Hayden facility (1.8); review and revise draft
administrative order on counsent (1.2); review
and revise draft of settlement agreement for
¥ron Mountain site (0.3).
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076735.0113 Environmental Issues

Hours
01/01/08 K K Linville 1.
01/01/08 S McMillen 2.
01/02/08 S M Burgin
01/02/08 T M Davis 3.
01/02/08 T M Davis 1.10
01/02/08 B J Faulkner 4.20

Description

Review client documents related to the East
Helena site.

Review and analyze ERM draft valuation report
for the owned, non-operating sites (1.1);
review and analysis of American Society of
Testing and Materials standard for valuating
environmental liabilities at contaminated
properties in order to evaluate the ERM draft
valuation report (1.3).

Reviewed information on PRP negotiations
status.

Read emails and telephone conference with B.
Litle re Houston (.6); exchange emails with S.
Janoe re Hayden (.6); telephone conference with
S. Janoe re Global negotiations (.3); read J.
Ross memo re MRI and exchange emails with J.
Ross (1.5).

Study latest ERM report (.8); telephone
conference with S. Janoce re same (.3).

Revise TCEQ procedural status update in
response to comments from government relations
team (0.9) review comments from New Mexico
Environmental Department and “Get the Lead Out"®
Protestant organization to prepared for
arguments to TCEQ (1.2); view video recording -
of past ASARCO-related arguments before the
Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
(2.1).

2994
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01/02/08

Page 21 of 79

P M Giblin

Prepare for TCEQ agenda meeting at which
Commissioners will consider renewal of El Paso
permit.

01/02/08

o01/02/08

01/02/08

01/02/08

01/02/08

01/02/08

01/02/08

M M Gregory

C J Haynes

A M Hooks

J S Janoe

K K Linville

A L MacIver

M P McGovern

-40

1.50

“ Helena -site.

Review emails fxom T. Davis and A. MacIver
regarding Butte settlement and State of
Montana's claim (.2); review CMO in order to
address question from T. Davis (.1); email to
T. Davis, A. MacIvexr, D. Prince and M. McGovern
regarding same {.1); review email from T. Davis
regarding purchase and sale agreement (.1);
locate and email sample to T. Davis, D. Jauchen
and S. Crispin (.2); exchange emails with J.
Ross regarding Bankruptcy Code section

502 (e) (1) {B) issues (.1); locate case regarding
same for her (.3).

E-mail correspondence regarding mediation

- scheduling (.3); providing information to S.

Jance regarding Hayden settlement (.1).

Continued review and preparation of comments on
draft ERM report; attended meeting in FPhoenix

e
]

Worked on Taylor Springs site analysis (.2);
continued work on Hayden listing response
{3.7); prepared for and participated in
teleconferxence with M. Paulson and D. Prince
regarding strategy for addressing PRP claims
(1.1); worked on mediation for toxic tort
claims at Tar Creek site {.4).

Review client documents related to the East

: COrrespondence=regarding'the3Butté Settlement

Agreement and: ¥Yeclamation (.2); revising the
Arizona Settlement Agreement (.5); drafting the
New Mexico Settlement Agreement (1.7).

Work on' review and-editing of part of BNSF
post-trial brief dealing with section 502
disallowance defense for East Helena site
(1.5); review DoSe Run claims and pleadings for
Tri-State site {0.8); work on remaining NRD
claim issues for East Helena site (2.2}).
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01/03/08

01/03/08

“01/03/08

T M Davis

S B Dorman

M L Farley

1.20

.80

Conference call with ERM (.9); discuss ERM
modeling with S. Janoe (.3).

Work on East Helena grand jury subpoena related
matters.

Meet with S. Dorman and K. Linville on matter
status and continue working on updated work
plan (0.7); confer with T. Aldrich and A. Hooks
regarding same (0.4).

cignin

01/03/08

B J Faulkner

01/03/08

01/03/08

J G Foster

Participate in El Paso team conference call
(0:.9); update summary of Protestant comments on
ASARCO permit renewal (1.2); prepare outline of
final brief to TCEQ on ASARCO air permit
renewal (4.4).

P M Giblin

.40

Conferred with vendor regarding status of
signed contract (.20); conferred with K.
Linville regarding contract issues (.20).

4.90

01/03/08

01/03/08

01/03/08

01/03/08

M M Gregory

J T Gross

M B Heister

A M Hooks

Work with team members on strategy for briefs
and other documents to be supplied to TCEQ in
support of permit renewal; prepare for and

participate in team conference call to discuss

status and strategy.

.80

.50

.30

12.20

Exchange emails with D. Prince regarding
Bankruptcy Code section 502(e) (1) (B) cases
(.1); locate cases and related memo and email

Gordon with comments on SEMO settlement
agreement (.2). :

Organize and index expert reports for various
parties (ASARCO LLC, ASARCO, Inc., and others).

Correspondence regardihg Doe Run's proposed
changes to Barker and SEMO settlement
agreéments and EPA's response to Doe Run's
proposed changes.

Prepared’ for and participated in call with J.
Perazzo, F. Hiebert, M. Zimmerman and R.
McKeeman to discuss valuation methodology and
results; participated in environmental
diligence meetings with potential plan sponsor
in Phoenix.
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01/03/08 J L Ross

01/03/08 J B Seitz

01/03/08 D M Steinway

01/04/08 K D Collins

01/04/08 T M Davis

01/04/08 S B Dorman

4.70 Conference with J. Stemplewicz regarding open
issues in settlement (.5); conference with S.
Janoe regarding reclamation issue (.2);
conference with clients regarding Mission and
SAWRSA issues (1.3); prepare email to J.
Stemplewicz regarding schedule of meetings
(.3); revise Mission settlement (2.4).

3.60 Develop comments on recent proposals from DOJ
regardihg 9019 motion (0.9); analyze recent
motions and related cases regarding resolution
of PRP claims (1.6); telephone conferences
regarding CDA Box (0.6); review- possible—iFsUes
rega:dinngRFwe&aimsmatmETmPasOWTUTSTT‘

.20 Review emails (0.2).

4.30 Reviewed non-owned site files (2.5); reviewed
settlement agreements (1.8).

2.70 Discussion with D. Dain and A. Tenenbaum
 regarding DOJ trust. issues (1.4); telephone
conference with T. Aldrich regarding Houston
and E. Helena matter (.2); exchange emails with
S. Janoe regarding DOJ (.3); exchange emails
with .T. Aldrich regarding E. Helena (.2);
exchange emails with M. Paulson regarding New
Mexico (.3); exchange emails regarding B&L
settlement (.3).

1.20 Work on electronic discovery matters for East
Helena with X. Linville; analyze and review
documents relating to former and current
employees at East Helena.

01/04/08 B J Faulkner

.. R A R N T T e
6.40 -+ Conference-:call with K. Mead to discuss El Paso
' " permit- renewal effort (0.4); review City of El

01/04/08 R M Fontenla

- Paso documeﬁﬁé“obtained via open records
“redliest (079); begin drafting final brief to
TCEQ on ASARCO permit renewal (5.1).

.80 .Ema;iﬂ&i;h.I.,Kundawala'and E. Soderlund
 regarding.B. Tyler lawsuits, obtain order
. barring: Tyler-and forward to I. Kundawala
(0.5): conferences and emails with S. McKithan
‘regarding environmental invoicing sent to T.
Aldrich (0.3).
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01/04/08 J G Foster .80 Conferred with K. Linville regarding vendor
contract issues and imaging schedule and
details (.60); conferred with venrdor regarding

o status of execution of contract {.20).

01/04/08 P M Giblin 3.10 (El Paso) Work on TCEQ advocacy issues for
issuance of permit renewal for El Paso smelter.

01/04/08 C J Haynes .80 Conference with N. Schwartz regarding
settlement issues (.2); conference with D.
Bellovin regarding same (.2); conference with
A. Gray and D. Bellovin regarding probate
approval of settlement (.3); conference with I.
Kundawala regarding rebuttal expert report
(.1).

01/04/08 A M Hooks 3.80 Reviewed and analyzed preliminary site summary
information provided in connection with
assessment of non-operating sites;
communications with M. Zimmerman regarding
same; analyzed issues regarding additional :
requirements to address issues at Houston site; i
continued review of precedents for use of
custodial trust for environmentally impairxed

sites.
01/04/08 R B Hudson 6.10 Continue researching question regarding
7.‘5)-
01/04/08 T C Jackson 2.10 Prepare for and participate in conference call

with counsel for other parties to discuss Upper ;
Blackfoot settlement agreement (1.9); respond

to email from D. Prince regarding claims of NL

in connection with Cal Gulch site {0.2).

01/04/08 J S Janoe 4.60 Prepared for and participated in teleconference
. ' with EPA and ADEQ requlators regarding Hayden
site cleanup issues (2.5}); worked on due
diligence response strategy (1.4); worked on
Everett site settlement issues with counsel for } :
port (.2); worked on Houston. Federated site ' )
"analysis (.S5). ‘ :

01/04/08 I Kundawala 3.30 Review and respond to inquiry from C. Haynes
‘ (.1); review emails and attached claim
forwarded by D. Prince (.3); email summary of
claim to C. Haynes (.2); participate in !
conference call with C. Haynes, B. Belovin and
other counsel regarding settlement issues and
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01/04/08 K K Linville

01/04/08 A L MacIver

01/04/08 M P McGovern

01/04/08 S A McKithan

01/04/08 S McMillen

01/04/08 K M Mead

3.20

follow up regarding same (.4); conference with
J. Ross and J. Stemplewicz regarding extension
of deadline (.1}; conference with C. Haynes
regarding expert deadlines, review calendar of
deadlines and conference with S. Janoe
regarding case development issues with our
experts (.5); work on issues related to Mission
Mine bonds (1.4); email to B. Reece regarding
such bonds (.3).

Review client documents related to the East
Helena site (1.10); work on electronic
discovery (1.20).

Correspondence rxegarding the Encycle Settlement
Agreement (.3); contimuing-to=draftthe~
settlement agrEement = f o New MR S8 and 51
Pasexd{d8)~reviewing latest comments to the
Encycle Settlement Agreement for the telephone
conference (.5); telephone conference on the
Encycle Settlement Agreement ({.6); drafting the
stipulation to extend State's deadlines to
respond to the motion to disallow {.2).

Woxk on revisions to
post-trial brief for East
Helena site.

Organize and index site materials (1.0); update
case files (0.4); process vendor invoices for
payment (0.2).

Review, analyze, and comment on December
monthly status report for the Federated Metals
site in Houston, Texas (.4); perform analysis
and develop information regarding the estimate
for environmental liabilities and site cleanup
costs at the Federated Metals site in Houston,
Texas (1.8); prepare for due diligence meetings

Receive debrief on ASARCO application
© devélopments and permit renewal hearing before
TCEQ.
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01/06/08 R

M Fontenla .30

Review email from S. McKithan regarding
invoicing, email to R. Kern regarding same
(003 )

01/06/08 ®

M Giblin .30

Review communications from T. Montoya regarding
El Paso advocacy issues.

01/06/08 J

01/06/08 K

01/06/08 M

S Janoe .30

K Linville

P McGovern 6€.80

01/07/08 T

A Castaneda Jr. 3.00

01/07/08 T

Reviewed correspondence regarding PRP claims
analysis (.2); reviewed proposal for Cal Gulch
OU9 settlement language revisions (.1).

Review client documents related to the East
Helena site.

Begin drafting CERCLA )

] argument for BNSF
poét—trial brief and related case law research
and analysis.

Review and drafting of suggested comments
concerning

ORI, 21so, discussed

strategic options with P. Giblin, D. McDonald

-and. B. Faulkner.

M Davis

01/07/08 B

T
J Faulkner

01/07/08 O

Study Hayden and Houston issues (1.4};
telephone conference with B. Meginnes regarding
epare for call with ERM (.6).

Meet with T. Casteneda to discuss updates to
advocacy strategy (1.1); review draft op-ed

piece from Teresa Montoya (0.3); work on TCEQ
final brief (1.5).

G Foster .40

01/07/08 P

o
Received and reviewed executed contract from D.
Barker (.20); drafted email and forwarded
contract to R. Kern at ASARCO for review and

‘execution (.20).
- =

M Giblin

(E1l Paso) Work with team members on renewal ’

permit strategy.
EEaoewiiacenul

01/07/08 M

01/07/08 J

M Gregory .20

T Gross ~ 1.00

Review signed order apﬁ%b@ing-CbM motion {.1);
email same to T. Aldrich, T. Klempel and T.
Davis (.1): o )

Update casé files and indices.
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01/07/08 M P McGovern 9.50 Draft sections of BNSF post-trial brief
regardingw
) expert witness cost estimate Qb
b and revise and bolster other

sections of brief for East Helena site.

01/07/08 S A McKithan 3.20 Organize client site materials (0.6); update
site materials indices (0.8); update case files
(6.5); assist with preparation and filing of
Encycle Stlpulatlon (1.3).

' 01/07/08 S McMillen 8.50 Attend meetlngs at the Texas Copper Refinery,
on behalf of ASARCO corporate, GENENGEGMEND

01/07/08 K M Mead 1.00 Status report and review same.

'01/07/08 M G Paulson 3.30 Continue to draft settlement agreements (1.50);
: continue to negotiate settlements with private
party PRPs (1.80).

01/07/08 J L Ross 2.10 Prepare email to J. Stemplewicz regaxrding
meetings next week (possible) (.3); conference
with J. Beck regarding Mission (.2); conference
with S. Ruffato regarding MRI reclamation claim
(.5); prepare email to G. Tsiolis regarding
revised Mission agreement {.5); conference with
M. Neal regarding meetings (.4); prepare email
to client regarding same (.2).

01/07/08 J B Seitz _ 1.10 Additional telephone conferences regarding PRP
’ claims at certain sites (0.7); review recent
emails regarding pending settlement issues

“{o.a).
01/07/08 D M Steinway ' .30 Review emails regarding brief -and reply.
01/08/08 T M Davis : ©.7.70 . Study D. Prince's chart and call D. Prince

(-9);. rev1ew Doe Run and Hecla issues (.4);
revlew Upper Blackfoot issues and settlement
drafts (.7}; telephone conference with J. Tate
‘regarding Houston (.3); telephone conference
with A. Tenenbaum regarding language of sale
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agreement (.3}; telephone conference with B.
Seitz regarding Doe Run and Hecla (.3);
telephone conferences with J. Perazzo and R.
White regarding probabilistic modeling (.6);
conference call with S. Janoce and consultants
regarding modeling (.S5); discuss Hayden and
modeling with S. Janoe (:5); study ERM draft
report (.4); telephone conference with G. Mack
regarding sale process issues (.3); conference
call with A. MacIVer and others regarding
Hylebos (.5); discuss Houston site issues with
J. Lapinsky and T. Aldrich (.5); conference
call with L. McDowell and others regarding
claims (.4); review environmental claim numbers
(1.1).

Telephone conversation with ASARCO employee

relating to East Helena matters (.2); continue
working on electronic discovery plan issues for
East Helena (.4); conduct preliminary research

1nto bankruptcy dlschargeablllty issues (.5}.

Work on f1na1 TCEQ brlef m%

(El Paso) Work on brief to be submitted to TCEQ
and develop oral argument to be presented
supporting renewal of air permit.

01/08/08 S B Dorman 1.10
01./08/08 B J Faulkner 1.50
01/08/08 P M Giblin 4.40
01/08/08 M M Gregory 1.80
01/08/08 J T Gross 4.30
01/08/08 A M Hooks ' .30

Telephone conference with S. Doxman regarding
dischargeability of certain claims (.1); review
BNSF/East Helena post-trial brief from M.
McGovern and mark comments thereon (1.3);
review email from T. Davis regarding second
intercompany loan to ASARCO Master (.1); locate
motion regarding $ame (.1); email motion to T.
Aldrich, S. Janoe and T. Davis (.1); review
emails regarding same from T. Davis and T.
Aldrxich (.1).

Update case files and indices (2.3); update
expert méteriéls:traCking charts (0.5); assist
w1th draftlng of PRP clalm summary chart.

(1. 5). '

Analyzed updéted information regarding
Federated Metals/Houston site condition.
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01/08/08

01/08/08

01./08/08

o1/08/08

01/08/08

A McKithan

McMillen

G Paulson

L Prince

B Seitz

01/09/08

A Castaneda Jr.

7.50

1.00

3.80

01/09/08

M Davis

Organize and index Hayden site materials (0.4);
assist with updating claimant attorney contact
information on claims chart (0.5); update site
materials indices and case files (1.1).

Attend second round of due diligence meetings

.y (75

Continue to evaluate PRP claims (1.60); review
Motion for Approval of Procedures to Select a
Plan Sponsor and Plan Term Sheet in relation to
same (0.30); continue to draft settlement
agreements (1.50).

Prepare for and participate in call with L.
McDowell and T. Davis regarding claim
reconciliation (.3); call with T. Davis
regarding chart revisions (.1); revise charts
according to instructions from T. Davis (.6)}.

Develop discussion materials for DOJ and PRPs
regarding settlement matters (0.9); telephone
conferences with opposing counsel to address
disputed points and areas for possible
resolution (1.2); work on analysis of comments
form DOJ (0.9); review and prepare emails
regarding owned site estimation matters {(0.8).
'S _& o s
Preparation and participation in a strategy
discussion with P. Giblin and B. Faulkner in
light of City Council vote to keep ASARCO from
re-opening. a : :

o e T
Telephone conference with S. Janoe regarding

_Alton and other issues (.4); LECG status call

{.2); telephone conference with B. Seitz
regarding Hecla and the Basin {.3); telephone
conference with A. Tenenbaum regarding Upper
Blackfoot, Hayden and term sheet (.5); study
Hayden and Houston issues (1.1); study ERM
drafts (1.4); attend meeting of independent
committee (2.7); review charts (.5).

Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 34 of 79
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01/09/08 B J Faulkner 7.20 Draft sections of final brief to TCEQ on ASARCO

El Paso Permit renewal (5.4); meet with P.
Giblin and T. Casteneda to discuss permit
renewal strategy (1.1); conference call with K.
Mead to discuss potential ASARCO meeting with
Congressman S. Reyes (0.7).

01/09/08 J G Foster .40 Conferred with S. Dorman regarding client
availability for imaging project (.20);
contacted vendor to coordinate schedule (.20).

01/09/08 P M Giblin 2.70 (E1 Paso) Continue work on pilings and argument
to be presented to TCEQ for air permit renewal;

‘Mmk\-_~‘ prepare for meeting with City of El Paso.

01/09/08 M M Gregory .20 Exchange emails with O. Alaniz regarath
of environmental estimation proceedings.

01/09/08 J T Gross 3.50 Assist with drafting of PRP claim summary chart
(3.0); update case files and indices (0.5).

01/09/08 C J Haynes 1.40 Conference with B. Stipler regarding minor
prove up hearing (.3); working session with I.
Kundawala regarding settlements, 9019 motion,
minor prove-ups and Tar Creek property damage
experts (1.1).

01/09/08 A M Hooks 2.10 Telephone consultation with T. Aldrich
regarding evaluation of disposition options for
non-operating sites and issues regarding
funding of custodial trust vehicle; continued
review of draft consultant report on
non-operating sites.

01/09/08 T C Jackson 1.60 Telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
' Upper Blackfoot settlement issues (0.3); revise
Upper Blackfoot Settlement Agreement and
forward to B.” Duffy (0. 9), exchange emails with
B. Duffy and T. Davis regardlng various
) prov151ons in settlement agreement (0.4).

91/09/08 J S Janoe 5.40 Continued work on Hayden NPL listing issues
(2 S); contlnued work on Federated Metals claim
(. 9), worked orni environmental due diligence
matters with T. Aldrich and T. Davis (.5);
worked on East Helena settlement analysis (.7);
worked with L. McDowell regarding status of
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01/09/08 K M Mead .50 Advise on meet ing (TEGINANIENIENRE)
xegarding permit referrals.
01/09/08 M G Paulson 2.50 Continue to negotiate settlement of state and

federal claims (1.30}; continue to draft
settlement agreements related to same (1.20).

01/09/08 D L Prince 1.60 Review claims in response to questions from A.
Jepsen (.9); correspond with I. Kundawala and
L. McDowell regarding claims {.4); draft email
to L. McDowell containing information requested
during earlier call (.3).

01/09/08 J 1. Ross 4.00 Conference with G. Tsiolis regarding upcoming
conference call (.4); conference with D.
McAllister and team regarding same (.3);
participate in conference call with
representatives of the Nation and the
government regarding settlement agreement
(2.0); conference with D. Mchllister regarding
result of call (.4); review various emails
regarding Mission (.3); prepare email to D.
McAllister regarding call tomorrow (.3);
prepare email to group regarding our call (.3).

01/09/08 D M Steinway - .50 Telephone conference with consultant and then
T. Aldrich.
01/10/08 T M Davis 10.20 Read emails regarding Taylor Springs (.8); read

emails regarding Beckemeyer (.6); read emails
regarding Perth Amboy {.6); prepare for Boaxd
meeting (.5); attend Board meeting ({6.3};
telephone conference with J. Kinzie and A.
Tenenbaum regarding mediation (.3); discuss
site lists with S. Janoce and D. Prince (.5);
review emails and telephone conference with C.
] ] Haynes regarding toxic tort developments (.6).
e ) R SRR W,

f";1/1o/oa B J Faulkner 3.90 Meet with P. Giblin and T. Casteneda (1.0);
conference call with T. Montoya to discuss
public relations strategy prior to El Paso
permit decision at TCEQ (0.5); conference call
with K. Méad and P. Giblin (0.4); complete
initial draft of TCEQ brief (2.0).

01/10/08 P M Giblin - 6.60 - (Bl Paso ) Prepare for and meet with team
members on action items; met with TCEQ staff on

permit issues.
& o ; . RS
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01/10/08 I Kundawala

o1/10/08

01/10/08

o1/10/08

01/10/08

01/10/08

K K Linville

A L MacIver

M P McGovern

S A McKithan

S McMillen

3.70

Prepare for and participate in phone conference
with J. Ross, D. McAllister, G. Tsiolis and
others regarding status of Mission Mine
negotiations {.5}; work on matters related to
approval of settlement in Oklahoma federal
court (.8); confer with C. Haynes and T. Davis
regarxding same (.3); draft and revise order
conditionally modifying automatic stay (.4);
work on motion to approve toxic tort claim
settlements (1.7).

Review client documents related to the East
Helena site.

Continuing to draft and revise the dispositive
motion.

Work on final drafting and revisions to BNSF
post-trial brief and incorporate comments of
others for East Helena site.

Assist with preparation and filing of BNSF
post-trial brief (1.2); update case files
(0.3).

Conduct further analysis of potential costs to
remove waste and complete action at the
Federated Metals site in Houston, Texas (1.4):;
teleconferences with B. Litle and M. Zimmerman
discussing Federated metals issues (1.2);
communicate
regarding . P the data room

. {.4); begin
review and analysis of existing remediation,
custodial,-and environmental trusts in order to
"ascertain details such as administrative and

01/10/08 K M Mead

abarxying costs (1.0). . ¢

1”meeting cn_angréssmaan press release and GRO
réport. h T ) |

Teleconferences regarding TCEQ permit renewal
application and Reyes' staff request. for a

o

01/10/08

D L Prince

‘Meet with §. Janoe and T.' Davis regarding board

information package: (.5); begin.preparing
charts materials for information package (2.1).
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01/10/08 J L Ross 2.30 Revise memorandum on MRI reclamation issues
{.4); call from D. McAllister regarding Mission

issues (.2); participate in conference call
with clients on Mission (.9); review motion to
appoint an examiner (.3); email a copy to
opposing counsel on Mission case (.2);
conference with T. Dwyer regarding Ray Land
Exchange (.3}.

01/10/08 D M Steinway .10 Reply to email {0.1).

v

01/11/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 3.00 Preparation and participation in a meeting with

TCEQ Commissioner staff to discuss hearing
criteria and other key components of advocacy
concerning permit renewal; reported to P.
Giblin and B. Faulkner.

01/11/08 T M Davis 8.50 Study wmotion re examiner and research memoranda
regarding the same {1.2); conference call with
creditors regarding Hayden (.9); review ERM
draft page and discuss with S§. McMillen (.3);
study briefs on E. Helena (.4); work on Board
of Director analysis {1.6); Harbinger due
diligence call (2.1); discussion with T.
Aldrich, D. McAllister and S. Janoe regarding
Hayden (1.1); discussion with M. Paulson, S.
Janoe and M. Gregory regarding remaining
environmental claims (.5); discussion with M.
Gregory and A. Tenenbaum regarding various term
sheet issues (.4).

01/11/08 S B Dorman 2.60 Attend to electronic discovery issues relating
to East Helena (.7); telephone conference with
A. Hooks regarding bankruptcy discharge issues
(.6); telephone conference with M. Gregory
about bankruptcy liability and discharge issues
(.5); draft memorandum to A. Hooks relating to
research on dischargability issues {(.8).

01/11/08 B J Faulkner 5,90 Review draft settlement agreements related to
: El Paso and Encycle sites and provide comments
(0.6); participate in conference call with T.
Montoya to discuss public relations issues
(0.5); revise draft of final brief to the Texas
Commission on Environmental Quality (4.8).

.

01/11/08 J G Foster .30 Conferred with D. Barker to coordinate
date/time for meeting with clients to image
hard drives (.30).
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01/11/08 P M Giblin 8.70 (El Paso) Prepare for and participate in

meeting with ASARCO team members to plan
strategy for dealing with City of El Paso;
represent ASARCO at meeting with Mayor Cook and
Assistant City Attormey to discuss permit case.

01/11/08 M M Gregoxy 1.50 Review email from C. Sugg requesting copy of
Hayden smelter consent agreement (.1); locate
consent. agreement (.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same (.1); exchange emails with -
P. Ruh regarding same (.1); attention to phone

mail message from B. Megimmes regarding Taylox
Springs stipulation (.1); exchange emails with
T. Davis regarxrding same (.1); email to D. Dain,
A. Tenenbaum, M. Moedritzer, T. Davis and B.
Meginnes regarding same (.1); exchange emails
with T. Davis regardlng Upper Blackfoot
settlement agreement (.1); telephone conference
with T. Davis, S. Janoe, D. Prince and M.
Paulson regarding estimation (.3); telephone
conferences with S. Dorman regarding E. Helena
issues (.2); office conference with T. Davis
regarding same (.2). '

01/11/08 C J Haynes .50 Letter to J. Lapinsky regarding settlements
(.2); e-mail correspondernce regarding

settlements and 9012 motion (.3).

01/11/08 M B Heister .80 ddress Barker settlement issues arising out of

s blitlgatloﬁ to a551st in El1 Paso repermitting f#
\ efforts ( 2). F o

01/11/08 A M Hooks 4.90 Part1c1pated in diligence call —
: worked on issues
relating to potential establishment of
. custodial trust for certain owned,
non- operatlng sites, including analysis of
1ssues regarding structure and administrative
costs; call with T. Aldrich to discuss same;
various calls with M. Zimmerman (ERM) regarding
L " status of updated valuation report and begin
: review of revised draft.
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01/11/08 M G Paulson 2.00 Attention to Arizona NRD settlement agreement
{0.30); telephone conference with environmental
team regarding PRP claims (0.30); telephone
conference with T. Aldrich regarding Arizona
settlement (0.20); continue to negotiate
settlement of state and federal environmental
‘claims {1.20).

01/11/08 D L Prince 10.10 Update and revise settlement status chart
{5.3); begin drafting memorandum to the board
regarding the proposed global settlement (4.8).

01/21/08 J L Ross 2.50 €all to G. Tsiolis regarding Mission (:2); call
to D. McAllister regarding Mission progress
(.2); call to J. Stemplewicz regarding meetings
(.2); email and call to D. McAllister regaxding
how to proceed (.2); conference with B. Holland
and S. Ruffato regarding reclamation issues
related to MRI (.6); conference with T. Aldrich
regarding MRI claim (.3); prepare email to
parties regarding location of meetings next
week (.5); conference with D. McAllister
regarding his discussions with J. Ferrel and
Indians (.3). ’

01/11/08 J B Seitz.. 1.80 Conference calls with counsel regarding SEMO
and Glover smelter sites (0.9); develop
comments regarding draft materials from Doe Run
(0.4); review owned property matters relating
to the CDA Box (0.5).

01/12/08 T M Davis 4.60 Study UBMC emails and draft settlement
agreement (.98); review exclusivity motion (.7);
study ERM report and email comment {1.2); work
on term sheet analysis and environmental claim
charts (1.8).

—_—_ . "
01/12/08 B J Faulkner - 2.10 Add new .sections to draft of TCEQ brief.
T, P . . -
01/12/08 P M Giblin 2.50 (El Paso) Work on arguments to be presented to
: TCEQ at Commissioner's Agenda meeting on permit
caaomee ovenewall. oo L L - a
01/12/08 A M Hooks 1:80° Continued review and assessment of disposition

options. for .non-operating sites and review of

precedent - informationg NP

) review énd‘provided input on
draft report concerning non-operating sites.




Case 05-21207

BAKER BOTTS vir.

Document 7420-11  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession Page

Page 44 of 79

25

opL/12/08

01/12/08

01/12/08

01/12/08

0r/12/08

01/13/08

T C Jackson

J S Janoe

I Rundawala

S McMillen

D L Prince

T M Davis

.80

1.70

o1/13/08

B J Faulkner

Review proposed modifications to Cal Gulch
consent decree and prepare comments regarding
same.

Worked on board of directors presentation
materials {(1.1); worked with I. Kundawala
regarding toxic tort estimation experts (.2).

Continue working on motion approve settlement
of certain toxic tort claims (1.2); e-mail
correspondence with C. Haynes and $. Janoe
regarding revised motion and expert issues

(.2).

Continued evaluating environmental remediation

trust documents NN

with respect to many of the owned,
non-operating. properties held by ASARCO, LLC
and certain subsidiaries (.8).

Finish draft of board memorandum regarding
proposed global settlement and forward to T.
Davis and S. Janoce (.5); revise board
memorandum pexr comments from T. Davis (1.2).

Study charts re environmental claims (1.3);
telephone conferences with S. Janoe and D.
Prince re same (.3); exchange emails with M.
McGovern re E. Helena (.4); study Iron Mountain
settlement {.8).

Proofread, correct, and add citations to TCEQ

01/13/08

01/13/08

01/13/08

01/13/08

A M Hooks

T C Jackéon

J § Janoe

K K Linville

1.30

1.40

.80

Review client docum
Helena site.

brief. -

R

" “Continued review and analysis of and

preparation:of comments.on -draft consultant
report concerning non-operating sites.

.. Finalize draft -of Iron Mountain:settlement

agreement and forward to T. Davis- for review.

Continued work on Board of Directors materials
(1.2); reviewed:for: privilege documents

< réldting. te:Sacaton inspections {.2).

EE

8 ;élafed{tp the East
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01/13/08 S McMillen 2.30 Continue evaluating and compiling information
regaxding environmental remediation trusts
S - -
01/13/08 M G Paulson .50 Attention to Arizona settlement agreement.
01/13/08 D L Prince 2.40 Revise memorandum to the board regarding
proposed global settlement according to
additional comments from T. Davis.
01/13/08 J L Ross 3.10 Review G. Tsiolis revisions to Mission
settlement agreement (.2); prepare email to R.
Fontenla regaxding materials to send to S.
Ruffatto regarding MRI reclamation claim (.2);
revise Mission settlement agreement (2.7).
01/14/08 S M Burgin .40 Research and confirm basis for PRP Blue Tee

claim at Columbus, Ohio; transmit information

’ regarding same.
e R R s SR R
01/14/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 3.00 Preparation and participation in a strategy
meeting with P. Giblin and B. Faulkner;
discussed ASARCO TCEQ draft brief and
identified other key contacts relevant to
agency decision; also, discussion with B.
Faulkner concerning comments by L. Castor on
Senator Seliger.

01/24/08 T M Davis 6.80 Telephone conference with T. Aldrich regarding
E. Helena and Harbinger (.3); review facts
regarding Hylebos (.7); read emails regarding
charts and review draft charts (3.3); telephone
‘conference regarding charts and Alton with S.
Janoe (.3); call regarding Perth Amboy {.8);
‘discuss charts with D. Prince (.4); discuss
term sheet and changes with M. Gregory (.5);
teleph e conference with A. Tenenbaum

Alton q. 3), dlSCUSS Harbinger

1nformat10n requests. with D. Daln (.2)

—

01/14/08 B J Faulkner 5.60 Conduct legal research on TCEQ procedures for
permit revocation (1.8); meet with T. Castaneda

-t and P. Giblin {1.0); meet with C. Johnson, C.
Pope, and P. Giblin {(1.4); draft notes on
meetings {0.5); conference call with B. Litle
(6.3); conference call with L. Castor (0.2};
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ﬁﬁw‘ R ? e YT TR P
draft email to T. Klempel requesting techmnical
( information for use in TCEQ brief (0.4).

01/14/08 J G Foster .50 Attended to cooxrdination of hard drive imaging
project (.30); conferred with K. Linville
regarding signed vendor agreement and forwarded
to her (.20).

01/14/08 P M Giblin 5.60 Continue work on arguments to be presented to
TCEQ at hearing on February 13 regaxrding
renewal of El Paso air permit; prepare for and
.meet with advocacy team regarding same.

01/14/08 M M Gregory 1.30 Review emails from T. Davis and T. Jackson
regarding Upper Blackfoot agreement (.1);
review emails from T. Jackson regarding Xron
Mountain agreements (.1); mark comments on the
agreements and email same to T. Davis and T.
Jackson (.8); review order approving Tri-States
settlement with Blue Tee and Gold Fields (.1);
exchange emails with T. Davis with same (.1};
email oxder to T. Aldrich, S. Jance, M.
McGovern and T. Davis (.l}.

01/14/08 J T Gross .30 Update case files and indices.

01/14/08 C J Haynes 1.80 Attending weekly telephone status conference
{.6); xevising 9019 motion (.7); conference
with I. Kundawala regarding same and faxes from
N. Schwartz {.3); e-mail correspondence with N.
Schwartz (.2).

01/14/08 M B Heister .20 Make final changes to Barker settlement
agreement and motion and forward to government
parties for comments (.2).

01/14/08 A M Hooks ) 6.50 Reviewed and commenté& on draft xreport on
valuation of 49 owned, non-operating sites;
various telephone conferences with M.
. Zimmexrman, J. Perazzo, and R. McKeeman of ERM
regarding same; communications with T. Aldrich
regarding - same: { :
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the Texas Commission on Environmental Quality
for the Federated Metals site in Houston, Texas

(.3).

K M Mead

.50

TCEQ status call.‘ ’

01/14/08

01/14/08

01/14/08

01/14/08

o1/1a/08

01/14/08

01/15/08

01/15/08

M G Paulson

D L Prince

J L Ross

J B Seitz

D M Steinway

K E Wilkirson

K D Collins

T M Davis

.30

.80

.30

Attention to Arizona response cost and NRD
settlements.

Compare site characterization in global
settlement proposal to ASARCO characterization
(3.0); correspond with T. Davis, S. Janoce, M.
Paulson, and K. Collins regarding
characterizations (1.0); revise board
memorandum regarding proposed global settlement
accordingly (2.5).

Revise agreement on Mission Mine (.8); prepare
email to parties regarding locations of
meetings (.4); prepare email to J. Stemplewicz
regarding control of document drafting (.4);
conference with D. McAllister regarding same
(.3); conference with B. Cook regarding same
(.3).

Review comments from DOJ regarding SEMO (0.3};
telephone conference with D. Gordon to discuss
Glover and related matters (0.5).

Work on report and send out to client (0.3).

Review signature pages to Settlement Agreement
for I. Kundawala.

Discussed settlement agreement terms with PRP
and revised settlement agreement and 9019

motion.

Review ERM report (.9); telephone conference
with A. Hooks regarding same (.2); telephone
conference with A. Tenenbaum regarding term
sheet, exclusivity and site information (.3);
telephone cériference with S. Janoe and M.
McGovern regarding ‘Quapaw objection (.3);
telephpne'conference_with S. Janoe regarding
Hayden (.2); read emails and comments regarding
exclusivity motion (.8); review sale contract
and discuss with D. Jauchen and S. Crispin
(1.3); call with J. Lapinsky et al. regarding
trust administration estimates {.7); discuss
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the same with M. Gregory (.2); review various
versions of charts and discuss aspects of the
same with S. Janoe and D. Prince {1.8}.
e » _
01/15/08 B J Faulkner .70 Prepare for scheduled meeting with member of
Texas legislature.

01/15/08 P M Giblin 5.10 Continue analysis of arguments to be raised by
ASARCO permit opponents and prepare submittals

to TCEQ

01/15/08 M M Gregory .50 Exchange emails with T. Davis regarding
cbjections to Quapaw settlement {.1); exchange
emails with M. McGovern regarding same (.1);
locate objections to Quapaw settlement (.2);
review emails from K. Collins and T. Davis
‘regarding Everett settlement and 9019 motion

(.1).
01/15/08 J T Gross .30 Update case files and indices.
01/15/08 C J Haynes 1.90 E-mail correspoﬁdence regarding Arizona issues

{.3); telephone conference with N. Schwartz and
other attorneys regarding same {.3};
conferences with I. Kundawala regarding

- settlement issues and obtaining settlement
agreements (.4); e-mail correspondence
regarding settlements (.2}; reviewing
settlement issues (.7).

01/15/08 A M Hooks 4.20 Reviewed and provided input on revised draft of
environmental valuation report and
communications with M. Zimmerman regarding
same; prepared for and participated in call

with ASARCO representatives oD

ol

01/15/08 T C Jackson 2.10 Prepare for and participate in conference call
with counsel for other parties to discuss Upperxr
Blackfoot settlement agreement. V )

01/15/08 J S Janoe . #4.70.  Completed revised response letter regarding
Hayden site.(1.1); .continued work on board

materials {1.5); worked with K. Collins
regarding Washington state settlement materials

{.3); continued work on custodial trust
analysis {1.8).
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01/15/08 K E Wilkirson 3.60 Conference with I. Kundawala regarding
signature pages (.3); review signatures to

Settlement Agreement and Release for 1I.
Kundawala (3.3).

01/16/08 © J Alaniz 2.20 Review and determine agreements on toxic tort
settlements (1.4); conference calls with
opposing counsel regarding same (.2);
conferences and e-mails with I. Xundawala, C.
Haynes and K. Wilkirson regarding same (.6).

01/16/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00 Preparation and participation in a strategy
session conference call; also, preparation and
participation in a meeting with Senator Seliger
to discuss permit renewal of El Paso plant with
B. Faulkner and P. Giblin.

01/16/08 T M Davis 8.50 Telephone conference with S. Janoe regarding
Hayden issues (.2); telephone conference with
M. Lovett regarding environmental matters (.3);
read emails regarding BNSF issues (.3);
telephone conference with A. Tenenbaum
regarding site lists (.3); telephone conference
with C. Haynes regarding Oklahoma toxic tort
matters (.2); emails regarding Quapaw and
telephone conferences with M. McGovern
regarding the same (.3); preparation for IC
meeting (2.2); read Energy Solutions proposed
contract and emails regarding the same (.5);
review Cal Gulch draft consent decree
amendments (1.5); discuss the same with T.
Jackson {.3); telephone conference with J.
Kinzie regarding claim estimates (.3); attend
conference call with J. Lapinsky et al. (1.5);
conference call regarding Houston and Sacaton
with T. Aldrich et al. (.6).

01/16/08 M L Farley .30 Worked on issues related to AUSA interview
) e " L regquests i —
01/16/08 B J Faulkner . 6.50 Meet with P. Giblin and T. Castaneda to discuss

El paso advocacy strategy (1.1); participate in
El Paso team conference call (1.0); meet with
staff of member of Texas Legislature (1.4);
review of City statements on motion to revoke
ASARCO's El Paso pexrmit (0.3); prepare letters
in on El Paso permit renewal to offer to
supportive legislators (2.7).
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01/16/08 R M Fontenla .50 Emails with M. Gregory regarding Motion for
Order Approving Compromise and Settlement
Between ASARCO LLC and Various Governmental and
Private Party Entities Regarding the Selby
Smelter Site, file same via Electronic Case
Filing System with the Southern District of
Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with Trumbull
regarding service of same (0.5).

3

01/16/08 J G Foster .40 Conferred with imaging consultant regarding

details and arrangements for imaging project

01/16/08 P M Giblin 7.80 continue work with advocacy team members on key
issues, witnesses, exhibits and submittals for
TCEQ hearing; prepare for and participate in
s meeting with legislative staff member to obtain
“\N‘*_ legislative suppoxt.

01/16/08 M M Gregory 2.00 Review Everett settlement agreement and 9019

motion and mark comments thereon (.6); email
same to K. Collins and T. Davis (.1); review

email from K. Collins regarding same ({.1);
telephone conference with G. Nino regarding
Quapaw settlement and review email from him
regarding same (.2); email to T. Davis and M.
McGovern regarding same (.1); review email from
T. Davis regarding same (.1)}; exchange emails
with M. McGovern regarding Selby 9019 motion
{.1); finalize same (.3); email same to R.
Fontenla for filing and service (.1}; review
notice of filing (.1); email same to D. Mills,
R. Smith and T. Davis (.1); exchange emails
regarding same with M. Padilla (.1).

3

pl1/16/08 J T Gross .30 Updéte case files and indices.

01/16/08 C J Haynes . 1.40 . E-mail correspondence regarding settlements
(.5); conference with 0. Alaniz regarding
settlements (.1); conference with K. Ledford
regarding settlement issues (.3); conference
with /T. Davis regarding same (.1); reviewing
settlement issues (.6). '

01/16/08 M B Heister .40 Revise Barker settlement agreements and forward
to client for execution (.4).
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01/17/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 3.00 Review and comment on letters of support for
members of the El Paso delegation; also,
preparation and participation in a meeting with

“WQI.__A GSR-Andrade regarding exhibits for the hearing;
discussed with B. Faulkner.

01/17/08 K D Collins 2.30 Revised band 2 settlement agreements and
motions; reviewed documents related to Band 2
site hearing.

01/17/08 T M Davis 4.90 Telephone conference with D. Dain regarding
Hayden issues (.3); telephone conference with
S. Jance regarding the same (.3); rev:.ew~
agreement and discuss with S -

memo to Board fega%:lhéwsﬁbp‘emeﬁ'l

information on environmental issues (2.1);
conference call to discuss the Alton site (.4};
discuss Board memoranda with B. Seitz, M.
Gregory and S, Janoe (.4); additional telephone
conference with S. Janoe regarding Hayden (.3};
read and exchange emails regarding Isle
Terrible (.3}.

01/17/08 M L Farley .20 Continued working on AUSA interview requests.

01/17/08 B J Faulkner 1.30 Revised legislative letters and forwarded to T.
Montoya . (0.9); participated in conference call
with B, Litle to discuss development of an
}\‘¥ architectural rendering of the El Paso Plant
(0.4)-

01/17/08 R M Fontenla .50 = Emails with M. Gregory regarding scheduling
. -order, upload same and email with Trumbull
-xegarding sexrvice of same (0.5).

:Telephone conferences with advocacy team
- members on strategy; work on infoxrmation to-be
Lalhx;;iprov1ded to TCEQ and prepare oral argument.

01/17/08 M Giblin . a.90

01/17/08 M M Gregory T 280 . Review emails from T. Davis, M. McGovern and M.
. AR : Ccapdeville regarding East ‘Helena NRD hearing
{-2); exchange emails with M. McGovern and S.
-Smith regarding same (.1); email proposed order
regarding same to R. Fontenla for filing and
service (.1); review notice of filing (.1);
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01/18/08 T A Castaneda Jr.

01/18/08 K D Collins

01/18/08 T M Davis

1.00

C. Haynes and S. Jordan (.6).

Follow up with Senator Seliger's Office;
reported to B. Faulkner and P. Giblin.

Reviewed documents and drafted memorandum
related to Band 2 sites.

TEd SRR rente it Hs MY P PEFEPEIng
Pexas PDropeffi®s (.4); read emails regarding
term sheets (.6); read letter regarding Board
discussions (.5); participate in Upper
Blackfoot calls (.8); telephone conference with
J. Gracie regarding Utah properties (.2);
review materials sent by K. Ledford and
telephone conference with K. Ledford regarding
same {(.5); read Tri-States response to public
comments (.5); view and comment on Tri-States
pleading (.5); discuss trust sites with T.
Aldrich and A. Hooks (.3); read Houston memo
and discuss with S. McMillen (.5); read
comments to Box Settlement and discuss with B.
Seitz (.6); read stipulation regarding secured
claim and exchange emails with R. Mulloy (.4);
call with C. Haynes and S. Jordan (.4); read A.
Tenenbaum's comments to term sheet and discuss
with M. Gregory (.4); telephone conference with

01/18/08 P M Giblin

iR

Participate in conference calls with B. Litle
and T. Castaneda to arrange for a graphic
rendering of the El Paso Plant for use in TCEQ
permit proceeding (0.9); drafted a written
overview of the rendering project; conference
call with D. Cabe to discuss technical issues
related to TCEQ Agenda meeting (0.5); legal
research on proposed revisions to federal lead
air quality standard to prepare for TCEQ Agenda
con51derat10n {1.6)"

‘MWork on, arguments to be presented to TCEQ
.Commissioners at. hearlng, work on exhibits for

hearing and testimony from key speakers.

01/18/08 M M Gregory

.20

Review signed order rescheduling East Helena
NRD estimation hearing (.1); email to group
(.1y.
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o01/19/08 I

01/18/08 X

01/19/08 M

01/20/08 X

01/20/08 C

Kundawala

K

G

D

J

Linville

Paulson

Collins

Haynes

.80

-60

.20

PRI

01/21/08 T

A

Castaneda Jr. 4.00"

01/21/08 T

M

Davis

Revise motion to approve settlement per C.
Haynes® comments (.4); draft proposed order and
submit same to C. Haynes for review (.4).

Work on the identification of documents for
production to employee'’s counsel.

Continue to draft settlement agreements.

Drafted summary of litigation issues at Band 2
site.

E-mail correspondence regarding settlement

e Sty L SSUES (. 2] .

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
TCEQ Commissioner and Legislative Assistant;
discussed permit hearing, recent filings by the
City of E1 Paso concerning bankruptcy, response
briefs from the parties and reaction to plant
re-opening; reported to P. Giblin and B.
Faulkner.

Board call {1.3); telephone conference with T.
Aldrich regarding Hayden issues (.2); telephone
conference with S. Janoe regarding the same
(-2); study Houston letter (.8); call with B.
itle and S. Mchllen regardlng the same,

emails regarding the same (1.4).

o —

01/21/08 B

01/21/08 P

J

M

Faulkner

Giblin

3.20

4.30

Complete research on proposed revisions to
federal lead standard (1.4); conduct research

(0.6); add revisions to draft brief to TCEQ on

‘Bl Paso permit renewal (1.2).

‘El Paso: Prepare for and work on briefs to be
filed with TCEQ'regarding renewal of El Paso

01/21/08 M

M

Gregory

40

'Rev1ew'emalls from Tepuy 8P Giblin and B.

Smelter permlt

Faulkner regardlng City of El Paso_smmotlonm“

Davis™ regarclng‘toxlc tort claims (.1); review

_email’ from R. Mulloy regarding penalty claims
{.1y. ;
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term sheet (.6); exchange emails regarding plan
term sheet (.6).

01/22/08 M L Farley .40 Work on issues related to investigation and
meeting with AUSA (0.2); confer with T. Davis
regarding same (0.2).
—
fReview City of El Paso's request for relief
from bankruptcy stay and motion for continuance f
of administrative proceedings (0.7); '
| participate in conference call to discus;
ASARCO's responses (0.9); ] eet with P. G1b11n
and T. Caéianedé‘fbmdlscuss advocacy strategy
{(1.1); conference call with T. Montoya to
discuss El1 Paso advocacy (0.4); draft plan for
the development of a visual rendering of E1
Paso plant after startup (0.4); revise final
brief to TCEQ (1.2).

01/22/08 B J Faulkner 4.70

01/22/08 J G Foster .40 Reviewed emails regarding delay in hard drive
imaging due to travel issues and informed team
regarding same (.2); conferred with D. Barker
regarding status of project (.2).

-

01/22/08 P M Giblin 7.10 El Paso: Review motion for continuance filed by
City of El Paso and work on arguments refuting
same; continue advocacy strategy for issuance
of renewal permit by TCEQ Commissioners; work

wmummmwwﬂmWﬁﬂhh_»mnwk with team members on advocacy messages.

01/22/08 M M Gregory 3.80 Email to R. Mulloy regarding penalty claims
(.1) ;. locate materials regarding same (.3);
office conferences with T. Davis regarding
second amended petition regarding Oklahoma
toxic tort.claims (.3); telephone conference

with:-I.. Kufidawala: regarding same and exchange

emails with him (. 2); revise second amended

petition (.4); ‘email hew draft of same to K.

Ledford and T. Davis (.1); review City of El

S n for relief from stay (.3);

conference call regardlng same (.4); telephone
conferernice with T. Davis regarding limited
appearance in Oklahoma toxic tort suit (.1);
revise same (.3); review signed Selby
settlement agreement from ASARCO (.1); office

<-"S,onference with T. Davis regarding same (. 1)-

om sta N> :
regarding Barker/Doe Run settlement (.1).
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01/22/08 S A McKithan 2.50

01/22/08 D L Prince 4.90

01/22/08 E D Reeder .90

01/22/08 J L Ross 4.10

01/22/08 K E Wilkirson 1.50

01/23/08 O J Alaniz .10

Review Tri-State expert reports and respond to
request from K. Nash of Reed Smith regarding
same (0.4); review documents for East Helena
Grand Jury Subpoena matter (1.4); organize
client documents and update case files (0.7).

Call with T. Davis regarding chart covering all
proof of claim numbers (.1); begin drafting
chart covering all proof of claim numbers
(4.8). :

Organization and update of working files for
non-scheduled sites.

Conference call with Glencore regarding Mission
(1.7): conference call with D. McAllister and
clients regarding Mission (.4); call to J.
Stemplewicz regarding meetings on February 5
and need for presence of attorneys (.4); review
and revise confidentiality agreement related to
Gault Group report (.4); call to G. Tsiolis
regarding same (.3); review revised
confidentiality agreement (.2)}; prepare email
to lawyers for Yndians regarding
confidentiality (.4);
prepare email to J. Stemplewicz regarding
meetings on February 5 (.3).

Print signed releases and incorporate into
settlement agreement exhibits (.7); update
missing signature page list (.4}; numerous
emails and conferences with I. Kundawala
regarding settlement agreement signatures (.4).

Receive correspondence regarding signatures of
toxic tort claimants on settlement agreements.

— e

01/23/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 1.30

01/23/08 K D Collins .20

Preparation and participation in a conference

" 'call to discuss issues related to the TCEQ

permit hearing, the City's motion for
continuance,. and local matters concerning
restarting of the plant.

Discussed claims transferred from environmental
estimation proceeding to trade group.
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01/23/08 T M Davis 7.10 Telephone conference with A.. Tenenbaum
regarding Hayden and comments regarding the Box
(.6); read emails regarding Hayden (.3); read
emails regarding Oklahoma claims (.3);
telephone conference with K. Ledford regarding
hearing in Oklahoma (.3);(§elephone conference
with C. Mott regarding El Paso matters (.3);
exchange emails with M. McGovern and E. Albért
regarding Tri-States (.3); telephone conference
with M. McGovern, T. Creekmore and M.

ocedritzer regarding Quapaw settlement (.4);
tgleadings regarding E1 Paso (.5)} discuss plan
issues with J. Kinzie and M. Greégory (2.0);
<§glephone cqnference with P. Giblin regarding
El Paso (.33) elephqpe conference with C. Mott
regarding EIl Paso (.3)); read emails regarding
Grupo (.4); read Examiner emails and motions
and comment on same {1.1).

01/23/08 M L Farley .30 Develop plan for meeting with AUSA on East
L nglena investigation (0.3).
01/23/08 B J Faulkner 10.10. Revise final TCEQ brief and circulate to client

team (2.2); conduct legal research for support
of arguments in ASARCO response to City of El
Paso motion to continue administrative

proceedings (3.6); plan for and draft ASARCO
response.

01/23/08 R M Fontenla 1.10 Numerous conferences and emails with I.
Kundawala regarding toxic tort settlement
motion, revise exhibits, file same via
Electronic Case Filing System with the Southern
District of Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with
Trumbull regarding service of same (1.1).

01/23/08 R M Fontenla .80 Emails with M. Gregqry regérding Motion For
Order Authorizing Debtor. To Sell Real Property
In Knox County, Illinois, file same via
Electronic ‘Case Filing System with the Southern
District of Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with
Trumbuli'fegarding service of same (0.8).

01/23/08 P M Giblin 7.10 Continue meeting with team members to develop
response to City of El Paso's motion for
continuance and issues raised in renewal
application; prepare for and participate in
conference call with T. Aldrich and B. Litle to
develop strategy; work on action items.
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01/23/08 W L Swift 1.80 Worked on issues relating to the appropriate
regqulations to be applied to permit action.

01/23/08 K E Wilkirson 2.00 Review Settlement Agreement exhibits in
preparation for filing (1.7); conference and
emails with I. Kundawala regarding same (.3).

01/24/08 O J Alaniz .20 Review comments on settlement agreement with
toxic tort claimants and follow-up with I.
Kundawala.
01/24/08 S M Burgin .80 Begin to review environmental permits at
et — oo QRSLALING.LRCILILIES .

T g MR Ao mmer i
01/24/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00 Review of Asarco response to motion for e,
continuance; Also, review and strategic advise

on Asarco, Inc release and the proposed $27

i : million multi-settlement.
01/24/08 T M Davis .20 Discuss Hayden with D. Dain (.2).
e
01/24/08 B J Faulkner 12.10 Complete draft of ASARCO response to City of El

Paso motion to continue administrative
proceedings (5.4); proofread and revise
response (3.2); arrange for filing of response
(1.4); revise final TCEQ brief on permit
N\\‘h¥fenewal according to client feedback (2.1).

g,

01/24/08 R M Fontenla 1.30 Conferences and emails with I. Kundawala
regarding Second Stipulation and Agreed Order
Related to the Estimation of the Mission Mine
Claims; Scheduling New Dates for the Estimation
Proceeding and Related Hearings; and Setting
New Motion, Document Production and Related
‘Deadlines, email with L. Garza regarding same,
email with L.’ Garza and J. Ross regarding same
(0.7); email with M. Gregory regarding Motion
for Order Approving Compromise and Settlement
with The Doe Run Resources Company d/b/a The
Doe Run Company'Regardiﬁg the Barker
Hughesville (Block P) Mine Site, file same via
EYectronic Case Filing System with the Southern
District of Texas Bankruptcy Court, email with
Trumbull regarding service of same (0.6).

e

01/24/08 P M Giblin 5.10 El Paso: Finalize brief in opposition to City
of El Paso's motion for continuance; work on
additional arguments for brief in support of El
Paso Smelter permit renewal.

Y
Ry
X
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01/24/08 M P McGovern 1.50 Review additional proposed language to Quapaw
settlement agreement and proposed order of
approval by Doe Run, Blue Tee and Gold Fields
and comment {(1.0); telephone calls and emails
with G. Nipno regarding status (0.5).

01/24/08 S A McKithan 2.10 Review documents for East Helena Grand Jury
Afﬁﬁﬂﬁmmwﬂw»mmh Subpoena matter. .
7 2 o
‘\hiif24/08 K M Mead 1.50 provide recommendation on brief to TECQ; review
brief.

A

01/24/08 J L Ross 2.60 Conference with D. McAllister, J. Low and O.
Gonzalez regarding obtaining new royalty bonds
and need to discuss with St. Paul (.3); prepare
email to A. Rosenblatt regarding same (.2);
conference with A. Rosenblatt regarding bond
question (.3); prepare proposed response to
Mission Mine Glencore document request and
forward to client (.2); conference wich B. Cook
regarding issues related to el

] (.8); conference with
_G. Tsiolis regarding testifying expert issue
{.4); prepare email to D. McAllister regarding
confidentiality agreement regarding Mission
(.4); review and respond to email from J. Beck
regarding MRI Butte work (.3).

01/24/08 D M Steinway ) .60 Begin work on review of application (0.6}.

01/24/08 K E Wilkirson 2.90 Print discovery documents and organize into
files for I. Kundawala (2.4); contact help desk
in order to have disc copied (.2); mail
discovery cd to N. Brody (.1); draft letter to
N. Brody.regaxding Cole/Pitcher Claimant
discovery (.2). ‘

oo gy

01/24/08 J A Williamson 1.80 Filed Response to City of El Paso's Motion for
Coptinuance with TCEQ Chief Clerk; researched
and obtained standard exemption 111 in effect

qﬂ“%Mwé;hduring 1992 time period.

01/25/08 O J Alaniz .10 Attention to settlement agreements with toxic
tort .claimants. A

01/25/08 S M Burgin .80 .- Located background information on environmental
and operating permit transfers in Texas and

Oklahoma.
P
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01/25/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Review and comment on TCEQ brief; Also,
preparation and participation in a meeting with
~—— Commission staff; Reported to Giblin.
01/25/08 K A Clark 1.00 Brief discuss with M. Spearing concerning

research issues (0.1); researching NP

p—————————— T}

01/25/08 T M Davis 8.60 Process motion call (1.6); meet with S. Jordan
and M. Gregory regarding Perth Amboy (.4);
réview summary regarding U.S. Prepetition Trust
{.3); study emails regarding Perth Amboy (.6):
discuss permit pleading with B. Faulkner (.4);
discuss term sheet with M. Gregory (.7};
telephone conference with T. aldrich regarding
El pPaso (.2); telephone conference with S.
Janoe and D. Dain regarding Hayden (.4); call
with J. Lapinsky et al. regarding Hayden (-6);
study emails regarding El Paso and telephone
conference with P. Giblin (1.1); study El Paso
issues (.9); study status of settlement (1.1);
telephone conference with T. Fischer regarding

d Perth Amboy (.3).

01/25/08 S B Doxrman .60 Begin reviewing documents relating to East
Helena grand jury proceedings.

01/25/08 M L Farley .20 Work on issues related to electronic document
project for grand jury subpoena response.

01/25/08 B J Faulkner 7.90 Complete revisions to final TCEQ brief on
permlt renewal (2.8); proofread and correct
TCEQ brief (2.3); prepare TCEQ brief for filing
and circulate final version to client team

(1. 6); review Protestant briefs and circulate
_to cllent team (1. 2).

01/25/08 J G Foster ) ' .30 fCouferred w1th S Dorman and with forensic
consultant regardlng 1mag1ng project status

01/25/08 P M Giblin 5.70 . E1 Paso: Finalize ASERCO brief reporting permit
renewal; review briefs filed by City of El
‘Paso, TCEQ Bxecutive Director and TCEQ Public
Intexest Counsel; work on possible responses to
briefs of other parties; work with team members
on development of arguments to be presented to
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01/25/08 M M Gregory 1.60 Review emails from T. Davis and M. McGovern

regarding Quapaw settlement (.1); review emails
from T. Davis and M. Paulson regarding motion
for estimation of PRP claims (.1); exchange
emails with A. MacIver regarding same (.1);
review emails from M. Moedritzer regarding
Taylor Springs stipulation (.1); telephone
conference with T. Davis regarding same (.1);
email regarding same to M. Moedritzer, D. Dain,
A. Tenenbaum and T. Davis (.2);{telephone
conference with B. Faulkner reggrding El Paso
motion for relief from stay (.;2} telephone
conference with T. Davis regarding motion for
estimation of PRP claims (.2); telephone
conference with D. Prince regarding same (.1);
exchange emails with D. Prince regarding same
{.1); review charts from him regarding PRP
claims (.3).

01/25/08 J§ T Gross 3.50 Review documents for East Helena Grand Jury
Subpoena matter.

01/25/08 C J Haynes .60 E-mail corxrespondence regarding mediation
scheduling (.4}; telephone conference with I.
Kundawala regarding same {.2).

01/25/08 A M Hooks 7.80 Attended meetings at ASARCO offices in Phoenix
with T. Aldrich and D. Robbins and
representatives

P; and meeting with T.
Aldrich to discuss carrying costs for custodial
trust.

01/25/08 T C Jackson 2.30 Send email to C. Pfahl reéarding Upper
Blackfoot settlement issues (0.2); prepare for
~a participate in coﬁﬁgrgnce call with counsel
for other parties regarding Upper Blackfoot
Settlement agreement (2.1).

01/25/08 J S Janoe 6.00 Prepaxed for and participated in teleconference
with'cliént group regarding'path forward for
execution of AOC for Hayden site and bankruptcy
procedures for same- (2.5); worked on response
to EPA position on lead cleanup levels at
Hayden site (.7); worked on permit transfer
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project for owned/operating properties (.4);
worked on toxic tort mediation (.3); worked on
briefing of BNSF claims at East Helena (.4);
prepared for and participated in teleconference
with prospective trust candidates (1.4);
reviewed draft of Quapaw settlement (.3).

01/25/08 I Kundawala 4.80 Confer with C. Haynes regarding mediation
strategy and related developments (.4);
attention to e-mail correspondence related to
Mission Mine confidentiality agreement (.2} ;
confer with S. Jordan and K. Franta regarding
mediation preparation {.3); continue review and
congideration of discovery and other materials
produced by various property damage claimants
(2.1); work on preparation for property damage
mediation (1.6); attention to rescheduling of
mediation {.2). )

01/25/08 D R McDonald 1.70 Work on El Paso air permit renewal briefs and
issues.

01/25/08 M P McGovern 3.50 Work on analysis of new proposed language
issues for Quapaw settlement agreement (0.5);
draft and review emails regarding resolution of
same issue (0.4); revise settlement agreement
and proposed order (1.5); telephone calls with
G. Nino regarding revisions to settlement
agreement and proposed order (0.5); draft and
review emails with G. Nino regarding revisions
and process for finalization and approval of
pleadings (0.6},

01/25/08 S A McKithan 2.00 Rev1ew documents for East Helena Grand Jury
Subpoena matter (1. l)ﬁ'organzzed client site
materlals and updated_case files (0.9).

01/25/08 D L Prince 2,70 Continue drafting chart coverlng all
env1ronmenta1 POCs .

01/25/08 J L Ross . 3.00 Rev1ew ema11 regardlng royalty calculation from
’ g Low ( 2),'respond to G. Tsiolis email

regardlng dlécovery and X. Kxng/J Beck
presentation (.5); prepare email to D.
.McAllister, O. Gonzdlez and J. Low xegarding
status of‘st Paul” discus sion regarding bonds
(. 2), review emalls from J..Jantzen and B. Cook
regaxding  changes

agreement {.3); revise

confi entlalltybagreement (1.3); prepare email
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01/25/08 J B Seitz

01/25/08 J C Stewart

01/25/08 X E Wilkirson

1.50

.20

3.90

to J. Jantzen and Indian parties regardin
confideni i i i ty ag reement~

(-3); prepare email to clients
regarding same {.2).

Review and respond to emails with DOJ attorneys
regarding SEMO sites (0.4); woxk on motion
papers (1.1).

Give instructions to K. Wilkirson regarding
motion for leave to file late claims (.2).

Print discovery documents for I. Kundawala
{2.5); contact Medleh Group for bates label
project (.3); pull cases from Westlaw for J.
stewart (.8); emails with J. Berger regarding
duplication of discovery cds (.3).

01/25/08 J A Williamson

1.20

01/26/08 T M Davis

01/26/08 J C Stewart

Filed Brief in Support of Renewal of Air Permit
with TCEQ Chief Clerxk.

Conference with M. Gregory regarding term sheet
(.3); work on term sheet (.4); study Examiner
motion and note comments (.5); telephone
conference with J. Kinzie regarding term sheet
{(.3); continue to work with M. Gregory on term
sheet (.8); review Notice of Filing for Butte
settlement (.3); review S. Jordan's materials
regarding Perth Amboy and draft email re same
(.9); review and comment on purchase and sale
agreement (.8); read Doe Run's comments to SEMO
Settlement Agreement (.6); read emails re
Examiner (.5).

Read and review motion for leave to file proofs
of claim: by Cole/Picher and Evans/Quapaw
claimants (.4); begin cite checks of same
motion. (7).

N

01/27/08 S M Burgin

Reviewed environmental permits and

. registrations of operating facilities to

. develop matrix of transfer requirements.

01/27/08 B J Faulkner

. Draft.letter on El Paso permit renewal to be

¢ review technical plans- for restart in t

‘lega

B

provided to legislative representative (1.2);

repare administrative exhibits (0.4) ;fconduct
research to support ASARCO response to
City of El Paso's motion for relief from stay
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{3.9)

Conferred with foremsic consultant regarding
hard drive imaging project (.20).

Work regarding motion to estimate PRP claims
(1.0) ; fresearch regarding E1 Paso's motion for
relief *from stay {1.0}

Revise draft Settlement Agreement and
Administrative Order on Consent for Hayden site
{2.1); prepare email to T. Davis regarding
issue with respect to Upper Blackfoot
settlement (0.5).

Review and consider cases cited in motion for
leave to file proofs of claim by Cole/Picher
and Evans/Quapaw claimants (.5).

Work on environmental permits and business
licenses at operating facilities to develop
timelines and procedures to transfex
permits/licenses.

01/27/08 Foster .20
01/27/08 Gregoxy 2.00
o1/27/08 Jackson 2.60
01/27/08 Stewart .50
01/28/08 Burgin 4.10

s »
01/28/08 Castaneda Jr. 3.00
01/28/08 Clark 3.00

01/28/08 T M Davis

7.50

Preparation and participation in a legislative
briefing with Senator Seliger along with Giblin
and Faulkner; Also, preparation and
participation in a briefing with TCEQ staff;
Discussed permit renewal and other procedural
issues.

Researching,

{2.3); researching
ability of creditor to oppose plan for
reorganization under Chapter 11 of the
Bankruptcy Act. (0.4); summarizing research
findings in preparation for meeting with M.
Spearing (0.3). )

Toxie: tort call. (.4); exchange emails regarding

-Houston site (.7); telephone conference with A.

Tenenbaum re same {.2); exchange emails
regarding Quapaw agreed order {.8}; call
regarding trust costs with J. Lapinsky et al.

" (1.3); telephone conference with A. Hooks re

same {.2); review texp sheet commen
exchange emails fegarding TCEQ meeting (.3);
telephone conference with P. Giblin regarding
El Paso (.2};Jtelephone conference with J.




Case 05-21207 - Document 7420-11  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 77 of 79

BAKER BOTTS w.ur.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession Page 58

/ﬂﬂ““"

Garrity regarding map of Hayden (.2);
conference call regarding term sheet (1.5);
conference call regarding Houston and other
Texas sites (.9); continued call regarding term
sheet (.3).

Continue work on matters relating to document
collection and review for East Helena internal
investigation.

Participate in weekly Baker Botts ASARCO
strategy call (0.6); conduct research to
support ASARCO response to City of El Paso
motion for relief from stay (3.2); conference
call with P. Giblin and T. Davis to discuss El
pPaso strategy (0.4); review Protestant briefs

and prepare notes on key arguments (1.3).

conferred with K. Linville regarding status of
case, preparation of discovery plan and details
for same (.50); preparation of e-discovery cost
estimate (.50); coordinated vendor and client

01/28/08 S B Dorman 2.30
-
01/28/08 B J Faulkner 5.50
—
01/28/08 J G Foster 1.30
e
01/28/08 P M Giblin 8.90
01/28/08 M M Gregory 3.50

schedule for imaging project (.30).

Prepare for and participate in meeting with
Senator Selliger to discuss ASARCO permit
renewal; telephone conference with TCEQ Chief
Clerk regarding logistics for TCEQ hearing;
work on same; continue to prepare oral argument
and briefs to be submitted to TCEQ.

Email notes regarding PRP motion to A. MacIver
(.2); review email from M. Moedritzer regarding
Taylor Springs motion (.1); revise motion (.3);
email new draft to A. Tenenbaum, D. Dain, M.
Moedritzer, T. Davis and B. Meginnes (.1);
ékchange emails with B. Faulkner regarding El
Paso motion for relief from stay (.1)) locate
sanple response and email to him (.3); review
emails ffdm'M. McGovern, T. Davis, T. Aldrich,
M. Moedritzer and T. Creekmore regarding Quapaw
settlement (.4);£E?seérch regarding El Paso
motion for relief from stay (.62) exchange
emails with T. Davis and M. McG8vern regarding
Quapaw settlement (.2); revise order regarding
same (.8); email same to T. Davis, M. McGovern
and K. Franta (.1);freview proposed orxder
rescheduling hearing on El1 Paso motion (.1}
exchange emails regarding same with T. Davis
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Preparation and participation in a strategy
meeting concerning renewal statutes, repair and
maintenance time line and exhibit renderings
with GSR-Andrade; Reported to Giblin and
Faulkner.

Followed up with opposing counsel on status of
Band 2 settlement agreements (0.3); discussed
various PRP claims with A. MacIver (0.1).

Read emails regarding term sheet {.7);
conference with M. Gregory and telephone
conference with J. Kinzie re term sheet (.5);
discuss term sheet with A. Tenenbaum (.4);
discuss custodial trusts with A. Hooks (.3);
telephone conference with B. Seitz and A.
Tenenbaum regarding Box issues (.4); telephone
conference with S. Janoe regarding Columbus
(.3); emails regarding settlements (.6); toxic
tort call with C. Haynes and S. Jordan (.7);
prepare for meeting in Austin (.8).

Continue working on East Helena grand jury
subpoena document collection, review, and
analysis matters.

Work on issues related to electronic discovery
plan (0.4).

I

01/29/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 3.00
01/29/08 X D Collins .40
01/29/08 T M bavis 4.70
01/29/08 S B Dorman 5.00
01/29/08 M L Farley .40
01/29/08 B J Faulkner 4.10

01/29/08 R M Fontenla.

01/29/08 J G Foster

<50

.20

.Paso Plant (0.4).

Prepare for and participate in meeting with P.
Giblin, T. Castaneda, C. Pope, and D. McDonald
to discuss El Paso permit renewal under the
Texas Clean Air Act (2.4); draft outline of
ASARCO response to City of El Paso request for
relief from bankruptcy stay (1.3); participate
in: conference calls with B. Litle and T. -
Castaneda to discuss graphic rendering of El

Emails with M. Gregory regarding agreed orxder,
file same-wvia Electronic Case Filing System
with-the Southern District of Texas Bankruptcy
Court, email with Trumbull regarding service of

same (0.5)..-

Conferred with forensic consultant regarding
imaging project commencement {.20).
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(:i§;729/08 P M Giblin 7.40 Work on briefs and oral argument for TCEQ
_ permit renewal. .

01/29/08 M M Gregory 2.50 (‘Telephone conference with B. Faulkner regarding
"El Paso motion to 1lift stay (,4lk office
conference with T. Davis regarding same (.1};
review email from A. MacIver regarding PRP
motion (.1); review emails from T. Creekmore,
G. Nino and M. Moedritzer regarding status of
Tri-States/Quapaw agreed order (.1); exchange
emails with M. McGovern regarding same (.3);
finalize same (.2); telephone conference with
K. Franta regarding same (.1); email to R.
Fontenla for filing and service (.1); review
email from D. Dain regarding Taylor Springs
stipulation (.1); telephone conference with D.
Prince regarding environmental settlements
(.1); exchange emails with and telephone
conferences with G. Nino and M. McGovern
regarding Tri-States/Quapaw agreed order (.4);
review notice of filing same (.1); review
signed agreed order (.1); email same to group
(.1); exchange emails with T. Aldrich regarding
signed Tri-States/Quapaw settlement agreement
(.1); exchange emails with M. Padilla regarding
San Francisco agreement (.1).

01/29/08 J T Gross .80 Review documents for East Helena Grand Jury
Subpoena matter.

01/29/08 C J Haynes 2.40 Reviewing strategy for response to motion for
leave (1.0); conference with S. Jordan, T.
Davis and others regarding response to motion
for leave (.6); conference with I. Xundawala
regarding same (.6); conference with D.
Klingler regarding settlement issues (.2).

01/29/08 A M Hooks 4.60 Reviewed and revised chart of property
© ' disposition recommendations; reviewed financial
estimates of property cafrying costs for
custodial trust, telephone consultation with T.
Aldrich regarding same; participated in call
with TRC; participated in meeting with ERM;
prepared for Board meeting presentation.
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01/29/08 T C Jackson 4.60 Telephone conference with T. Davis regarding
Upper Blackfoot settlement issues (0.2); revise
Upper Blackfoot settlement agreement (1.9);
review and revise draft Settlement Agreement
and Administrative Order on Consent for Hayden
site (2.0); forward same to S. Janoe (0.2);
forward same to T. Davis and others (0.3).

01/29/08 J S Janoce 3.60 Worked on Illinois site analysis (1.1); worked
on Columbus site analysis {.7); worked on draft
ng?en/Aqgnii;illgmwﬁkwa;;ﬁmmﬂﬂﬁﬂywzﬁﬁmm“

01/29/08 J L Kinzie . 1.20 Prepare for and attend conference call thEi}
TCEQ. e Iy

01/29/08 I Kundawala 1.80 Phone conference with M. Mills' office

regarding scheduling of mediation for February
15 and review letter confirming mediation
received from their office (.1); e-mail
correspondence with C. Haynes regarding letter
received from mediator and follow up e-mail to
B. Hamilton regarding mediation (.1); phone
conference with D. Cabe related to toxic tort
claims (.4); attention to follow up letter to
D. Cabe enclosing discovery (.1); prepare for
and participate in conference call with C.
Haynes, T. Davis, S. Jordan and K. Franta
regarding toxic tort strategy and follow up
with C. Haynes regarding same (1.1).

01/29/08 A L MacIver 9.50 Drafting and researching motion to estimate
(6.9); correspondence regarding the Encycle
Settlement Agreement (.2); revising dispositive
motion and exhibits_gzhg).

01/29/08 D R McDhonald 3.20 Worked on strategy for oral argument at agenda
covering El Paso Smelter; evaluated legal

standards and form of order ASARCO would seek
}ﬁx EQ; . meeting.with C. Pope regarding same.

01/29/08 M P McGovern 4.70 ReV1ew ASARCO'S draft objectlons ‘pleadings for
Hybelos Waterway site PRP claims (0.7); draft
comments. and proposed revisions to pleadlng
(0.8): conduct brief CERCLA/502 research of
issue raised in objections (0.9); work on draft
agreed order for Quapaw settlement and draft
and read relevant emails (0.7}.
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pn TR T ——

EE P

01/30/08 B J FPaulkner 11.50 Research and draft a proposed TCEQ order
concluding permit renewal proceeding (8.5);
review E1 Paso ISD bankruptcy claim and draft

“W%mwﬁw%k analysis of implications for permit renewal

3 proceeding (0.5); draft letter on El1 Paso
permit renewal to be provided to the United
Steelworkers (0.6); conduct legal research to
prepare for response to City of El Paso
supplement to motion to continue administrative

%, proceedings (1.9).

01/30/08 J G Foster 4.50 Analysis of electronic data to be processed and
preparation of cost estimate for electronic
sk o " data processing and review.

01/30/08 P M Giblin 7.50 Review motion for continuance and TCEQ setting
of same; prepare for hearing; telephone
conferences with team members regarding

ot
“mmw\nwuuﬂw . advocacy strategy.

01/30/08 M M Gregory 2.00 Exchange emails with M. McGovern regarding
' Tri-States/Quapaw settlement and check

Bankruptcy Court's calendar regarding same
(.2); telephone conference with A. MacIver
regarding PRP motion (.1); review emails
regarding same from A. MacIver and M. Paulson
(.1); exchange emails with D. Prince and A.
MacIver regarding contribution protection (.1);
telephone conference with B. Faulkner regarding
El Paso motion for relief from stay (.2);
locate pleading regarding same and email to him
(.2); work on response to same (1.1).

01/30/08 J T Gross 3.00 Update case files .and: indices.

‘Attended meeting with T. Aldrich and B. Litle
to prepare for meeting with Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality to discuss Texas owned
.sites; attended meeting with ASARCO
- representatives, State .of Texas representatives
from Attorney Gegeralﬂg-Offiﬁe and Texas
Commission on Envitrornmental Quality and EPA and
i DOJ represedtatives-regarding Texas owned sites
-and funding requirements for possible custodial
trust; prepared for meeting with Board of
Directors and meeting with title company and J.
Gracie. e

01/30/08 A M Hooks . 6.50
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01/30/08 D L Prince

01/30/08 J L Ross

01/30/08 J B Seitz

SEMO settlement matters (0.9).

Finish draft of future costs chart for PRP
motion (2.5); compare PRP chart to combined POC
chart and update charts (2.2); begin drafting
additional exhibits for PRP motion {.9); gather
transcripts from Quapaw depositions and forward
to M. Moedritzer (.7); draft chart listing PRPs
with claims at sites with contribution
protection (1.8).

Conference with H. Richins regarding strategy
on Mission (.5); conference with G. Mack
regarding same (.9).

Prepare revised CDA Box consent decree based on
recent discussions with DOJ counsel (1.2);
telephone conferences with parties regarding

tpireE

01/30/08 J A Williamson

01/31/08 O J Alaniz

.60

.40

Researched prior orders issued by TCEQ for
sample language associated with denial of
hearing requests.

Conference with B. Faulkner regarding El1 Paso
administrative proceeding and follow-up with J.
Stewart regarding same.

01/31/08 S M Burgin

01/31/08 K A Clark

01/31/08 K D Collins

01/31/08 T M Davis

[ g N

Continue to develop information on
permits/licenses/registrations of operating
facilities and procedures and timelines to
transfer same; develop information relating to
claims of private PRPs to incorporate into
motion to restart estimation process.

Reviewing summary of research findings (0.6);
Brief telephonic conference with K. Linville
(0.4); Telephonic conference with M. Gregory

(0.5).

Prepéred_for and participated in meetings to
discﬁss settlement agreements with various PRPs
(0.7); revised ‘settlement agreements (0.2);
discussed issues related to remaining PRP
claims (0.3).

Review El Paso materials (.6)} discuss E.

Helena with E. Hooks, S. Janoe and T. Aldrich
(.4);§Foﬂ%erence with T. Aldrich and S. Janoe @§
regarding El Paso custodial trust and Hayden
(1.1)% read and send emails regarding term

sheet” language (1.2); Board of Director meeting
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01/31/08 S B Dorman 1.80

01/31/08 M L Farley

s
it o Y 8 s A IR TR Y Rl LS

e RN =

(.4).

Continue work on East Helena grand jury
subpoena matter for internal investigation
issues.

Continue preparing for meeting with AUSA on
East Helena matter (0.6).

Participate in El Paso team conference call
{0.7); revise letter to United Steelworkers and
forward to T. Aldrich (0.4); conduct legal
research on ASARCO bankruptcy proceedings as
they relegate to City of El Paso's motion to
continue administrative proceedings (5.9);
begin draft response to City of El Paso's
supplement to motion to continue {2.1).

R on,

o,

AT

Linville (.30).

Conferred with various vendors in connection
with preparation of electronic data review and
production cost estimate for client (1.90);
preparation of detailed cost estimate, revised
and finalized (1.50); conferred with K.
Linville regarding cost estimate, factors and
other issues regarding same (.40); conferred
with D. Barker regarding status of hard drive
imaging project and reported same to K.

for oral arguments.

Continue work on briefs and filings with TCEQ;
prepare for meeting with TCEQ staff; prepare

o
01/31/08 B J Faulkner 9.10
i e
RO i 33 37 S .
ity
A
\,
oy
01/31/08 J G Foster 4.10
g N 80 o
W
01/31/08 P M Giblin 6.30
eV A s e s
01/31/08 M M Gregory 3.60

_agreement

Review emails from T. Davis regarding PRP
motion (41);‘rev@ew email from M. McGovern
regarding East Helena séttlement (.1); review
email from B. Seitz regarding SEMO settlement
agreement and 9019 motion (.1); telephone
conference with A. MaclIver regarding PRP motion
and review emails from her and M. Paulsen '
regarding same (.2); work regarding respgnse to
El Paso motion for relief from stay (2.0;;
telephone conference with K. Clark regarding E.
Helena issue (.4); exchange emails with M.
McCoy regarding same (.1); review emails from
K. Collins regarding Everett/Tacoma settlement
(.1); geview emails from M. Paulsen
regarding El1 PasoO settlement agreement (.1);

“a
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01/31/08 K K Linville

01/31/08 A L MacIver

s i e
. /,,u/"' .

01/31/08 D R McDonald

. SRS

motion to file property damage claims (3.4);
attention to expert reports and related issues
regarding toxic tort claims (.9}.

Work on an electronic discovery plan (0.60);
continue to identify documents that should be
provided to counsel for employee (0.50); confexr
with K. Clark of Baker Botts regarding the
bankruptcy (0.20); review client documents
related toc East Helena site (0.40).

Revising dispositive motion (4.3); continuing
research for motion to estimate (2.6).

.70

01/31/08 M P McGovern

01/31/08 S A McKithan

01/31/08 S McMillen

01/31/08 M G Paulson

2.10

Work on form of TCEQ order in El Paso renewal
matter; attention to TCEQ requests for
identification of participants at hearing;
worked on arguments to respond to motion for
continuance.

Review redlined draft of objections pleading
for Hybelos Waterway site PRP claims (0.5);
work with A. MacIver on objections pleading for
Hybelos Waterway site (0.7); review and comment
on DOJ redline of East Helena site settlement
agreement (1.0).

Organize and index client documents (0.8};
update case files (0.4).

Revise and prepare form of Non-Disclosure
Agreement for possible liability transfer of
certain owned, non-operating properties to
potentially interested, bidders and compile
documents regarding certain properties (1.7);
strategize ‘with B. Litle regarding Federated
Metals sité activities and Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality meeting following
settlement meeting (.4).

2;89'< Conti ue.téidraft Bl Paso settlement agreement
AL be..

ﬂZQ) . telephone conferences with C. Sweeney,
TCEQ; regarding same: (0.30); telephone

rconference with J: Atwood, :Texas AG, regarding

" saméand Nuecés Bay and Encycle settlements

(0.30); continue to draft Arizona settlement
agreement (1.00}.
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01/31/08 D L Prince 5.10 Continue drafting exhibits for PRP motion
(2.6); draft email to S. Burgin and K. Collins
regaxding approach to populating exhibits (.3};
begin researching PRP information to populate
exhibits (2.0); call with S. Burgin to discuss
same (.2).

01/31/08 J L Ross 5.20 participate in call SN o aiscuss
report on groundwater issues (4.2); conference
with D. McAllister regarding strategy on
Mission (.6); prepare email to parties
regarding Mission meeting and related issues
(.4).

01/31/08 J B Seitz 2.10 Telephone conferences with DOJ and Missouri
counsel to discuss SEMO settlement issues
raised by Doe Run (0.5); telephone conference
with counsel for Doe Run (0.4); work on revised
SEMO settlement and black-line for review by
parties (0.7); prepare revised 9019 motion for

— oy, SEMO {0.6).
( 01/31/08 J A Williamson .80 Reviewed TCEQ files and obtained copies of
representative orders involving denial of

_m\huh.ijii%ng requests.

Total Hours 1,583.10

Total Fee $ 683,381.50
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ATTN: Ruth Kern Invoice Date March 12, 2008
2575 East Camelback Road

Suite 500 Attorney J L Kinzie

Phoenix AZ 85016-9251

076735.0113 Environmental Issues

Hours Description
01/23/08 E D Reeder .40 Updated unowned sites files.
e * S
01/31/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Preparation and participation in strategic

meetings and discussions with Giblin, McDonald
) and Faulkner; preparation and participation in
f—ww\\uﬁuf conference call with ASARCO leadexrship team.
02/01/08 S M Burgin 4.00 Continue to develop matrix for information on
transfers of permits/licenses and registrations
of operating facilities; telephone conference
with company representatives and S. Janoe

regarding same; continue to develop information
on claims of private PRPs for motion to restart

T et . estimation process.
A5 ) R Y ) )
02/01/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00 Preparation, coordination, and participation of
a meeting between TCEQ Commission staff, P.
i Giblin and B. Faulkner; preparation and

participation in a strategy meeting with P.
“ Giblin and B. Faulkner.

02/01/08 K A Claxk .80 Telephonic conference with M. Spearing, M.
Farley and K. Linville to discuss research
findings and status of responding to grand jury
subpoena {0.8) .

'02/01/08 K D Collins ~4.40° Prepared forand participated in meeting to

discuss status of PRP gite with opposing’ )

. -counsel (0.8); followed up on status of various

?i‘ Band 2 setﬁlemeﬁt agreements (0.2); reviewed

: and analyzed PRP claim files (3.4).
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02/01/08 T M Davis 5.10 Telephone conferences with P. Giblin, B.
Faulkner regarding El Paso; conference with J.
i 1 telephone conferences
with M. Gregory,'cdnference with J. Kinzie
regarding term sheet (.8); review term sheet
revisions (.3); additional calls regarding the
texrm sheet (.9); read UBMC settlement agreement
4‘¢hangeswand dlsggﬁiwylth T. Jackson {.6);
discuss El Paso with T. Aldrlch and T. Klempel
; [Sonterence call with S. Janoe TEFETHTAY
cohstructlve trust issues (.4); read RFP for E.
Helena and discuss with A. Hooks (.4); review
comments to E. Helena soils agreement (.6).

02/01/08 S B Dorman 1.80 Continue analysis and review of documents for
internal East Helena grand jury matter.

02/01/08 M L Farley 1.80 Continue preparing for meeting with AUSA on
East Helena matter (0.4); confer with M.
Spearing and K. Linville regarding same and
plan for electronic discovery (1.0); brief D.
McAllister regarding same (0.4).
s AL
02/01/08 B J Faulkner 10.00 | Begin draft of creditors' resolution
' ’ ' supporting El Paso renewal (0.4); participate
in strategy meeting with P. Giblin, T.
Castaneda, and D. McDonald (2.4); prepare for
meeting with D. Womack, Executive Assistant to
TCEQ Chairman Garcia (1.4); travel to and
participate in meeting (2.9); conference call
with B. Litle and follow-up work on El Paso
startup ‘plan as exhibit in TCEQ administrative
proceeding (0.6); revise draft proposed TCEQ
order (2.3).

02/01/08 P M Giblin 8.70 Prepare for and.participate in team meeting to
' ; develop arguments in response to City of El
Paso's motion for continuance and motion to
deny permit renewal; work on draft order permit
renewal ; prepare for and meet with TCEQ staff
»Hto.discuss key issues; work on action items.

02/01/08 M M Gregp,fy L 1.20 qvork on response to City El Paso's motion
: Yor.relief from stay (1.0’;; review emails from
T. Davis, A..MacIver and T. Aldrich regarding
Nueces Bay settlement (.1); review email from
T. Creekmore regarding SEMO settlement (.1).
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02/01/08

02/01/08

K K Linville

A L MacIver

expert report (.1); continue drafting response
to claimants® motion to late file property
damage claims and conduct related research
(5.7); prepare for and paxticipate in phone
conference with C. Haynes, S. Sellick and N.
Brody regarding expert report {1.0).

Continue to identify documents that should be
provided to counsel for employee (0.80); attend
meeting with M. Parley and M. Spearing
regarding East Helena (1.70); update witness
interview lists (0.60).

Revising proposed CMO for PRP estimation {.5);
reviewing cases for and revising the Motion for
CMO (2.5); coxrespondence regarding the Encycle
and NBueces Bay Settlement Agreements (.3);
telephone call to C. Sweeny regarding a pending
agreement {.1); telephone conference regarding
the dispositive motion (.4); final revisions to

g

02/01/08

D R McDonald

the dispositive motion (3.0).

R AT G

'3.30

02/01/08

02/01/08

02/01/08

02/01/08

S A McKithan

S McMillen

D L Prince

J L Ross

N

" Review and revige form of draft order to be

sought from TCEQ in El Paso smelter air permit
renewal; meeting to develop arguments in
opposition to continuance motion.

.60

Assist with preparation of East Helena meeting

‘materials (0.2); obtain copies of documents for

M. Farley's review in East Helena Grand Jury
Subpoena matter (0.4).

Drafted request for proposal 1etters~

Continue drafting exhibits for PRP motion

"{3.2}; draft environmental summary language for

exclusivity hearing (2.0).

Prepare email to D. McAllister (-1); conference
call with D. Baker regarding Mission settlement
agreement (.8); conference with G. Tsiolis
Yégarding same (.2); call to D. McAllister

' regarding timing of plan confirmation in

connection with settlement on Mission (1.0);
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02/01/08 J B Seitz

02/01/08 M C Spearing

02/02/08 T M Davis

conference with I. Kundawala regarding Mission
(.5); conference with B. Cook regarding
meetings next week (.7); review changes to
settlement agreement by Indians (.7).

Analyze key documents and work on DOJ questions
regarding owned properties in the CDA Box
{(1.8); review comments from counsel regarding
settlement matters (0.5); telephone conferences
with counsel regarding SEMO settlement matters
(0.7); work on additional revisions to SEMO
settlement provisions (0.4).

Meeting with M. Farley, L. Linville and G.

Study emails regarding sale motion (1.1);
review summary of environmental matters for
exclusivity hearing (.4); review emails
regarding tax issues_Egigggggmggﬂenvironmental
1scuss El_Paso permi

" matters with J. Kinzie (.2 review emails

P

egarding Encygle gsg&isﬂ?nt (.4).

02/02/08 B J Faulkner

3.40
1.50
Clark.
2.60
settlements (.
4._90

02/02/08 J G Foster

Prepare notes on legal and factual issues
related to upcoming Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality consideration of ASARCO
El Paso permit renewal (1.6); complete first
draft of ASARCO response to City of E1l Paso
supplement to Motion to Continue administrative
proceedings (3.9).

.20

Corresponded with vendor regarding status
update on hard drive imaging project.

o i

R o e

02/02/08 P M Giblin

1.90 -

02/02/08 I Kundawala

02/02/08 A L MacIver

7.20

© NGgg . renewal.

Continue work on oral argument in response to
motion for continuance and in support of permit

Continue researching issues related to - ==
objection to motion to late filed claims (2.3);
continue drafting objection thereto (4.9).

Revising dispositive motion (.8); continuing to
draft and research the motion to estimate
(2‘1) . B
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02/03/08 B J

Faulkner

02/03/08 T C

Jackson

02/03/08 I Kundawala

02/03/08 K K

02/03/08 J L

02/03/08 M C

Linville

Ross

Spearing

s

e,

4.50

1.00

02/04/08 O J

02/04/08 T A

Alaniz

Castaneda Jr.

Complete draft creditors's resolution
supporting El Paso permit renewal (1.7); revise
draft ASARCO response to City of El Paso's
supplement to Motion to Continue (2.8).

3.00 .

Work on issues related to Upper Blackfoot
settlement agreement (0.8); review report of
meeting with DEQ regarding water treatment
system at Upper Blackfoot site and send email
to T. Davis regarding same (0.2).

Continue researching issues related to

objection to motion to late file claims (1.8);

continue drafting and finalizing first draft of

ASARCO's response in opposition to motion to :
late file 950 claims (3.9); send draft to C. :
Haynes with comments (.1). :

Review client documents related to East Helena.
Review and revise Indian version of settlement
agreement related to Mission (1.7); prepare

email to clients regarding same (.3).

Prepare for meeting with US Attorney.

.50

2.00

.,
Review Response to City of E1 Paso's Motion to
Continue TCEQ's Consideration the Application
of ASARCO Incorporated for Renewal of Air :
Quality Permit and provide comments to B.
Faulkner.

Review and comment to the response to the
City's supplement to their motion for
continuance; preparation and participation in a
meeting with TCEQ Commission staff.

02/04/08 X D

02/04/08 T M

‘Collins

Davis

Reﬁiewed PRP claim files and developed strategy
for addressing claims.

Study emails regarding SEMO (1.1 review
exclusivity materials (.4) ff review E1 Paso
response and discuss with B. Faulkner (.7);
additional. telephone conferéences with B.

Faulkner and P. Giblin regarding El Paso; read
revised draft of response (.9).
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~Participate in weekly Baker Botts ASARCO status
call {0.4); conduct legal research on issues
related to upcoming TCEQ wmeeting (1.3);
conference call with H. Trice of creditors®
committee to discuss status to El1 Paso permit
matter (0.4); meet with B. Litle to discuss
preparations for February 13 TCEQ meeting
(1.0); review ASARCO draft plan process motion
in bankruptcy court to assess implications to
El Paso permitting matter (1.1) revise ASARCO

response to City of El Paso Supplement to

reflect client comments and late

02/04/08 B J Faulkner 13.10

P response to City of El Paso Motion for Rellef
from stay in bankruptcy court (3.5).

02/04/08 J G Foster .20 Updated K. Linville regardlng imaging status
(.20)

A

02/04/08 P M Giblin 5.50 Prepaxe for and meet with team members and
. continue work on oral argument and submittals
for TCEQ.

" Telephone conference with B. Faulkner regarding
City of El Paso matter (.2); review email from
T. Pavis with materials regaxding El Paso P
permit renewal proceedings {.3)ff review emaiis.
rom S. Janoe, S. Marcus, D. Prince and A.
MacIver regarding enviromnmental settlements
{.2); telephone conference with D. Prince
regarding same (.1l); revise chart regarding
environmental settlements (.2); email same to
D. Prince (.1); review oxder approving
Tri-States séttlement with governmental
entities (.1); email same to T. Davis, S.
Janoe, M. McGovern;and D. Prince (.1).

02/04/08 M M Gregoxy

02/04/08 C J Haynes .70 - Attending’ weekly telephone status meeting (.3);
dénce w1th I. Kundawala
C pert issues (. 4).

02/04/08 A M Hooks 1.80

worked on
revisions to proposed form of RFP and
communlcat1ons with T. Aldrlch regarding same.
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02/04/08

02/04/08

02/04/08

02/04/08

02/0s5/08

D L Prince

J L Ross

J B Seitz

M C Spearing

S M Burgin

settlement agreement (0.90).

L ’
Continue preparing exhibits for PRP motiomn.

Conference with D. McAllister regarding changes
to agreement with Indians (.3); conference call
with B. Holland and S. Ruffato regarding
reclamation issues (.9); call to K. Sawers
regarding same (.2); conference with client
regarding meeting with Indians (.4); call to D.
McAllister and R. Kern regarding meeting and
issues -related thereto (Mission Mine) (.2).

Additional telephone conferences with counsel
regardlng SEMO settlement provisions (0.6);
prepare correspondence to Doe Run counsel
regarding proposed settlement provisions (0.2):
work on revised text for settlement and 9019
motion based on recent discussions (0.7).

Read material to prepare for meeting with US
Attorney.

Continue to research claims of private PRPs for
motion to restart estimation process.

02/05/08

Y

T A Castaneda Jr.

02/05/08

02/05/08

K D Collins

T M Davis

Preparation and participation in a meeting with
D. Cabe and B. Faulkner; discussed NOVs, Con
Top, permit appllcatlons, and air modeling
methodologies. ¥

Reviewed 'PRP claim files and developed strategy
for addressing claims (2.8); reviewed Parent's
notice of objection to settlement (0.3);
discussed status of PRP claim with opposing
counsel (0.3); reviewed settlement agreement

and 9019 motion and expert reports (1.2} .

Discuss new Tennessee site with S. Janoe (.3);
exchange emails regardlng Selby objectlon (.6);
Conference with M. Gre ory regardlng El Paso

and dlscuss w1th B. Faul er {.4)% review Alton
1nformat10n and ema11 to 8. Janoe re same {.3);
review Selby materlals {.7); conference call
with S. Janoe, M. McGovern, M. Gregoxy and K.
Collins to Qiscuss the Selby objection (.4};
telephone conference with M. McGovern regarding
request for transcript {.2); read examiner
responses (.5); read CDA Box Draft revisions

‘and‘the~ term sheet 14 ev ew iEEQ response
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02/05/08 S B Dorman

02/05/08 M L Farley

R S st g s
g 5o mj.»:mm.wmw,.ew

/,»"'
Qﬁos/oe B J Faulkner

(.3); CDA Box conference call (.6); telephone
conference with B. Seitz regarding Box
settlement (.3);fconference call with creditors
regarding Hgyden, El Paso, Houston and Selby
matters (.ﬁg

Work on East Helena grand jury investigation
matters and review of documents and timelines.

Final preparations for meeting with AUSA on
East Helena matter (0.5); participate in
meeting with AUSA and EPA agent (1.3); work om
issues arlslng from same (ng)

ari e

L

02/05/08 P M Giblin

.00

.40

Complete revisions to ASARCO response to City
of El Paso Supplement to Motion to Continue
administrative proceedings (1.9); arrange for
filing of same at Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality ("TCEQ"} (0.9); meet with
P. Giblin, and consultant D. Cabe to discuss
technical issues related to upcoming TCEQ
agenda (2.6); review and offer suggested edit
to exhibit for permitting matter prepared by
consultant D. Zunkel (0.6).

éontinue work on preparations for TCEQ hearing;
finalize response to City of El Paso's Motion

02/05/08 M M Gregory

for Continuance.

2.20 qgview email from B. Faulkner regarding El

aso's motion for relief from stay (.3); office
conference with T. Davis regarding same (.1);
telephone conference with T. Davis and K.
Franta regarding same (.1); revise draft
fesponse regarding same (.3); exchange emails
with K. Franta regarding same (.1); email to B.
Faulkner,regarding same (.1); ¥eview emails
from T. Davis, S. Janoe and R Collins
regarding objection to Selby 9019 motion- (.1);
office conference with T. Davis regarding El
Paso paving claim settlement agreement (.1)};
;emall regarding same, £o M. Paulsen and T. Davis

(.1); office. conference with T. Davis regarding
" Hybelos motion (.1); review email from A.

MacIver with draft of same (.1); exchange
emails with K. Collins regarding Selby 9019
motion and settlement agreement and locate same
for him (.2); conference call regarding
objection to Selby 9019 motion (.5).
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02/05/08 J L Ross 10.40

Attend meeting with the Mission Mine Indians to
discuss MARP and Gault Group report (9.5);
review and revise settlement agreement
regarding Mission Mine (.9).

Analyze property documents and related issues
involving the Page Repository at the CDA Box
(0.8); analyze draft settlement papers from D.
Dain regarding CDA Box (0.6); telephone
conference with DOJ, EPA and Idaho counsel to
discuss CDA Box settlement matters (0.9); work
on draft revisions per discussions (0.5).

Meet with M. Farley; meeting with Assistant US

02/05/08 J B Seitz 2.80
02/05/08 M C Spearing 4.50

Attorney.
¢ “ ST TN PR o %) D
02/05/08 J A Williamson 1.20

same.
02/06/08 O J Alaniz .50

S A A L TR NN b STV w01 L Rrn 55 T o it

‘with hearing on City of El Paso's Motion to

COSRENP I

Filed Answer to City of El Paso's Supplement to
Motion to Continue Consideration of Air Permit
with TCEQ Chief Clerk; communicated _with TCEQ
and TexasAdmin regarding availability of 2006
Agenda webcast and coordinated reloading of

Gather and send T. Davis documents to assist
Continue TCEQ's Consideration the Application

of ASARCO Incorporated for Renewal of Air
Quality Permit.

02/06/08 S M Burgin .80
02/06/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00
02/06/08 K D Collins: .70
02/06/08 T M Davis 6.20

Y " o e i .

Continue to research PRP future cost issues for
motion to restart estimation process.

Preparation and participation in a conference
call with ASARCO leadership team; preparation
and participation in a teleconference with GSR
Andrade concerning exhibit photo's of
potential plant improvements.

Prepared for and participated in conference
call to discuss 9019 strategy (0.6); called
"counsel for Parent to discuss filing order
requesting hearing date (0.1).

““telephone
conference with M. Gregory regarding te sheet

'(.2); work on El1 Paso stay response (1.7)

telephone conference with S. McMillen regarding
Utah sites (.3); review Hylebos motion and
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discuss with A. MacIver and M. Gregory (.4});
review materials regarding claims sent by S.
Jordan (.3); review TCEQ materials (.6); call
with California et al. re Selby (.6); telephone
conferences with G. Evans, K. Collins and L.
Garza re hearing date for Selby (.4).

02/06/08 S B Dorman 1.60 Work on East Helena criminal investigation
matters.

02/06/08 M L Farley .40 Attend to requests from counsel for employees
with respect to proffer session with AUSA
(0.4).

LT Sy

02/06/08 B J Faulkner 9.90 Participate in conference call with TCEQ staff
attorneys, P. Giblin and D. McDonald to discuss
El Paso permitting matter (1.2); conduct
follow-up research on issues discussed in
conference call (5.7); participate in weekly El
Paso permit team conference call (1.1); develop
a timeline of key events in the El Paso
permitting matter for P. Giblin's oral
argument at February 8 TCEQ agenda (1.9).

o id

02/06/08 R M Fontenla ‘ .60 Emails with T. Davis and O. Alaniz regarding
pleadings, review docket and forward corporate
governance order {(0.6).

02/06/08 J G Foster .20 Reviewed K. Linville email regarding
preparation of revised electronic discovery
plan and responded to same (.20}.

"\

02/06/08 P M Giblin 7.90 Prepare and refine oral argument for TCEQ
hearing; develop arguments to rebut claims by

Clty of El Paso.

Rev_‘w emails from T " pavis and K. Franta
regarding El .Paso reriewal proceedings (.1);
telephone conference w1th T.lDav;sH;e-ardlng
. 3 a Yom B. Seitz, "
Albert and S Woods regarding SEMO settlement
(.1}; review emails from T. Davis, M. Paulsen
and A. MacIver regarding PRP motion (.1);

‘ telephone conference with T. Davis regarding

- motion. to flle supplemental claim regarding
Terrible Mine site (.1); prepare chart
o ) regarding objections to various motions and
- review pleadings regarding same (1.0); office

02/06/08 M M Gregory - ~  2.80

3
A%
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02/06/08 J S Janoe

02/06/08 I Kundawala

02/06/08 K K Linville

02/06/08 A L MacIver

Worked on Columbus site analysis (2.1);
prepared for and participated in teleconference
regarding PRP disallowance motion (1.3);

.continued work on consent decree analysis

(2.4); continued work on Selby planning (1.0);
worked on Alton site analysis (1.1).

Research various issues related to Debtors'
response to claimants motion to file 950 late
claims (3.1); review and consider memo from K.
Franta regarding research (.5); prepare for and
participate in call with C. Haynes and
valuation experts (1.2); continue drafting
response to motion to file late claims (2.3};
circulate draft of response to T. Davis, J.
Prince and S. Jordan for comment (.1).

Work on a revised electronic discovery plan
(0.10); work on responding to various
government inquiries related to East Helena
{(0.20); work on the identification of documents
for counsel of employee (0.40); review client
documents related to East Helena (0.60).

Continuing to revise the motion for a case
management order (4.5); revising the proposed
case management order (1.1); correspondence
regarding the Encycle Settlement agreement to

all the parties (.2).

L0 ottt

02/06/08 D R McDonald

02/06/08 M P McGovern

'Prepared for and participated in conference

call with TCEQ legal staff regarding motion for
continuance and El Paso permit renewal issues; i
worked on strategy for same. i

Work on foilow-up tasks to conference call on
ASARCO, Inc.'s objections to Selby site
settlement agreement (0.5); participate in
conference call with claimants' reps regarding

‘strategy to deal with objections (0.6); conduct

brief research reggrding objections issues

(1.0); review new feasibility study work plan

regarding MTBE issue raised ‘in objections

(1.3).
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02/06/08 J L Ross

02/06/08 J B Seitz

02/06/08 M C Spearing

02/06/08 K E Wilkirson

02/06/08 J A Williamson

6.

30

Revise Mission Mine settlement (2.1); meeting
with D. McAllister, J. Lapinsky and H. Richins
regarding Mission (2.0); revise Mission Mine
agreement (1.3); revise memorandum to client
regarding MRI (.2); review purchase and sale
agreement and prepare email to D. McAllister
regarding same (.7).

Analyze recent comments from opposing counsel
and work on revised settlement papers for the
SEMO sites (1.4); telephone conference with
counsel for Doe Run (0.4); work on follow-up to
discussions with D. Dain regarding CDA Box
matters (0.9).

Prepare and have conference with K. Evans.

Review Affidavits relating to Settlement
Agreement for I. Kundawala.

Researched issues related to ASARCO coxrporate
name, including telephone conference with TCEQ
Central—Regiétry staff regarding assignment of
Customer and Regulated Entity numbers; reviewed
TCEQ files to determine submittal of
documentation to agency regarding change from
corporation to limited liability company.

—_ o
02/07/08 T A Castaneda Jr.

3.

02/07/08 T M bavis

02/07/08 S B Dorman

00

Preparation and participation in a strategic
meeting with P. Giblin and B. Faulkner
concerning LLC v Inc; drafting of a civilian
overview of Con Top explanation that was

sy,
%L%hm%orwarded to Senator Seligers Office and TCEQ

Commission staff.

T

4.50 ‘?eview of comments to El Paso paving agreement

(.3)} review late claim objection re toxic tort
(.6)%;. review OU9 comments (.3); review Case

Management Ordexr for PRPs (.7); review T.

Jackson'.s reqgarding UBMC (.6);/prepare 5

; {1.8) ;] telephone conference
drich regarding E. Helena (.2).

Continue working on East Helena criminal
investigation matters and intermal review of
various documents.
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Work on East Helena criminal investigation
{1.4); participate in telephone conference with
D. McAllister regarding same (0.5).

02/07/08 M L Farley 1.90

% SRty
fﬂ 02/07/08 B J Faulkner 12.90
02/07/08 P M Giblin 2.80

02/07/08 M M Gregory 2.

02/07/08 3 T Gross 3.

02/07/08 C J Haynes

60

00

.70

Review documents on ASARCO's corporate
structure and prepare notes on implications for
El Paso permit matter (2.1); conduct legal
research on issues relevant to February 13 TCEQ
Agenda {2.3); meet with B. Litle to discuss
exhibits for use at February 13 TCEQ public
Agenda meeting (1.3); meet with P. Giblin and
D. McDonald to prepare oral argument for
February 8 TCEQ public Agenda meeting (1.1);
prepare briefings and key documents for use in
oral argument at February 8 TCEQ public Agenda
meeting (6.1).

pPrepare for and meet with team members to
review strategy for TCEQ hearing; work on
action items; review pleadings and finalize

‘*w““sugu oral argument.

Telephone conference with A. MacIver regarding
PRP motion (.1); telephone confexemce with B.
Faulkner regarding TCEQ matter (.1); prepaxe
stipulation regarding Terxible Mine motion
(.3); exchange notes with T. Davis regarding
same (.1); email stipulation to D. Dain, A.
Tenenbaum and T. Davis (.1); review email from
A. MacIver with draft PRP motion {(.1); review
PRP motion and mark comments thereon (1.0};
email to T. Davis regarding same (.1); exchange
emails with M. Moedritzer gregarding Taylor
Springs stipulation {.1) # telephone conference
with B. Meginnes regarding same (.1)4 exchange
emails with M. Paulsen regarding E} Paso paving
settlement agreement (.2); .telephone conference
with T. Davis regarding same (.1); review
proposed order setting hearing on Selby 9019
motion (.1); email same to T. Davis, S. Janoe,
M. McGovern and K. Collins (.1).

Organize and assemble.the R
Chronology. of . events il

i i (2.5); update case files and
indices (0.5).

Revisihg‘expert»disclosures and conference with
I. Kundawala regarding same (.7)}.

Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008 Page 35 of 49
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02/07/08 A M Hooks : .80 Reviewed title information and worked on issues
relating to environmental liability transfer
request for proposal.

02/07/08 T C Jackson - 2.40 Finalize email to T. Davis regarding Upper
Blackfoot settlement issues (0.6); exchange
emails with counsel for State of Montana
regarding DEQ jurisdiction over water treatment
facility (1.3); address issues regarding
modification of 1994 Cal Gulch Consent Decree
as it relates to OU9 (0.4); send email to B.
Litle regarding proposed modification to Cal
Gulch Consent Decree (0.1).

02/07/08 J S Janoe 2.40 Continued work on PRP claim disallowance motion
(1.4); worked with S. Burgin regarding CSMRI
claim response (.3); worked with M. Paulson
. regarding AZ NRD settlement terms
wifh T. Aldrich regarding El Paso site issues

02/07/08 I Kundawala 5.20 Research various issues related to Debtors'’
response to claimants motion to file 950 late
claims (1.4); phone conference with N. Brody
{.2); phone conferences with 8. Sellick (.2);
phone conference with D. Klingler regarding
motion to file late claims {.1); draft opening
expert disclosure of S. Sellick of LECG (1.1});
confer with C. Haynes regarding same and about
general estimation issues (.2); continue
drafting response to motion to file late
claims, including the incorporation of C.
Haynes' comments and suggestions thereto (1.1};
phone conference with C. Pfahl regaxding
certain property at issue and follow up
regardlng same {.3); phone conference with K.

e ~Ledford regardlng settlement motion (.2);
letters and e-mails exchanging expert reports
(.4). :

02/07/08 K K Linville. ‘;viﬁ{joT”‘ReV1ew client documents related to East Helena
e : U (2:50) ; ‘drafted -correspondence to counsel for
employee * (6. 20) ' :

02/07/08 A L Maciver 6.60 Final revisions to the motion for a case
management order (5.9); revisions to the
dispositive motion (.7).
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02/07/08 K E Wilkirson

.80

Review affidavits in support of settlement of
claim.

02/08/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 4.00

Preparation and participation in strategic ‘\
discussion concerning finality with P. Giblin
and B. Faulkner; active participation in
continuance hearing; drafting of a civilian
overviey of SB 1126 explanation that was
forwarded to TCEQ Commission staff;

finalization and coordination of architectural
renderings working with B. Litle and B.
Faulkner; participation in a conference call dﬂ//

with the ASARCO leadership team.

Reviewed EPA decision making (0.3); called
claimants to follow up.on status of settlement
agreements (0.5).

(Me__e‘t‘with P. Giblin, B. Litle, et al. at TCEQ
.(.8) ;. TCEQ hearing re extension (.3); discuss

CMO motion with A. Maclver and M. Paulson (.7);
telephone conference with B. Litle regarding
energy solutions (.2); telephone conference

- with M. Gregory regarding Examiner Hearing

(.6) ..

Meeting with K. Linville regarding East Helena
criminal investigation matters.

Work on electronic discovery issues in
connection with East Helena criminal

investigation (.7).

02/08/08 Collins .50
02/08/08 Davis | 2.60
02/08/08 Dorman .50
02/08/08 Farley .70
02/08/08 Faulkner 8.60
02/08/08 Fontenla .60,
02/08/08 Foster 2.90

Travel to and attend TCEQ public agenda meeting
on behalf of ASARCO (3.0); prepare for and

participate in El Paso permitting team
-conference call (1.0); conduct legal and

factual research on opposition arguments in
preparation for February 13 TCEQ oral argument
(4.6).

‘ Emails with R. Mulloy and D. Prince regarding

Pulvair Site in Tennessee and researxch
regarding same (0.6).

Prepared revised cost estimate for J. Nickel
electronic data (2.70); conferred with vendor
regarding volume information for same (.20)}.
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02/08/08 P M Giblin 9.80 Prepare for and represent ASARCO in hearing at
which TCEQ commissioners denied City of El
Paso's Motion for Continuance; prepare for and
meet with team members to discuss strategy for
hearing on the merits; review pleadings and
work on arguments to present in rebuttal of
position that permit should not be renewed.

02/08/08 M M Gregory 1.60 Review emails from T. Creekmore and B. Seitz
regarding SEMO settlement (.1); exchange emails
with A. MacIver regarding Hybelos motion (.1);
review emails from A. Tenenbaum and T. Davis
regarding Terrible Mine site stipulation (.1)};
revise stipulation (.2); telephone conference
with T. Davis regarding same (.1); email new
draft of stipulation to A. Tenenbaum, D. Dain
and T. Davis (.1); review signed order setting
hearing on Selby 9019 wmotion (.1); email same
to T: Davis, S. Janoce, M. McGovern and K.
Collins (.1);  telephone conference with T.
Davis regarding PRP motion (.1); email to T.
Davis, P. Giblin and B. Faulkner regarding El
Paso smelter (.1); exchange emails with B.
Faulkner regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with D. Prince regarding exhibits to
PRP motion and review his email with updated
version of master chart (.3}; review email from
M. McGovern regarding East Helena settlement
(.1). :

02/08/08 C J Haynes 4.40 Reviewing "opening" expert report of R. Simons
(.6); revising objection to motion for leave
(1.9); conference with valuation expert
regarding R. Simons' report (.9); conference
with I. Kundawala regarding same and strategy
for motions (.7); conference with L. Goldberger
and others regarding Fireman's Fund issue

(.3).

02/08/08 A M Hooks 3.20 Telephone consultation with T. Aldrich
regarding status of assessment of funding
requirements for custodial trust administrative
expenses and analysis of same; conference with
‘B. Litle regarding inquiries made by Energy
Solutions; -attention to custodial trust
planning issues.

02/08/08 R B Hudson .10 Work on privilege log {.1).
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A e

02/08/08 D R McDonald 2.10 Representation of ASARCO at TCEQ agenda meeting
regarding City of El Paso motion to continue El
“N\-~‘__Easo smelter permit renewal meeting.

02/08/08 M P McGovern 3.50 Conduct additional historical research
regarding proposed plan at Bast Helena site and
draft set of comments to redlined settlement

: ment (2.5); work on.possible hearing

fers for ASARCO, Inc. objections to

*lement for Selby site (1.0).

02/08/08 S McMillen 3.50 Review and analyze JNNNEERNEN”

Agreement

r
=' (2.0); complete revisions to

the Otah site descriptions and other

documentation to be submitted to the U.S.

Department of Justice (1.2); telephone

conference with B. Litle and D. Hearnsberger -
regarding progress and strategy at the

Federated Metals and Lone Star Lead sites in

Houston, Texas (0.3).

02/08/08 X M Mead .50 Review final TCEQ briefing.

02/08/08 J D Nichols 2.60 Confer with D. McDonald and P. Giblin regaxding
need for research and analysis of issue of

El Paso JNNINNNENNS

research and analysis of relevant
statutory and case law regarding same; draft
memorandum discussing the finality of said
proposed order; confer with P. Giblin and D.
McDonald regarding substantive and stylistic

. edits; revise and circulate said memorandum.

02/08/08 M G Paulson 5.40 @gntinue to draft motion (tjrestart estimation

ﬁ%oéess and %fcompanYing e management oxrdexr
(2.50); meet¥hg with PRP team regarding same
{0.50); continue to prepare for conference call
With DOJ regarding Arizona settlement agreement

" (0:60) ; .conference call with E. Albert, DOJ,
regarding same (0.30); continue to draft
‘Arizona settlement agxeemehE {(1.50).
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02/08/08 D L Prince 8.00 Review claim associated with new Pulvair site
{.6); work with S. Janoe to coordinate response
to same (.3); continue drafting chart covering
all environmental POCs (4.0); revise exhibits
for PRP motion (2.6); correspond with B. Munson
regarding the Columbus O&M agreement and
related documents (.5).

02/08/08 D A Savage .30 Reviewed information regarding Title V
deviations at Amari opper Refinery.
02/08/08 J B Seitz 2.40 Review and respond td emails regarding SEMO

settlement matters (0.4); analyze potential
land transfers (0.4); telephone conference with
C. Pfahl about CDA Box (0.5); work on
additional revisions to CDA Box motion papers
(1.1).
-~ e
02/09/08 T M Davis . ﬁ 1.10 Work on El Paso Motion to Lift Stay Response.

02/09/08 B J Faulkner

';ﬁs,so ' Conduct legal and factual research on
: opposition arguments in preparation for TCEQ
February 13 oral argument in El Paso permitting

matter.
02/09/08 P M Giblin 4.80 Prepare for hearing on merits at TCEQ.
02/09/08 A M Hooks , 3.20 Drafted and revised real estate and

environmental liability transfer agreement for
use in potential transaction involving owned
non-operating property.

02/08/08 T C Jackson 1.40 Work on issues concerning Iron Mountain
settlement agreement.

02/10/08 T M Davis 1.90 Send comments regardirg El Paso Lift Stay
© Motion (.7) freview B®Helena comments from M.
' McGovern and send email regarding the same
(.Bxi'telephone conference with T. Jackson re
UBMC and Iron Mountain ‘Settlements (.4).

02/10/08 B J Faulkner 5,00 -Egéview and edit ASARCO's response to City of E1
Paso Motion for Relief from automatic
bankruptcy stay (l.lgpnduct legal and
factual research on opp@sition arguments to
prepare for February 13 TCEQ oral argument
(3.9).
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to the TCEQ Commissioners.

—WW
{ 02/10/08 P M Giblin 3.70 El Paso: work on oral argument and presentazzéf::D-w

02/10/08 C J Haynes 1.00 Revising motion for leave (1.0).

02/10/08 A M Hooks 1.60 Worked on revisions to environmental liability
transfer agreement; attention to issues
relating to properties that are candidates for

otential custodial trust.

02/10/08 T C Jackson .90 inue work on issues related to Iron
Mountain settlement agreement.

02/10/08 I Kundawala 3.70 Work on revisions to objection to motion to
file 950 late claims, including research and
analysis of issues related to such objection
(2.4); review C. Haynes e-mail inquiries,
investigate and respond to same (1.3).

02/10/08 K K Linville .50 Review client documents related to East Helena.

02/10/08 J R Prince .20 Review email from T. Davis regarding sale
agreement (.2).

02/10/08 J L Ross 1.60 Reﬁiew,and comment on revised settlement
e agreement related to Mjission (1.2); prepare
P email to clients regarding same (.4).
02/11/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Review, comment and strategic discussion

concerning Con Top, finality white paper and
media responses; briefing of Commission staff.

Pl

02/11/08 T M Davis 2.40 Review D. Prince charts and discuss the same
with D. Prince (.5); review language for Box
settlement and discussgwith B. Seitz {.6);

%view various e3ils ‘Mpgarding El Paso Motion
)

Lift 'Sty (.6)) read interim xepg —
‘:egardln-‘Hougto_‘ .2) J read and exchange )
( emails’ regardlng ‘El"Paso water treatment (.5).

02/11/08 M L Farley .60 Work on privilége issues in connection with
' production to AUSA in connection with East
Helena cr1m1na1 1nvest1gat10n (.6).

02/11/08 B J Faulkner 11.20 @Review City of El Paso exhibits in support of
’ Motion for Relief from automatic stay (0.8);
confer with T. Davis and ASARCO local counsel

to develop ASARCO's exhibits in objectlon to

; frevise draft memorandum on legal 1ssues"
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associated with El Paso permitting matter
(1.1); conduct legal and factual research in
preparation for February 13 TCEQ oral argument
(8.6).

Email and conferences with I. Kundawala
regarding Order Granting Motion to Approve (A)
Compromise and Settlement of Certain
Non-Asbestos Toxic Tort Claims and (B)
Settlement of Certaimi#Minors# Claims, file same
via Electronic Case§ %¥ng System with the
Southern District of”f%xas Bankruptcy Court,
email with L. Garza regarding same (0.6);
emails with A. MacIver regarding service list
issues (0.3); emails with D. Prince and K.
Wilkirson regarding updated environmental
estimation sexrvice list (0.2).

Reviewed K. Linville email regarding scope of
revised discovery plan to be submitted to
government (.%O)

El Paso: meetings with team members on key
aspects of presentation to TCEQ; continue work
on oral arguments; review key documents.

T
02/11/08 R M Fontenla 1.10
02/11/08 J G Foster ) .20
02/11/08 P M Giblin 10.90
02/11/08 M M Gregoxry 2.30

(geview K. Franta's draft response to City of El

\paso's motion for relief from stay and emails
from T. Davis and B. Franta regarding same
(.4); review email from T. Davis regarding
hearing notebook regarding same (.17i review
email from A. MacIver and telephone Tonference
with her regarding PRP motion (.2); review
email from T. Davis regarding East Helena
settlement agreement (-1); review emails from

tM‘ Paulsen and T. Dav#§ regarding El Paso
‘pavify claim settlemdfit agreement (.1);
exch&hge emails with T. Davis regarding Taylor
Springs stipulation (.1)}; email to P. Ruh and
T. Davis regarding same (.1); review email from
P. Ruh regarding same (.1); review emails from
T. Davis and K. Collins regarding Everett
settlement with State of Washington - Port of
Everett (.1); ev1ew email from T. Davis:
regarding dra resp g%% to City of El Paso’'s -
motion (.1); email draf§ to D. Klinger, J.
McCarroll, H. Trice, R.}Sugg, T. Davis, K.
Franta and B. Faulkner {.1) ) review email from
D. Dain regarding Taylor Springs stipulaticn
{.1); exchange emails with A. Tenenbaum

g
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02/11/08 K E Wilkirson

Update Affidavits to Settlement Agreement (.3};
compile Exhibits to Objection to Claimants'
Motion for Leave for I. Kundawala (.8); prepare
for filing and file Objection to Claimant's
Motion for I. Kundawala (1.5).

02/11/08 J A Williamson

02/12/08 T A Castaneda Jr. .

.

1.30

10.00

_strategy advice for the permit renewal hearing.

Worked on issues related to corporate structure
and identification of ASARCO LLC and ASARCO
Incorporated in TCEQ Central Registry;
researched information regarding current issues
related to permit renewal.

Preparation and participation in a strategy
session with ASARCO leadership team and BB
legal team; involvement in direct advocacy at
TCEQ and assisted in hearing preparation and

02/12/08 K D Collins

02/12/08 T M Davis

02/12/08 M L Farley

.60

02/12/08 B J Faulkner

Meet with D. Cabe to prepare for technical
. TCEQ-oral .argument (4.0); meet with El Paso
.argument (1.4); prepare legal and factual

1_17.9); gather:documents and supplies for use at
oral argument {2.3}.

Reviewed documents and prepared for 9019

Jhearings.

Exchange emails regarding toxic tort issues
(.7); exchange emails regarding Motion to Lift
Stay (.5); exchange emails re Motion to Lift
Stay with K. Franta (.2); exchange emails with
M. Gregory and S. McMillen regarding E. Helena
(.4); conference with M. Gregory regarding PRP
objection (.5); email to M. Paulson re same
(.2); (review Relief from Stay cases (.8};
prepare for Motion from Relief from Stay
Hearing (3.3)%) meet with I. Terrell and J.
Kinzie (.3}.

Continued work on privilege issues in

connection with production to AUSA in

connection with East Helena criminal

investigation (.3); revise letter to AUSA
same {.3) .-

issues;potentially presented at February 13
permitting. team to prepare for TCEQ oral

briefs. for use at February 13 oral argument
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02/12/08 J G Foster .20 Reviewed draft search term list and emailed X.
Linville regarding same (.20)}.

! S—
02/12/08 P M Giblin 11.90 El Paso: work on oral argument and other key
aspects of presentation to TCEQ; review
) exhibits; work with team members on potential
questions and issues; prepare and met with
ASARCO representatives to plan strategy.

02/12/08 M M Gregory 1.60 (;eview emails from T. Davis, B. Faulkner, K.
ranta and S. Jordan regarding City of El
Paso's motion for relief from stay and exhibits
(.4); exchange phone mail messages with K.
Franta regarding same (.1?; email stipulation
regarding Terrible Mine site motion to R.
Fontenla for filing and service (.1l); review
notice of filing (.1); email same to D. Dain,
A. Tenenbaum and T. Davis (.1l); email same to
P. Holzer and T. Davis (.1); email regarding
same to L. Garza (.1)(;§xchange emails with T.
Davis regarding responSe to City of El Paso's
motion and exhibit list (.1); review emails
regarding exhibits from T. _Dgvis, S. Jordan, K.
Franta and B. Faulkner (.%2; telephone
conference with K. Franta fegarding exhibit
list (.1); telephone conference with C. Sugg
regarding hearing on City of El Paso's motion
(.1).

02/12/08 J T Gross 5.00 Update the Official Potentially Responsible
Party Claims Estimation Service List.

02/12/08 C J Haynes 1.30 Conferences with M. Moedritzer regarding 9019
motion (.5); reviewing draft rebuttal expert
report (.5); reviewing revisions to motion to
strike ({.3).

02/12/08 M B Heister .30 Oxganize files (.3).
02/12/08 R B Hudson 1.20 Work on privilege log (1.2).

02/12/08 T .C Jackson .80 Continue work on Iron Mountain settlement
- agreement.

02/12/08 J 8 Janoe 1.30 Prepared for and participated in conference
call regarding East Helena work plan revisions
with T. Aldrich, J. Nickel, and B. Miller
(1.3).



Case 05-21207 Document 7420-13  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008  Page 1 of 52

BAKER BOTTS vrr.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession Page 34

02/12/08 I Kundawala 8.10 Review and comment on draft of motion to
exclude expert testimony (.4); review, consider
and respond to multiple e-mail inguiries from
C. Haynes related to toxic: tort matter (.3);
attention to discover matters related to toxic
tort matter (.7); draft motion for summary
judgment on certain property damage claims,
including related research (3.9); phone
conference with D. Cabe and D. Sorrells (.2);
e-mail correspondence with C. Haynes and B.
Horkovich regarding FFIC objection and .
neutrality and follow up regarding same (.3);
research issues in connection with property
damage claims (1.6); review and consideration
of various expert reports relating to the toxic
tort estimation and mediation process (.7).

02/12/08 K K Linville 1.50 Review and draft letter producing privileged
.log (1.00); work on a revised electronic
discovery plan (0.20); begin reviewing
correspondence between the government and the
East Helena plant (0.30).

02/12/08 A L MacIver 5.50 Revising dispositive motion (3.6)3fconference

with B. Faulkner regarding El Paso settlement

agreement (.2%; correspondence regarding
settlement agreements in principle (.4);
revising the CMO motion (.9); reviewing

document o regarding historical liability (.4}).

02/12/08 D R McDonald 5.00 Participate in pre-agenda meeting with B. Litle
and D. Cabe to develop arguments in support of
renewal of El Paso air permit (3.0}; worked on
analysis and briefing of issues that may be
raised (2.0}.

'02/12/08 M P McGovern 1.50 Review court reporter correspondence regarding
Quapaw deposition transcript requests and Blue
Tee subpoena rggarding,same‘(0.4); draft email
regarding any necessary response (0.1); work on
brief research issues for East Helena related
to terms of settlemént agreement and cleanup
action levels for Undeveloped Land in Proposed
Plan (1.0):

02/12/08 S A McKithan '1.00 Assist with development of new PRP claims
estimation service list (0.6); organize client
documents and update case files (0.4).
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02/12/08 S McMillen 6.40 Attend to East Helena, Montana properties
liability transfer matters including review and
distribution of relevant documents {1.3);
review, amalysis, and revisions to JiEEES

(2.5)}; review and analysis
of draft settlement related to the Montana
properties (.8); attend to several Federated
Metals and Lone Star Lead issues, including
completing letter to Texas Commission on
Eavironmental Quality, the Texas Attormey
General's Office and the U.S. Department of
Justice following-up on the Janmuary 30th
meeting and providing benchmarks related to
further investigations at the Houston

Erqperties (1.8).

02/12/08 J D Nichols 1.70 Collect, review, and analyze case law relevant
to i ] ). review
and analyze.xecent revisions to proposed orxder
in ASARCO's application for renewal of its
air-quality permit for its El Paso smelter;
apply said case law to the recently revised
language; draft written analysis of application
of said law for B. PFaulkner and D. McDonald.

02/12/08 M G Paulson 2.20 Continue to draft motion to restart estimation
process (1.20); continue to draft Arizona
settlement agxeement (1.00).

02/12/08 D L Prince 8.70 Finish reviewing PRP motions (.6); review and

’ revise PRP motion exhibits (2.5); continue
drafting all-POC chart for L. McDowell (3.2);
revise PRP chart (1.1); respond to email
reguest from E. Albert (.3); correspond with I.
Kundawala regarding Tar Creek materials (.2);
coordinate drafting of PRP service list with J.
Gross (.8).

g N ) ’
02/12/08 J R Prince -60 Review and comment on permit pleadings.
02/12/08 J I, Ross - 6.80 Conference call with D. McAl

Mission Mine negotiations (.7); conference with
S. Crispin’ regarding distxibution of purchase
and sale agreement (.2); review release
language proposed by Indians (.4); conference
with J. .Gross regarding MRI reclamation claim
(.2); conference call with client regarding
language to insext into the agreement (.6);
conference call with the Indians regarding same
.. (.4); revise release language (.2); review of
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02/12/08 J B Seitz

02/12/08 M C Spearing

02/12/08 J C Stewart

2.20

P (.3);
various conference calls regarding groundwater
issues with Non-ASARCO parties and clients
(1.5); participate in call with Non-ASARCO
parties to discuss outstanding settlement
issues with Indians (1.0); prepare email to
clients regarding stormwater controls (.4);
revise Mission Mine settlement agreement {.9).

Work on CDA Box property questions with C.
Pfabl (0.6); telephone conferences with counsel
for ID and EPA regarding property conveyance
matters. {0.7); prepare revised settlement
materials (0.9). *

Confer with M. Farley.

Continue drafting wmotion to exclude expert
reports and email to I. Kundawala for review -
(1.9); prepare order on motion to exclude
expert reports (.2); continue drafting motion
and order to incorporate comments and email to
C. Haynes (.9); review expert report (.8);
draft insert to motion to exclude expert
reports and email to C. Haynes and I. Kundawala
{.8).

02/12/08 J A Willjiamson

1.40

02/13/08 P J Bates

.40

02/13/08 X D Collins

uradvocacy at TCEQ and strategy advice and
_execution at the Permitvrepewal hearing.

Reviewed historical orders issued by TCEQ
predecessor agencies for language related to
reporting of uncontrollable events; researched
information regarding petition from New Mexico
Governor B. Richardson to Texas Governor R.
Perry in opposition of permit renewal.

Reviéw contents of media with S. McKithan and
discuss preparation of.new Summation database
and identification of custodians of data on

e QALEACK DataRecovery CD.7
I e Mamn

02/13/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 10.00

Preparation-and participation in a briefing
session with ASARCO leadership team, direct

Reviewed documents and'pfeﬁafed for 9019
hearings.: ‘ -
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02/13/08

02/13/08

T M Davis 4.00

Telephone conference with A. Tenenbaum and
exchange email with M. Paulson re Globe (.S5);
umerous emails and telephone conferences with

n
4;f. Ross and M. Gregory re El Paso Stay Hearing

(l.zix‘watch Webcast of TCEQ hearing (2.3). 5

M L Farley 1.60 Participate in telephone conference with
counsel for employees (0.5); continue work on
East Helena criminal investigation (1.1).

B J Faulkner 8.00 Meet with J. Lapinsky and El Paso permitting

team to prepared for TCEQ oral argument (1.5);

travel to and attend TCEQ public Agenda meeting
on behalf of ASARCO (5.9); meet with El1 Paso
permitting team to discuss team response to
public meeting (0.6).

Emails with J. Ross, forward water rights order
to J. Ross (0.3).

El Paso: finalize preparation for TCEQ hearing;\
represent ASARCO at hearing at which
Commissioners unanimously granted El Paso
permit renewal; worked on action items flowing
from Commission decision; met with ASARCO team
members to discuss same.

02/13/08 R M Fontenla .30

02/13/08 P M Giblin 10.50
T gy

02/13/08 M M Gregory 2.10

Review emails from A. MacIver regarding PRP
motion and telephone conference with her
regarding same (.2); review objection to
Barker/Doe Run 9019 motion (.1); email same to
T. Davis, S. Janoe, D. Prince and M. Heister
(.1); review email from S. Janoe regarding same
(.1);(exchange_emails with P. Holzer and
telephone conferences with him regarding City
of El Paso's motion for relief from stay and
filing of response and exhibit list (.5);
telephone ¢onference with T. Davis regarding
same (.1); reﬁiew file-stamped pleadings and
forward to group (.3); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same (.1); review ASARCO
Committee's objection and joinder in same by
the Asbestos Committee and the FCR (.2):]emai1
same to T. Davis, J. Ross and B. Faulkner (.1);
review signed stipulation regarding the
Terrible Mine site motion (.1); email same to
T. Davis, P. Holzer, D. Dain and A. Tenenbaum
(.1); review email from A. MacIver with new
draft of PRP motion (.1).
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02/13/08 A L MacIver 6.90 Revising case management order and motion for
case management order (4.6); revising
dispositive motion (1.5); reviewing documents
for historical liability memorandum for
privilege issues (.8).

02/13/08 D R McDonald 9.00 Prepare for and participate in agenda
deliberation of general permit for smelter.
02/13/08 M P McGovern .50 Telephone call with M. Padilla and B. Rich

regarding hearing date and Parent's deposition
requests for Selby site.

02/13/08 S A McKithan 3.50 Assist with collection of materials for Tar
Creek toxic toxt claims (0.3); assist with
development of new PRP claims estimation
service list (1.7); review third party
litigation support invoice and process for
payment (0.4); work with litigation support to
evaluate data on DVDs provided by Jordan Green
(0.8); organize Hayden compliance documents and
update file {0.3).

02/13/08 S McMillen 2.10 Review and analysis of EnergySolutions
Federated Metals soil evaluation report and
prepared summary for B. Litle (1.2);

communicate with potential bidder
AR - ;- - ing

questions

) (.6); began review of terms of access
agreement with the City of Hammond, Indiana for
offsite sampling related to the former
Federated Metals facility {.3).

02/13/08 K M Mead i .50.. TCEQ favorable ruling on permit renewal; assess
: implications for Federal strategy.

02/13/08 J D Nichols . f4;20 Confer Qith,D. McDonald régarding need for
case-law and statutory research regarding

collect and analyze
relévant case and sStatutory law; draft brief
‘analysis ‘of same for use by D. McDonald, P.
GibYin, ‘T. Castaneda, 'and B. Faulkner at a
public meeting held at Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality.
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an

02/13/08 M G Paulson

02/13/08 D L Prince

02/13/08 J L Ross

02/13/08 J B Seitz

02/13/08 M C Spearing

02/13/08 J C Stewart

E Y

8.30

1.90

Address State of Colorado claim that Globe site
costs cannot be estimated (1.50); evaluate
options for responding to Manchester site PRP
requests related to financial assurance fund
(0.80); continue to draft motion to restart
estimation process ({1.40); continue to evaluate
PRP claims (1.00).

Coordinate service of Tri-State materials to
opposing counsel (.2); respond to email inquiry
from E. Albert regarding New Mexico sites (.2);
assist K. Nash with questions regarding
mediation briefs (.1); continue drafting
all-POC chart for claims reconciliation (4.8);
revise environmental ‘seérvice list to
incorporate additional PRPs (3.0).

Review and respond to SAWRSA question from B.
Hoffman (.5); revise Mission Mine agreement
(.2); email to R. Kern and D. McAllister
regarding language of agreement (.2); review

. and revise the Mission Mine settlement

agreement (.6); conference call with clients on
Mission Mine issues {.4).

Telephone conferences with counsel to discuss’
additional comments on settlement matters
(0.7); analyze owned property issues and review
related site documentation (1.2).

Conference call with B. Farley and D.
McAllister; confer with M. Farley.

Call with C. Haynes to discuss motion related
to environmental issues (.1); meet with I.
Kundawala: regarding motion to exclude/strike
expert opinions (.2); conference call with
valuation expert (.5); continue drafting motion
to exclude/strike expert opinions to
incorporate comments (.2).

02/13/08 J A Williamson

.50

‘Obtained information at TCEQ for preparation of )

afternoon Agenda.

02/14/08 T M Davis

Exchange emails with O. Alaniz regarding
Washington comments (.6); exchange emails
regarding Globe issues (.8); email and
telephone conference with J. Ross regarding

" Motion for Relief from Stay Hearing (.7);

exchange emails with S. Jordan regarding PRP
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02/14/08 B J Faulkner

02/14/08 J G Foster

claims (.6).

6.40  Particdpgt

bankruptcy court related to City of El Paso's
motion for relief from stay (0.5); review all
pleadings and exhibits in preparation for
hearing (1.6); conduct research on
administrative procedural issues associated
with permit renewal and permit revocation to
prepare for hearing in bankruptcy court (2.9);
conduct research on factual issues underlying
City of El Paso's underlying petition to
revoke El Paso air permit (1.4).

.20 Conferred with forensic consultant regarding
imaging project (.20).

02/14/08 P M Giblin

02/14/08 M M Gregoxry

implementation action plan; reviewed potential
nnumhhmmmu““““m“_iffpgs for appeal by City of El Paso.

prr oo

5.10 .El Paso: telephone conference with TCEQ
. Executive Director regarding implementation of
Commission directive; work with team wmembers on

2.20 %Felephone conference with B. Faulkner regarding.
City of El Paso's motion for relief From stay
(.1)§ review new draft of PRP motion (.3);
telephone conference with D. Prince regarding
environmental service list (.1); telephone
conference and email to A. MacIver regarding
PRP motion (.2); exchange emails with A.
MacIver and M. Paulsen regarding same (.1);
exchange emails with T. Davis regarding same

- (.1);; forward PRP motion to J. McCarroll, H.

- Trice, S. Felsenthal, D. Klinger, C. Sugg, T.
Davis; A. MacIver; M. Paulsen and D. Prince
(.1); exchange emails with M. McGovern
regarding Tri-States: settlement (.1); revise
_chart§,regardingvenvirpnmental settlement
agreements,and.status of environmental
estimation (.7); exchange emails with B. Seitz
Yegarding SEMO (.1); review email from C.- Sugg
regarding PRP motion. (.1); exchange emails with
T. Davis regarding same (.1); email to A. ’
MacIver regarding same (.1).
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02/15/08 P M Giblin

02/15/08 M M Gregory

02/15/08 J T Gross

02/15/08 C J Haynes

02/15/08 M B Heister

02/15/08 A M Hooks

02/15/08 1L, C Howerton

5.40

1.00

.30

10..00

.50

50

El Paso: Continue work on post-Commission
action issues; review impact of bankruptcy
hearing on City of El Paso action at TCEQ;
continue work on City of El Paso
counter-strategy.

Review emails from A. MacIver and D. Prince
regarding exhibits to PRP motion (.2);
telephone conference with D. Prince regarding
master PRP chart (.1); email exhibits to C.
Sugg and T. Davis (.1); exchange emails with B.
Seitz regarding P. Ruh (.1}; exchange emails
Agith S. Woods regarding SEMO settlement (.1);
{review courtroom minutes regarding hearing on
City of El Paso's motion for relief from stay
and telephone conference with B. Faulkner
regarding same (_22} exchange emails with K.
Collins regarding fverett settlement agreement
and locate case for him (.2).

Update case files and indices.

Preparing for and participating in mediation in
Houston of Toxic Tort Property Damage claims
(Tar Creek).

Draft summary of arguments wmade by Parent in
opposition to Doe Run settlement at Barker
Hughesville site and draft potential responses
to Parent's arguments (.5).

Telephone consultation with T. Aldrich
regarding and attention to potential
environmental liability transfer for owned,
non-operating ‘sites; prepared for and
participated in conference tall with J.
Lapinéky, T. Aldrich, and S. Janoe regarding
iestimétes.for administrative expenses for trust
and evaluated components of same; worked on
form environmental liability transfer
agreement. b

Meet with K. Mead and search current press )

releasesvand statements of Congressman Reyes.

;’m : 'M$f“' ‘ . - f.
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02/15/08 T C Jackson 2.10 Prepare for and participate in call with
counsel for governments regarding Iron Mountain
settlement agreement (1.3); follow-up email
(0.4); address issues regarding Cal Gulch site
(0.4).

02/15/08 J S Janoe 11.00 Prepared for and participated in teleconference
regarding administrative costs of environmental
custodial trusts (.7); teleconference with
pavid Dain regarding Hayden site status (.3);
worked with T. Aldrich regarding same (.3);
prepared for and participated in mediation of
Tar Creek toxic tort property damage claims
(s.7). -

02/15/08 I Kundawala 9.50 Prepare for, attend and participate in Tar
Creek Property damage mediation in Mediator M.
Mills' office.

02/15/08 K K Linville .40 Began work on a chronology of events related to
' East Helena.

02/15/08 A L MacIver .10 Correspondence regarding the Encycle Settlement
Agreement.
02/15/08 D R McDonald 1.00 Telephone conference with D. Cabe regarding

TCEQ renewal actions and regulatory issues
follow-up at El Paso smelter (.9); attention to
Public Information Act request (.1).

02/15/08 M P McGovern 1.40 Work on discovery and scheduling issues for
Selby site (0.5); telephone call with M.
Padilla, B. Rich, K. Collins and others for
hearing dates and deposition/discovery planning
(0.9).

02/15/08 M G Paulson 4.50 Conferernce call with B. Litle and T. Aldrich
regarding Globe site {0.30); continue to
evaluate options for addressing same (0.80);-
continue to draft Arizona NRD settlement
agreement (1.60); communications with client
regarding same {0.40); continue to assess PRP
claims across all sites (1.40).

02/15/08 D L Prince 1.50 Correspondence with M. Gregory and A. MacIver
) regarding PRP claims exhibit (3); revise PRP:
claims exhibit (1.2).
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Conference with G. Tsiolis regarding release
language {.2); conference with B. Coock and G.

Tsiolis regarding same (.5).

Reviewed draft Title V deviation report and
accompanying cover letterl prepared suggested
mark-up of cover letter; communicated with P.
Donovan about same; conferred with P. Donovan
regarding draft Title V reports; analyzed
possible reporting issues.

Prepare revised settlement provisions relating
to CDA Box and related correspondence to
counsel for US and Idaho (2.2); telephone
conferences regarding SEMO settlement papers

Confer with M. Farley regarding letter to
government; conference with K. Evan.

Perform due diligence on envirommental issue at
request of I. Kundawala (.5)}.

Reviewed draft Title V deviation report and
cover letter for Amarillo Copper Refinery.

Review trust expense information (.7); review
E. Helena liability transfer contract (.6).

Review emails from M. Heister and T. Davis
regarding Barker settlement.

Draft notice of withdrawal of deposition
notice, file it with the Court and serve it on

Revising dispositive motion and corresponding

Re&ise Mission Mine ééttlement agreement (2.8);
prepare email to opposing counsel regarding

Create new Summation database.

02/15/08 J L Ross .70
02/15/08 D A Savage 1.30
02/15/08 J B Seitz 2.50

(0.3).
02/15/08 M C Spearing 1.50
02/15/08 J C Stewart .50
02/15/08 W L Swift .80
02/16/08 T M Davis 1.30
02/16/08 M M Gregory .10
02/16/08 I Kundawala - 1.10

counsel.
02/16/08 A L MacIver - .70

exhibits.
02/16/08 J L Ross 3.10

same (.3).
02/18/08 P J Bates 2.20
02/18/08 K D Collins 1.20

Revised settlement agreement and circulated for

signature {(0.2); reviewed logistical issues and
discussed hearing schedule with opposing
counsel, co-counsel, and court (1.0).
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02/18/08 T M Davis 2.30 Ccall regarding document retention (.4);
telephone conference with S. Janoe re Barker
settlement (.2); review Hylebos motion and
emails re same (.7); exchange emails with S.
Jordan regarding Hylebos and PRP motion (.4);
review PRP motion (.6).

02/18/08 M L Farley 1.30 Participate in telephone conference with
A counsel for employees (0.5); confer with M.
Spearing and K. Linville regarding same (0.4);
review list of electronic search terms (0.2);
attend to emails regarding diligence (0.2).

02/18/08 R M Fontenla 1.20 Emails with M: Gregory regarding ASARCO LLC's
Motion for an Order Approving Third Amendment
of the Purchase and Sale Agreement with
Globeville I, LLC for the Sale of ASARCO LLC's
Property in Denver and Adams Counties,
Colorado, file same via Electronic Case Filing
System with the Southern District of Texas
Bankxruptcy Court, email with Trumbull regarding
service of same (0.7); conferences and emails
with I. Kundawala and L. Garza regarding
revised proposed order, file same vi Electronic
Case Filing System with the Southern District
of Texas Bankruptcy Court (0.5).

02/18/08 P M Giblin 1.20 (EL Paso) Continue analysis of issues related
] to implementation of TCEQ action on El Paso
smelter permit renewal.

02/18/08 M M Gregory .70 Review email from D. Klingler regarding PRP
motion (.1); exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same (.1); attention to phone mail
message . from D. Klingler regarding same (.1);

-email. to D. Klingler regarding PRP motion {.1);

- review.emails from T. Davis and D. Klingler
regarding same (.1); review emails from T.
Davis and A. MacIver regarding Hylebos motion -
ahd, PRP motion, (.2). ; : :

02/18/08 C J Haynes . 1.00, Attendihg:telephoﬁe status conference (.4);
: - e-mail correspondence regarding settlement
issues (.6}
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02/19/08 T M Davis 2.20

Telephone conference with A. Tenenbaum
regarding Barker and regarding E. Helena and
other matters (.5); read and exchange emails
regarding status of various settlements (.6);
read proposed response regarding E. Helena
settlement (.3); review the materials regarding
Trust expenses (.8).

Worked on issues related to East Helena
investigation and due diligence (0.4).

Emails with I. Kundawala and L. Garza regarding
revised ordex, file same via Electronic Case
Filing System with the Southern District of
Texas Bankruptcy Court (0.6); email with M.
Gregory regarding order setting hearing on 9019
motion, email with Trumbull regarding same
{0.3).

Conferred with consultant regarding image copy
deliveries (.20).

(El Paso) Continue analysis and development of

recommendations to ASARCO Board regarding
implementation of TCEQ directive.

02/19/08 M L Farley .40
02/19/08 R M Fontenla .90
02/19/08 J G Foster .20
' 02/19/08 P M Giblin 1.80
e DR
02/19/08 M M Gregory .80
02/19/08 M B Heister .60
02/19/08 A M Hooks .50

Review order setting hearing on Barker/Doe Run
9019 motion (.1); exchange emails with T. Davis
regarding same (.1); telephone conference with
K. Franta regarding same (.1); email R.
Fontenla regarding service of same (.1); review
emails from T. Davis and S. Janoe regarding
same (.1); review emails from T. Davis, B.
Seitz, D. Dain, M. Heister and M. McGovern
regarding various environmental settlements
(.3).

Piepare'for and make call to T. Creekmore of
Doe Run and brief him regarding strategy for
responding to cbjection to ASARCO's settlement

- with; Doe Run (.2); develop strategy for’

defending ASARCO's settlement with Doe Run
(:4). '

Commﬁnications regardipg possible environmental
liability transfer transaction.

02/19/08 L. C Howerton .20

TR RO

AT ‘
Check for Press releases or statements from
Congressman Reyes.
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Mchllister regarding status of Mission
discussions (.5); prepare email to non-ASARRCO
parties regarding timing of Mission settlement
{.2); conference with D. McAllister regarding
his discussions with J. Ferrell and how to
proceed {.4).

s i

— T
02/20/08 T A Castaneda Jr.

.30

Preparation and participation in a conference

.call with the leadership team.

02/20/08 K D Collins

02/20/08 T M Davis

02/20/08 M L Farley

.70

RIRTH LU

Prepared for and participated in conference
call with experts and counsel to discuss issues
related to Band 3 sites (1.5); discussed
hearing issues with state government and other
parties to settlement agreement (2.0};
negotiated deposition dates and hearing dates
with counsel for Parent company (0.7); drafted
summary memoranda (1.4); drafted correspondence
(0.6); prepared for settlement hearing (3.3).

Review materials, conference call regarding
Houston (1.8); meet with M. Gregory and A.
MacIver regarding Hylebos PRP motions (.3);
review and respond to emails regarding 9019
process (.4); telephone conference with A.

" Hooks regarding E. Helena initiative (.3); read

and respond to emails regarding settlement
drafts {.7); review UBMC settlement and related
issues (1.3).

Prepare for and participate in diligence call
related to East Helena investigation (0.7).

02/20/08 B J Faulkner

02/20/08 J G Fosterx

02/20/08 A N Garrison

.20

corresponding repair obligations (2.6).

ZiuL 3 .

Prepare for.and participate in conference call
with representatives of ASARCO LLC, Baker Botts
LLC, and SNC-Lavalin Fenco to discuss
inspection of El Paso Acid Plants (1.4});
prepare for and participate in El Paso permit
team conference call (1.1); conduct legal
research on issues related to Texas Commission
on Environmental Quality air permit renewal and

Conferred with forensic consultant regarding
status of image copies to be delivered (.20]).

Research federal rules regarding expert witness
depositions.
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02/20/08 P M Giblin 5.50 Prepare for and participate in conference call
with T. Aldrich, B. Litle and ASARCO
consultants to discuss status of review of
condition of acid plant; work on analysis of
regulatory implications of consultant
conclusions.

02/20/08 M M Gregory 3.20 Review emails from T. Davis and A. MacIver
regarding Hylebos motion (.1); exchange emails
with M. Moedritzer regarding Taylor Springs
stipulation (.1); exchange emails with K.
Collins regarding Everett settlement agreement
(.2); email to T. Davis regarding same (.1);
review email from M. Heister regarding Barker
settlement (.1); telephone conference with T.
Davis regarding Hylebos motion (.1); telephone
conference with A. MacIver regarding same (.1);
email to J. McCarroll, H. Trice, .C. Sugg, S.
Felsenthal, D. Klingler and T. Davis regarding
PRP motion (.1); exchange emails with C. Sugg
regarding same (.1); exchange emails with T.
Davis regarding same (.1); exchange emails with
H. Trice regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with J. Prince regarding amendment
of proof of claim {.1); prepare proposed order
for Hylebos motion (.3); exchange emails with
A. MaclIver regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with R. Fontenla and email Hylebos
motion to her for filing and service (.1);
prepare notice of hearing regarding same (.3);
review email from B. Seitz regarding CBA Box
settlement (.1); telephone conference with B.
Litle regarding EPA form (.1); locate
information for him regarding same (.2); email
to D. Jauchen regarding same (.1); telephone
conference with D. Prince regarding cleanup

“motion (.4); exChange emails with D. Prince and
A. Maclver regarding same (.2).

02/20/08 M B Heister ' . 6.50 Address logistics of Barker 9019 hearing (.2);
o o review key documents and filings and analyze

strategy to identify key issues requiring
"factual support and then draft proffer of J.
Pfahl in support of ASARCO's settlement with
Doe Run and circulate for comment (4.9); call
with C. Pfahl regarding Barker hearing (.2);
review and assemble Barker settlement agreement
with MDEQ/EPA and prepare for filing along with
accompanying 9019 motion (.8); review



Case 05-21207 . Document 7420-13  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008

BAKER BOTTS vi.s.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession

Page 5§

Page 22 of 52

02/20/08

02/20/08

02/20/08

02/20/08

02/20/08

02/20/08

A M Hooks

R B Hudson

T C Jackson

J S Janoce

I Kundawala

A L Maclver

correspondence from ASARCO Inc. regarding
Barker hearing discovery schedule (.2); call
with T. Creekmore regarding 9019 strategy (.2).

Reviewed and analyzed TRC proposal and Shaw
proposal; telephone consultation with V.
Fairchild, T. Fischexr, T. Aldrich, and M.
Farley regarding backgournd information;
telephone consultation with T. Aldrich;
attention to issues regarding draft agreement.

- Work on statements to government chart (7.1).

Work on issues related to Iron Mountain and
Upper Blackfoot settlement agreements.

Worked on Houston site liability transfer
arrangements (.4); worked on East Helena site
analysis for discussions with DOJ (.6); worked
on Selby response strategy (2.3); worked on
Hylebos disallowance strategy (.3); worked on
Everett settlement issues (.2); worked on
Barker Hughesville 9019 response (1.5).

Work on motion to approve Mission Mine
settlement, including review and consideration
of relevant documents and research (6.4);
review draft of settlement agreement forwarded
by B. Cock ({.7).

Revising dispositive motion and exhibit list
(1.3); correspondence regarding privilege issue
(.6).

02/20/08

02/20/08

02/20/08

DR McDohaid

1.70

M P McGovern y

S A McKithan

;Prepare for and part1c1pate in conference call

w1th consultant regardlng interim report

"‘;regardlng El Paso smelter (1.0); evaluate

mlatory consequences of same (.7).

Telephone conference with LECG regarding review
of expert reports and preparatlons for 9019
dlscovery and hearing for Selby site (0.7);

',}re iew certaln older and related emails and
freports related to same. (0 8).

Work on preparations for upcoming 2019
hearings.
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02/21/08 M L Farley

conference call with State regarding UBMC and
telephone conference with T. Jackson (1.2);
telephone conference with M. Gregory regarding
PRP motion (.2); review Iron Mountain materials
(.4); review CDA revised settlement agreement
(.3);f telephone conference with T. Aldrich and
voicemail message from P. Giblin regarding El
call with T. Creekmore et al.

drding Barker (.6); study UBMC issues (.6);
study Custodial Trust administrative estimates
(.8); read emails and telephone conference with
T. Aldrich regarding Houston site (.5}.

Attended to emails regarding strategy for East
Helena investigation (0.4); worked on issues

-related to work plan for reviewing electronic
__records in response to subpoena (.6).

-

02/21/08 B J Faulkner

02/21/08 P M Giblin

Draft and revise memorandum from Baker Botts
LLP to the ASARCO board of directors
summarizing the status of El Paso air permit

 renewa1 proceeding and ASARCO's corresponding

obligations (6.1); conduct legal research on
issues related to permit renewal obligations
(1.4).

Continue work on regulatory and strategic

analysis for future of El1 Paso smelter;

telephone -conferences with team members.
BN PRI PR

02/21/08 M M Gregory

Office conference with T. Davis regarding
environmental settlements and cleanup motion
(.2); telephone conference with A. MacIver
regarding same (.1}; exchange emails with D.
Prince regarding same (.1); office conferences

'w1th T. Davis regarding EPA form (.2);
»telephone conference with B. Litle and review
'bemall from him regarding same (.2); exchange

- emails with A. MacIver regardlng Hylebos motion
-(.1) ;: exchange emails with R. Fontenla

regarding same: (.1); review scheduling order
and email from L. Garza (.1); email order to R.

'Fontenla for ‘service {.1); review from H. Trice

with comments on PRP motion (.1); revise CMO
(.5); review emails from T. Davis and M.
Paulsen regarding El Paso paving claim (.1);
review email from B. Seitz regarding SEMO (.1);
office conference with T. Davis regarding PRP
motion (.1); email same to A. Tenenbaum, T.
Davis, S. Janoe and M. McGovern (.1); review
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02/21/08 I Kundawala 7.70 Continue to work on motion to approve Mission
Mine settlement, including review of relevant
documents and caselaw authority (2.9); work on
drafting motion to approve settlement with St.
Paul sureties (3.1); review e-mail and
attachment from T. Dodson (.3}); phone
.conferences and e-mail correspondence with T.
Dodson regarding same (.3); e-mail
correspondence with C. Haynes regarding same
(.1); phone and e-mail correspondence with T.
Jacks (.2); phdne conference with T. Jacks and
N. Schwartz (.3); follow up with C. Haynes
(.1); e-mail correspondence with claimants®
counsel and committees' counsel regarding
scheduling of minor prove up hearing and follow
up regarding same (.4).

02/21/08 K K Linville 2.60 Draft letter summarizing electronic discovery
. plan (1.80); review and comment on draft
chronology of events related to East Helena
(0.80).

02/21/08 A L MacIver + .30 Reviewing J. Atwood's comments to Nueces Bay
Settlement Agreement (.1); correspondence
regarding the same (.1); correspondence
regarding the BsL Settlement Agreement (.1).

02/21/08 D R McDonald 1.90 Identify strxategy for addressing
: confidentiality of El Paso evaluation,
including review of contracts pertaining to

) same (1.1); review proposal form of TCEQ Order
__issuing permit (.8).

02/21/08 M P McGovern 4.90 Review discovery-related correspondence for
9019 hearing for Selby site (0.5); telephone
conference with DOJ .and EPA representatives
regarding unresolved issues for settlement
agreement. for East Helena site (0.9); conduct
review.gf:proffgrs, EPA proposed plan and
hearipg,transgrip;'ﬁor'certain statements
-bearing on righgeof—waylgreas and treatment

under Proposed.?lap and draft summary (3.4).

02/21/08 S A McKithan 2.10 Work‘on'prepérations'fof upcoming 9019
hearings. .
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SRR NI

02/22/08 T A Castaneda Jr. 2.00 Preparation and participation in strategic
' discussion concerning CNN stoxy with P. Giblin
and B. Faulkner, including review and
forwarding of transcript; briefed Senator
‘Seligexr's Office and TCEQ Commission staff.

02/22/08 X D Collins 2.10 Corrected hearing dates and times for upcoming
hearings with local counsel and the court
(0.3); discussed scope of deposition,
documents, and other issues with counsel fox
the state (0.5): reviewed documents related to
Piros deposition (1.2); reviewed correspondence
from Parent related to document requests (0.1).

02/22/08 T M Davis 2.10 Review letter and waterials regarding Hayden
(.3); telephone conference with M. Gregoxy and
D. Prince regarding PRP exhibit (.4); telephone
conference with P. Giblin regarding El Paso
matters (.3); discuss UBMC changes with T.
Jackson (.3); review E. Helena

- materials (.4); telephone conference

with J. Gross regarding BNL status (.4).

02/22/08 B J Faulkner BT T R L T e —————

02/22/08 P M Giblin 1.10 Evaluate possible impact of pursuit of petition
to revoke smelter permit; conference with C.
Pope regarding status of El Paso opposition
moves.

02/22/08 M M Gregory - 3.20 Review email from T. Davis regaxrding Barker
settlement agreement (.1); exchange emails with
M. Heister regarding same (.2); review emails
from T. Davis and K. Collins regarding order

. resetting Barker/Doe Run 9019 motion (.1);
review emails from T. Davis and S. McMillen
regardlng EPA form (.2); finalize Barkex
settlement agreement (.2); telephone
conferences and exchange emails with S. Smith
fr arding same (.2); exchange emails with and
telephone conferences with T. Davis and K.
Collins regarding same (.3); email Everett 9019

. motion to T. Davis, S. Janoe, K. Collins and D.

’Pr1nce (- 1), exchange emails with D. Prince
regarding same (.1); email Everett 9019 motion
to D. M;lls,»R. Smith and T. Davis (.1); review
notice of filing Barker 9019 wotion and notice
of corrected hearing regarding same {(.2); email
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02/22/08 A L MacIver 1.40 Correspondence regarding the B&L Settlement
Agreement (.1); correspondence to J. Atwood
regarding the Nueces Bay Settlement Agreement
(.1); reviewed the Encycle Trustee's revision
to the Nueces Bay Settlement Agreement (1.2).

02/22/08 M P McGovern .80 Draft email to A. Tenenbaum of DOJ regarding
statements from Proposed Plan, proffers and
hearing transcript regarding right of way areas
at East Helena (0.5); draft email to T. Davis
regarding same (0.3).

02/22/08 S McMillen 1.70 Complete cover lettexr for submittal of
EnexrgySolutions Federated Metals site soils
evaluation to the Texas Commission on
Environmental Quality (0.4); teleconferences
with B. Litle and T. Davis regarding strategy
for upcoming meeting with EnergySolutions in
Phoenix (1.0); attempt to contact City Engineer
with the City of Hammond to discuss access
agreement for offsite sampling near former
Federated Metals facility in Hammond, Indiana

(0.3).
02/22/08 K M Mead " .50 Review CNN transcript and e-mails with client
on same. ’
02/22/08 M G Paulson 5.10 Communications with client regarding Arizona

NRD settlement agreement (0.20); continue to
negotiate terms of same (1.50); attention to
Colorado sites (0.50); communication with New
Mexico AG regarding settlement agreement
(0.20); continue to negotiate terms of same
(1.00); attention to Nueces Bay settlement
agreement (0.30); continue to negotiate El Paso
settlement agreement (0.40); communication with
Idaho AG regarding Triumph mine site (0.30);
evaluate land transfer request associated with
same (0.70). :

02/22/08 D L Prince 3.80 Continue drafting POC reconciliation charts
(2.4); participate in conference call with M.
Gregory, T. Davis, and M. Gregory to discuss
POC charts (.5); revise PRP motion exhibits
(.4); update settlement status chart and
forward to J. Lapinsky (.5).
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02/22/08

J L Ross

Conference call with the non-ASARCO parties
regarding remaining issues in settlement
agreement (1.4); conference with clients
regarding Mission (.4); review and revise
Mission settlement agreement (.4); participate
in meeting with the non-ASARCO parties
regarding the settlement agreement (1.5);
conference with D. McAllister and R. Kern
regarding open issues (.6); revise settlement
motion regarding San Xavier claims (.3);
prepare email to A. Rosenblatt and C. Rivera
regarding agreement on Mission (.4}; email to
D. Baker regarding Mission agreement (.5).

02/22/08 K E Wilkirson 1.00 Review minor child Affidavits from Ledford.

02/23/08 M L Farley .90 Finish work on issues related to work plan for
reviewing electronic records in response to
subpoena (.3); review and revise letter to AUSA
regarding same (0.4); draft emails regarding
same and cost estimate (0.2).

02/23/08 P M Giblin .30 Reviéw information regarding City of El Paso
issues. :

02/24/08 K K Linville 1.00 Review client documents related to
environmental issues at East Helena.

02/24/08 J L Ross 1.90 Review and revise Mission Mine settlement
agreement .

02/25/08 O J Alaniz .30 Conference with M. Heister regarding
Barker-Hughesville site tour.

02/25/08 K D Collins 7.30 Discussed settlement and status of 9019 motion

with opposing counsel for Band 2 site (0.2);
reviewed objections to settlement agreement
(0.5); reviéwed Piros deposition transcript
(1.2); worked with local counsel to schedule
9019 hearings (0.2); developed chart to track
depositions and hearings (1.5); reviewed
documents related to Selby hearing (3.2);
discussed site issues with testifying expert
(0.2); discussed discovery and deposition
schedule with opposing counsel (0.3).
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02/25/08 T M Davis 6.00

02/25/08 B J Faulkner 1.50

Conference with B. Litle regarding Houston
(.2); meeting with T. Aldrich and D. McAllister
regarding Hayden (1.3); meet with Energy
Solutions, et al. (4.5).

Revised draft letter to SNC Lavalin Fenco and
forwarded to B. Litle of ASARCO.

02/25/08 P M Giblin .90

Continue work on recommendations to Board
regarding El1 Paso actions.

02/25/08 M M Gregory 1.50

02/25/08 J T Gross 2.80

02/25/08 C J Haynes 2.00

02/25/08 M B Heister 1.90

Exchange emails with S. Smith regarding
environmental settlement agreements (.1);
exchange emails with H. Trice regarding J.
McCarroll's comments on the PRP motion {(.1);
forward same to T. Davis (.1); telephone call
with S. Rediger regarding Hylebos objection
(.1); email regarding same to T. Davis and A.
MacIver {.1); review email from K. Collins
regarding BNSF/Everett and Tacoma settlement
(.1); review settlement agreement and 9019
motion regarding same (.3); exchange emails
with K. Collins regarding same (.1); review
email from T. Davis regarding PRP motion (.1);
email PRP motion to T. Aldrich (.1); review
notice of filing 9019 motion regarding
BNSF/Everett and Tacoma (.1); email same to T.
Davis, 8. Jance, K. Collins and D. Prince (.1);
email to D. Mills, R. Smith and T. Davis (.1).

Organize and index expert reports of various
parties for the East Helena site (0.5); gather
and index Selby expert reports for upcoming
hearing (0.5); update case files and indices
(0.3); work on developlng Selby trial notebook
{1.5). '

Attendlng weekly telephone status conference
(.5); e-mail correspondence regarding
settlement issues (. 3); rev1ew1ng status of
pendlng tOXlC tort clalms in light of
settlement (.5); preparlng for and conducting
conference with I. Kundawala regarding
resolv1ng remalnlng toxic tort claims (.7).

Draft correspondence to the Parent regarding
Barker hearing procedure (.5); draft
correspondence to the Barker claimants
detailing a strategy for preparing for the 9019
hearings on the Barker settlements (.3);
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02/25/08 S A McKithan

02/25/08 S McMillen

.40

T

Revise letter to confirm privileged and
confidential scope of Fenco evaluation of El
Paso site (.8); telephone conference with Fenco
in-house counsel regarding same.

.

Work on preparations for upcoming 9019 hearings
(1.6); contact S. Tagen of Pace Documents
regarding availability for hearings (0.2};
telephone calls with C. Boswell of the Omni
Hotel to reserve room blocks for the hearings
{(0.4); organized East Helena privileged
documents and updated case files (0.7); began
preparing trial notebook for the Selby hearing
(0.8).

Prepare for meeting with EnergySolutions in
Phoenix at ASARCO offices {(1.0); meet with T.
Davis, T. Aldrich, B. Litle, D. Hearnsberger,
D. Robbins, and R. Jacobi regarding Federated
Metals site and the merits of EnergySclutions
evaluation and offer for assuming remedial
obligations related to soil cleanup (2.0); meet
with EnergySolutions regarding same (2.5}.

o I
@25/08 K M Mead

.30

Case status review regaxding Congressman Reyégfuw:)

02/25/08 M G Paulson

02/25/08 D L Prince

02/25/08 J L Ross

5.30

Communications with D. Robbins regarding
Manchester site (0.20); telephone conference
with V. Wildman regarding same {0.10);
attention to Nueces Bay and Encycle settlements
(1.00); attention to Strider comstruction claim
(0.20); evaluate options for Globe site
settlement (0.50); review draft global
settlement agreement (0.50); evaluate options
regarding Triumph mine site (0.40); continue to
negotiate settlement of El Paso contract claim
(0.40); continue to draft Arizona and New
Mexico settlement agreeménts (2.00).

‘Prepare for and participate in conference call
to discuss document management issues (1.5);

correspond with M. Paulson regarding PRP claim
(.1).

Prepare email to G. Tsiolis regarding Mission
agreement {.3); conference with B. Cook
regarding proposed changes to agreement (.3);
prepare email to G. Tsiolis regarding changes
to Mission agreement {.2); revise Mission Mine
settlement agreement (.6); review D. Baker
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comments to the Mission settlement agreement
{.2); conference with G. Tsiolis regarding
success standards in the MARP (.2); prepare
email to client regarding St. Paul changes to
release language (.4); conference with D.
McAllister and H. Richins regarding call with
non-ASARCO parties related to Mission Mine
agreement (.2); conference call with the
non-ASARCO parties regarding changes to Mission
settlement agreement (1.9); conference call
with non-ASARCO parties regarding settlement
agreement (.7); revise Mission settlement
agreement (1.8); call to Chadbourne regarding
settlement agreement on Mission (.5); revise
motion to approve settlement agreement/Mission
to reflect discussion with St. Paul (.6).

02/25/08 J B Seitz 2.00 Telephone conferences regarding SEMO settlement
matters (0.7); work on additional CDA Box
property matters (0.8); review and prepare
emails regarding Hecla claims (0.S5).

02/25/08 K E Wilkirson 2.50 Review minor child affidavits in preparation
for filing.

02/26/08 S M Burgin 1.20 Briefly reviewed correspondence with Colorado
School of Mines; prepared draft of letter to
CSM attorney; distributed same for comment.

02/26/08 K D Collins 5.50 Reviewed expert reports and other documents
related to 9019 hearing.

02/26/08 T M Davis .30 Telephone conferences with A. Tenenbaum and S.
Janoe regarding PRP issues.

02/26/08 B J Faulkner 6.50 Conduct legal research on issues related to
TCEQ permlt renewal (3.9); prepare for and
part1c1pate in conference call with J.
"Lapinsky, T. aldrich, and B. Litle of ASARCO
along with P. Giblin and D.. McDonald of Baker
. Botts (2.6). -

02/26/08 R M Fontenla P70 Conferences and emails with I. Kundawala and L.
Garza regarding proposed order, file same via
Electronlc Case Filing System with the Southern
District of Texas Bankruptcy Court (0.7).
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02/26/08 J G Foster

.20

Attention to drive copies received from
consultant and emailed K. Linville regarding
same (.20).

02/26/08

Giblin

5.20

02/26/08

02/26/08

02/26/08

02/26/08

02/26/08

02/26/08

02/26/08

Gregory

Gross

Haynes

Heister

Hooks

Hudson

Janoe

. Continue work on analysis of Bl Paso issues and
work on recommendations to Board; prepare for
and participate in conference call with J.
Lapinsky, T. Aldrich and B. Litle to discuss
same; work on action items.

.10

4.50

.60

+ 1.70

1.80

.- 2.50

6.00"

St
Office conference with T. Davis regarding PRP
motion.

Prepare trial notebooks for Selby, Everett, and
Barkexr-Hughesville 9019 liearings (2.0); create
draft exhibit lists for Selby, Everett, and
Barker-Hughesville (1.5); gather and oxganize
expert reports for various sites to prepare for
hearings (1.0).

E-mail correspondence regarding minoxr prove up
" hearing (.5); reviewing order on same (.1).

Address Barker hearing scheduling issues (.6);
analyze likely deposition targets for Barker
settlements and circulate comments (.4);
prepare for and participate in call with parent
to negotiate pre-hearing schedules for Barker
hearing (.7).

Reviewed proposa NN xegarding
*; reviewed

status of title commitments on owned,
non-cperating sites; attention to information
needed to establish custodial trusts.

Work on "statements to the government® chart
(2.5).

Worked on preparatlon of board materials (.6);

" worked w1th Hayden site team regardlng response
to ADEQ 1nqu1rzes and path forward for AOC
& BY- 5 e prepared for -and: part1c1pated in
teleconference with counsel for ASARCO
Aincorporated regarding site objections and
. discovery (1.5); worked on Utah site analysis
A 3); worked on, Selby site .xesponse issues with
T. Dav1s and K. Collins (1. .2} ;. drafted talking
p01nts memorandum for dlscusslons with DOJ on
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Hayden listing (1.0).

02/26/08 I Kundawala 5.00 Review and consider J. Ross' comments to second
draft of motion and revise motion accordingly
(.5); draft order scheduling hearing for minor
prove-up hearing (.2); and confer with C.
Haynes regarding procedure (.1); conceptualize
and draft proposed order approving settlement
on behalf of winor claimants (.3); review
e-mails from J. Ross and e-mail an attachment
from J. Jantzen regarding Nation's approval of
Mission Mine Settlement (.2); review and
consider e-mail and attachment from K. Ledford
regarding state court lawsuit (.1); work with
K. Wilkirson on exhibits for minor prove up
hearing (.4); work on matters related to minor
prove up hearing (2.1}); attend and participate
in conferences with J. Ross regarding Mission
Mine and follow up regarding same (.5); phone
conference with J. Ross and D. McAllister (.2);
review and consider St. Paul draft agreement
(.4).

02/26/08 K K Linville .50 Begin reviewing electronic files provided by
ASARCO's prior counsel.

02/26/08 A L Maclver 1.80 Reviewing proposed settlement agreement for

several sites (1.2); correspondence regarding
<j§;j;6/08 D R McDonald

the same (.3); revised the Encycle Settlement
Agreement with J. Atwood and M. Schmidt's
comments {.3).
b T T - N
02/26/08 M P McGovern 1.60 Telephoneé call with A. Tenenbaum of DOJ
regarding settlement issues for the East Helena
site (0.4); work on Selby site 9019 hearing
discévery planning issues (1.2).

2.70 Prepared for and participated in conference
call with J. Lapinsky regarding El Paso

smelter; evaluated issues raised by same.

oot L R S v

02/26/08 S A McKithan 4.70 Work on preparations for Selby, Barker
: Hughesville and Everett 9019 hearings.

02/26/08 S McMillen 3.70 prafted memorandum for the Board of Directors
discussing options to address environmental
liabilities at the Federated Metals and Lone
Star Lead properties in Houston, Texas (2.0);
address several matters related to the
Federated Metals site, including upcoming



Case 05-21207 Document 7420-13  Filed in TXSB on 04/15/2008  Page 39 of 52

BAKER BOTTS vue.

ASARCO LLC, Debtor-in-Possession Page 72

02/27/08 K D Collins 2.50 Discussed discovery issues with ASARCO Inc.
(1.0); handled logistical issues related to
9019 hearings (1.5}.

02/27/08 T M Davis 6.20 Review PRP lists and proofs of claim (.7);
think about Hayden issues (.9); call with T.
Aldrich et al. to discuss Hayden (.7);
conference call with C. Haynes and §. Jordan to
talk about toxic tort hearing (.4), read
document drafts regarding Hayden (.3);
telephone conference with M. Gregory regarding
PRPs and plan drafts (.3); telephone conference
with A. Tenenbaum regarding PRP motion (.2};
conference call with T. Aldrich angd D.
McAllister regarding Hayden (.4){ listen in to
court's ruling on El1 Paso Motion for Relief
from Stay (.7? review UBMC language (.4);
conference ca®l with J. Lapinsky to discuss
Hayden and Houston (.4); read and respond to
emails from K. Collins regarding 9019 process
(.8).

02/27/08 B J Faulkner 2.10 Prepare for and participate in Bankruptcy Court
hearing via teleconference (1.9); circulate
hearing ruling to El Paso permit team (0.2).

02/27/08 R M Fontenla .50 Conference and emails with B. Faulkner
regarding transcript, place call to Judge
Schmidt's clerk regarding same (0.5).

02/27/08 P M Giblin 3.10 Analyze impact of court ruling on City of El
Paso's petition to revoke permit; work on

response; continue preparation for
—“m”\ghk recommendations to Board.

02/27/08 M M Gregory 2.10 Review emails with B. Seitz and K. Collins
regarding SEMO (.2); revise SEMO 9019 motion
and ‘collect signatures for settlement agreement
(.3); office conference with T. Davis regarding
same’ (.1yif attention to phone mail from B.
Faulkner regarding City of El1 Paso motion for
relief from stay and exchange emails with him
"(.1);Yattention to phone mail from J. McCarroll
regarfling PRP motion (.1); office conference
with T. Davis regarding same {.1); telephone
call with T. Davis and A. Tenenbaum regarding
environmental settlements and PRP motion (.2);
revise PRP CMO and prepare blackline of same
(.3); email same to J. McCarroll; H. Trice, S.
Felsenthal, D. Klingler, C. Sugg and T. Davis
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02/28/08 I G Foster

.60

Reviewed copy images of forensic images of
computer hard drives and emailed
consultant regarding same {.40); reviewed K.
Linville email regarding e-discovery plan
(.20).

02/28/08 Giblin

Work with team members on issues related to
implementation of TCEQ's order on El Pasc
smelter.

02/28/08 M M Gregory

02/28/08 X B Griffin
02/28/08 J T Gxoss

02/28/08 C J Haynes

02/28/08 M B Heisterxr

02/28/08 A M Hooks

02/28/08 R B Hudson

02/28/08 T C Jackson

.10

2.50

.50

3.40

.70

2.10

Exchange emails with T. Davis regarding 9019
motions.

Review OSHA issues and respond.
Update case files and indices.

Conference with T. Aldrich regarding OSHA
issues (.2); reviewing requests and materials
and e-mail corxrespondence regarding same {1.1);
conference with opposing counsel regarding
Monday hearing (.5); conference with R. Orin
regarding Firemans' Fund issue (.2);

‘conferences with I. Kundawala regaxrding same

{.3); conferences with B. Horkovich regarding i
Fireman's..Fund (.5); conference with R. Orin i
regarding same (.1); conference with K. Griffin i
regarding same (.2); drafting board update for :
toxic tort (.3). ;

aAddress Barkexr 9019 hearing scheduling and
discovery issues (.3); draft proffer for C.
Pfahl for use during Barker 9019 hearing (.4).

Continued reviewed and assessment of TRC
proposal and contract mark-up; telephone

- consultation.:with T. Aldrich regarding same;
. communications with T. Fisher regarding same;

reviewed information regarding valuation of
Triumph mine.

e k on "§;ateﬁéhts to the government® chaxt

Ty

‘Prepare for: and: participate in conference call

with counsel for other parties to discuss Uppexr

Blackfoot settlement agreement (1.5); review

right to, challenge remedial decision under é
Montana law (0.5); follow-up telephone :
conferences with T. Davis and C. Pfahl (0.5};
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02/28/08 A L MaclIver .10 Reviewing correspondence regarding the Encycle
Settlement Agreement.

" 02/28/08 D R McDonald .20 Attention to delivery of report regarding El )

Paso smelter.
RO s

02/28/08 S A McKithan 1.20 Process consultant invoice for payment (0.2);
work on preparations for Selby 9019 hearing
(1.0).

02/28/08 S McMillen 3.10 Continue to review and analyze data presented

by EnergySolutions regarding soil contamination
at the Federated Metals site in Houston, Texas
(1.0); develop strategy for terms and
conditions for possible agreement with
EnergySolutions to assume all obligations with
respect to remediating soil at the Federated
Metals site in Houston, Texas (1.4); telephone
conference with A. Arendt of the City of
Hammond, Indiana regarding the terms of an
access agreement to drill monitoring wells on
Ccity property and prepared email with proposed
language for the access agreement (0.7).

02/28/08 M G Paulson 5.10 Continue to draft letter to counsel for
Colorado School of Mines regarding claim
(0.30); telephone conference with same
regarding negotiation of settlement and request
for written offer (0.30); communication with
Idaho AG regarding Triumph mine site (0.20);
evaluate settlement potential of same (0.30};
summarize status of New Mexico settlement
negotiations (0.40); continue to evaluate BNSF
claims (0.50); attention to City of East Helena
.claims (0.20) ;scontinue to summarize status of
El: Paso PRP claims (0.20@; attention to Murray
City claims (0.20); continue evaluate remaining
PRP claims across all sites (2.50).

02/28/08 D L Prince S .80 Review Columbus offsite remediation estimate
(.3); correspond with R. Kern regarding review
of Columbus onsite agreements (.1); review
correspondence received from M. Cooper
‘regarding Columbus onsite issues (.3); email s.
Janoe regarding same (.1).
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02/29/08 P M Giblin 2.00 Work with team members on response to city of

El Paso's proposed orxder on 1ifting of stay by
bankruptcy court; work on TCEQ implementation
issues.

02/29/08 M M Gregory .40 Review U.S. notice of no public comments
regaxding Azurite and Golinsky (.1); review
email from T. Davis regarding same {.1); email
notice to T. Aldrich, S. Janoe, M. McGovern and
M. Heister (.1); telephone call with B.

Meginnes regarding Taylor Springs stipulation
{.1).

02/29/08 J T Gross 3.30 Gather and oxganize Hayden NPL correspondence
and other site documents (2.3); update case
files and indices (1.0).

02/29/08 C J Haynes 40 E-mail correspondence regarding settlement
agreement (.4).

02/29/08 M B Heister .50 Draft proffer of testimony for Cc. pfahl to
support Barker 9019 hearing.

02/29/08 A M Hooks 3.60 continued review of TRC mark-up of draft
environmental liability transfer agreement and
participated in conference call with T. Fisher,
V. Fairchild, D. Robbins and J. Gracie
regarding same: reviewed additional suggested
language from TRC; reviewed

; communications

with Qi ) ) R rcoaxding

02/29/08 T ¢ Jackson .80 Prepare for and participate in conference call
with counsel for governments to discuss Iron
Mountain settlement agreement .

02/29/08 J S Janoce 3.90 Prepared for meetings regarding Hayden smelter
site (2.7); worked on response to questions
regaxrding Utah sites from DOJ (.2); worked on
Selby slte defense issues (1.0).

02/29/08 I Kundawala 4.20 Review and analyze agreement with sureties
: (1.1); multiple phone:conferences with C.
Rivera regarding agreement. (. 3); confer with J.
Ross regardlng agreement (.2); review and
consider comments from Firemans' Fund and
revise draft of order accordingly (.1};



